TMA and TrMA
3-140422BR

3rd RENEWAL
5/1/2017 - 4/28/2018

ITEM#1 -

New Truck Mounted Attenuator (TMA) meeting the attached MoDOT Specification 350TMAO01A .

Vendor Name:

Roadway Safety Technologies, Inc.

TrafFix Devices, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

Manufacturer :

TrafFix Devices, Inc.

Trinity Highway Products

Energy Absorption Systems, Inc.

Energy Absorption Systems, Inc.

Model Number:

Scorpion 10005-TL3-12M1

MPS-350X

SS90 HD

Safety-Stop 180 Model 9182

Weight: 2,200 Ibs 1,876 Ibs. 3,464 Ibs. 2,704 Ibs.

Amount, qty 1-3: No Bid $15,126.00 $14,950.00 $16,995.00 $20,995.00
Amount, qty 4-6: S $14,857.00 $14,950.00 $16,895.00 $20,895.00
Amount, qty 6+: S $14,789.00 $14,950.00 $16,795.00 $20,495.00
Option A (Hydraulic Power

System): S 0 N/A Deduct $250.00 Deduct $250.00
Option B )On-Site Installation gty

1-3): S $585.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
Option C (On-Site Installation gty

4-6): S $530.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
Option D (On-Site Installation qty

6+): S $480.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
Option E (misc.): S See attachments - user price lists N/A N/A N/A

Delivery Time:

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

MSRP discount:

5%

0%

0%

0%




TMA and TrMA
3-140422BR

3rd RENEWAL
5/1/2017 - 4/28/2018

ITEM #

2-

New Combination Truck Mounted Attenuator (TMA) with Flashing Arrow Panel (FAP) with Wired Controller / LED meeting the attached MoDOT Specifications 350TMA01A

and MGS-06-08A

Vendor Name:

Roadway Safety Technologies, Inc.

TrafFix Devices, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

Manufacturer :

TrafFix Devices, Inc./Trafcon Arrow B

Trinity Highway Products

Energy Absorption Systems,

Inc.

Energy Absorption Systems, Inc.

Model Number: Scorpion 10005-TL3-12M2 MPS-350X SS90 HD Safety-Stop 180 Model 9182

Weight: 3,196 Ibs 2,390 Ibs. 3,978 Ibs. 3,218 Ibs.

Amount, gty 1-3: No Bid $22,005.00 $22,595.00 $23,595.00 $25,995.00
Amount, gty 4-6: $ $21,735.00 $22,595.00 $23,495.00 $25,895.00
Amount, gty 6+: S $21,667.00 $22,595.00 $23,395.00 $25,795.00
Option A (Hydraulic Power

System): S 0 N/A Deduct $250.00 Deduct $250.00
Option B )On-Site Installation gty

1-3): S $685.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
Option C (On-Site Installation gty

4-6): S $630.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
Option D (On-Site Installation qty

6+): S $580.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
Option E (misc.): S See attachments - user price lists N/A N/A N/A

Delivery Time:

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

MSRP discount:

5%

0%

0%

0%




TMA and TrMA
3-140422BR

3rd RENEWAL
5/1/2017 - 4/28/2018

ITEM # 3 -

New Combination Truck Mounted Attenuator (TMA) with Flashing Arrow Panel (FAP) with Wireless Controller / LED meeting the attached MoDOT Specifications

350TMA01A and MGS-06-08A

Vendor Name:

Roadway Safety Technologies, Inc.

TrafFix Devices, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

Manufacturer :

TrafFix Devices, Inc./Trafcon Arrow B

Trinity Highway Products

Energy Absorption Systems, Inc.

Energy Absorption Systems, Inc.

Model Number:

Scorpion 10005-TL3-12M3

MPS-350X

SS90 HD

Safety-Stop 180 Model 9182

Weight: 3,196 Ibs 2,381 Ibs. 3,969 Ibs. 3,209 Ibs.

Amount, gty 1-3: No Bid $22,439.00 $21,995.00 $23,995.00 $27,995.00
Amount, gty 4-6: $ $22,169.00 $21,995.00 $23,895.00 $27,895.00
Amount, qty 6+: S $22,101.00 $21,995.00 $23,795.00 $27,795.00
Option A (Hydraulic Power

System): S 0 N/A Deduct $250.00 Deduct $250.00
Option B )On-Site Installation gty

1-3): S $685.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
Option C (On-Site Installation gty

4-6): S $630.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
Option D (On-Site Installation qty

6+): S $580.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
Option E (misc.): S See attachments - user price lists N/A N/A N/A

Delivery Time:

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

MSRP discount:

5%

0%

0%

0%




TMA and TrMA
3-140422BR

3rd RENEWAL
5/1/2017 - 4/28/2018

ITEM #4 -

New Trailer Mounted Attenuator (TrMA) meeting the attached MoDOT Specification 350TMA01A

Vendor Name:

Roadway Safety Technologies, Inc.

TrafFix Devices, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

Manufacturer :

Gregory Industries, Inc.

TrafFix Devices, Inc.

Energy Absorption Systems, Inc.

Energy Absorption Systems, Inc.

Model Number: TTMA-100 Scorpion 10006-TL3-12M1 Vorteq SST TMA Model 9000

Weight: 1,450 lbs. (w/o optional equipment) |2,260 Ibs. 1,960 lbs. 2,800 lbs.

Amount, qty 1-3: $13,800.00 $14,970.00 $12,995.00 $23,995.00
Amount, gty 4-6: $13,400.00 $14,520.00 $12,995.00 $23,895.00
Amount, qty 6+: $12,800.00 $13,988.00 $12,995.00 $23,795.00
Option A (Hydraulic Power

System): N/A 0 N/A N/A
Option B )On-Site Installation gty

1-3): $350.00 $585.00 N/A N/A
Option C (On-Site Installation gty

4-6): $250.00 $530.00 N/A N/A
Option D (On-Site Installation qty

6+): $150.00 $480.00 N/A N/A
Option E (misc.): See attachments - user price lists Extension Hitch $450.00 N/A

Delivery Time:

60 days after receipt of order*

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

MSRP discount:

0%

5%

0%

0%




TMA and TrMA
3-140422BR

3rd RENEWAL
5/1/2017 - 4/28/2018

ITEM#5 -

New Combination Trailer Mounted Attenuator (TrMA) with Flashing Arrow Panel (FAP) with Wired Controller / LED meeting the
attached MoDOT Specifications 350TMA01A and MGS-06-06A

Vendor Name:

Roadway Safety Technologies, Inc.

TrafFix Devices, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

Manufacturer : TrafFix Devices, Inc./Trafcon Arrow Bc|Energy Absorption Systems, Inc. |Energy Absorption Systems, Inc.

Model Number: Scorpion 10006-TL3-12M2 Vorteq SST TMA Model 9000

Weight: 2,717 lbs. 2,180 lbs. 3,005 lbs.

Amount, qty 1-3: No Bid $19,548.00 $18,495.00 $28,995.00
Amount, qty 4-6: S $19,098.00 $18,395.00 $28,895.00
Amount, qty 6+: S $18,536.00 $18,295.00 $28,795.00
Option A (Hydraulic Power

System): S 0 N/A N/A
Option B )On-Site Installation gty

1-3): S $585.00 N/A N/A
Option C (On-Site Installation gty

4-6): S $530.00 N/A N/A
Option D (On-Site Installation qty

6+): S $480.00 N/A N/A
Option E (misc.): S See attachments - user price lists Extension Hitch $450.00 N/A

Delivery Time:

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

MSRP discount:

5%

0%

0%




TMA and TrMA
3-140422BR

3rd RENEWAL
5/1/2017 - 4/28/2018

ITEM#6 -

New Combination Trailer Mounted Attenuator (TrMA) with Flashing Arrow Panel (FAP) with Wireless Controller / LED meeting the

attached MoDOT Specifications 350TMA01A and MGS-06-06A

Vendor Name:

Roadway Safety Technologies, Inc.

TrafFix Devices, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

Manufacturer :

TrafFix Devices, Inc./Trafcon Arrow B

Energy Absorption Systems, Inc.

Energy Absorption Systems, Inc.

Model Number: Scorpion 10006-TL3-12M3 Vorteq SST TMA Model 9000

Weight: 2,717 Ibs. 2,165 Ibs. 3,005 Ibs.

Amount, qty 1-3: No Bid $19,450.00 $19,450.00 $29,995.00
Amount, gty 4-6: $ $19,350.00 $19,350.00 $29,895.00
Amount, qty 6+: S $18,997.00 $18,995.00 $29,795.00
Option A (Hydraulic Power

System): S 0 N/A N/A
Option B )On-Site Installation gty

1-3): S $585.00 N/A N/A
Option C (On-Site Installation gty

4-6): S $530.00 N/A N/A
Option D (On-Site Installation qty

6+): S $480.00 N/A N/A
Option E (misc.): S See attachments - user price lists Extension Hitch $450.00 N/A

Delivery Time:

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

30 days after receipt of order

MSRP discount:

5%

0%

0%

Vendor Name:

Roadway Safety Technologies, Inc.

TrafFix Devices, Inc.

The Hoosier Company, Inc.

Warranty:

One year warranty against defects in

material and workmanship

See attachment

See attached

Extended Warranty:

N/A

N/A

N/A

Renewal Period 1:

10% max increase and 10% max.

decrease

3% max increase and 0% max.
decrease

10% max increase and 20% max.
decrease

Renewal Period 2:

10% max increase and 10% max.

decrease

3% max increase and 0% max.
decrease

15% max increase and 20% max.
decrease

Renewal Period 3:

10% max increase and 10% max.

decrease

20% max increase and 0% max.
decrease

20% max increase and 20% max.
decrease

Cooperative Purchasing:

Yes

Yes

Yes

Roadway Safety Technologies
3937 Randall Drive

Jefferson City, MO 65109
roadwaysafety@aol.com
(573)301-0101

TrafFix Devices, Inc.

160 Avenida La Pata

San Clemento, CA 92673
dsheppard@traffixdevices.com
(949)361-5663

The Hoosier Company, Inc.
5421 W. 86th Street
Indianapolis, IN 46268

mjaegers@hoosierco.com
(317)876-6675



mailto:roadwaysafety@aol.com
mailto:dsheppard@traffixdevices.com
mailto:mjaegers@hoosierco.com

