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Greg Horn, District Engineer

Toll Free 1-888 ASK MoDOT

Thank you for your response to our Request for Bid: SL14-132-R7, Bulk Oil.

For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses which were received.
If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown above.
Buyer: Stephanie Austin Rashid, CPPB, General Services Specialist

BID

TABULATION

General Services

Results Posted: 11:30 am, 6/18/14

GROUP 1
TOTAL | UM Description WOLCO INC. UNIVERSAL WALLIS ASHLAND INC.
EST (including size and/or part #’s) LUBRICANTS, LLC LUBRICANT, LLC
TY
Q UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT
6069 GAL CJ4 OR CJ4 PLUS 15W-40 $6.70 $40,662.30 $7.00 $42,483.00 $7.54 $45,760.26 $7.14 $43,332.66
(55 GAL DRUMS)
1* GAL CJ4 OR CJ4 PLUS 15W-40 $6.45 $6.45 $6.80 $6.80 $7.35 $7.35 $7.14 $7.14
BULK pumped into tank
5409.50 | GAL UNIVERSAL HYDRAULIC $5.90 $31,916.05 $6.12 $33,106.14 $6.55 $35,432.23 $6.91 $37,379.65
TRANSMISSION OIL
165 GAL RE-REFINED MOTOR OIL $5.35 $882.75 $6.70 $1,105.50 $7.50 $1,237.50 $7.85 $1,295.25
10W30
100 GAL RE-REFINED MOTOR OIL $5.65 $565.00 $6.30 $630.00 $7.50 $750.00 $10.29 $1,029.00
5W20
400 QRT RE-REFINED MOTOR OIL $2.88 $1,152.00 $1.79 $716.00 $2.35 $940.00 No Bid No Bid
5W30
360 LB | MULTIPURPOSE LITHIUM COMPLEX $1.77 $637.20 $1.80 $648.00 $2.49 $896.40 $2.90 $1,044.00
GREASE NGLI GRADE 2
874 LB GEAR OIL 80W90 $0.96 $839.04 $1.28 $1,118.72 $1.16 $1,013.84 $3.55 $1,802.50
200 LB GEAR OIL 85W140 $0.96 $192.00 $1.28 $256.00 $1.21 $242.00 $3.55 $710.00
200 LB GEAR OIL 75W90 $3.46 $692.00 $3.18 $636.00 $2.70 $540.00 $3.55 $710.00
5= GAL GEAR OIL 75W90 $3.86 $19.30 $19.33 $96.63 $3.48 $17.40 No Bid No Bid
(5 GAL put up)
SUBTOTALS $77,564.09 $80,802.79 $86,836.98 $87,310.20




GROUP 1 (Con’t)

TOTAL | UM Description HARTOG OIL CO. SIEVEKING INC. SCHAEFFER
EST (including size and/or part #’s) MANUFACTURING
TY
Q UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT.
6069 GAL CJ4 OR CJ4 PLUS 15W-40 $7.46 $45,274.74 $8.21 $49,826.49 $16.13 | $97,892.97
(55 GAL DRUMS)
1* GAL CJ4 OR CJ4 PLUS 15W-40 $7.00 $7.00 $7.71 $7.71 $16.13 $16.13
BULK pumped into tank
5409.50 | GAL UNIVERSAL HYDRAULIC $6.87 $37,163.27 $6.95 $37,596.03 $15.57 | $84,225.92
TRANSMISSION OIL
165 GAL RE-REFINED MOTOR OIL $8.44 $1,392.60 $6.73 $1,110.45 $16.49 $2,720.85
10W30
100 GAL RE-REFINED MOTOR OIL $6.69 $669.00 $6.73 $673.00 $19.42 $1,942.00
5W20
400 QRT RE-REFINED MOTOR OIL $2.91 $1,164.00 $2.00 $800.00 $4.89 $1,956.00
5W30
360 LB | MULTIPURPOSE LITHIUM COMPLEX $2.43 $874.80 $3.75 $1,350.00 $3.13 $1,126.80
GREASE NGLI GRADE 2
874 LB GEAR OIL 80wW90 $1.51 $1,319.74 $1.08 $943.92 $3.15 $2,753.10
200 LB GEAR OIL 85W140 $1.58 $316.00 $1.13 $226.00 $3.46 $692.00
200 LB GEAR OIL 75W90 $3.26 $652.00 $2.89 $578.00 $3.51 $702.00
5* GAL GEAR OIL 75W90 $4.564 $22.82 $4.044 $20.22 $5.616 $28.08
(5 GAL put up)
SUBTOTALS $88,855.97 $93,131.82 $194,055.85
GROUP 2
TOTAL | U/M Description WOLCO INC. UNIVERSAL WALLIS HARTOG OIL CO.
EST (including size and/or part #’s) LUBRICANTS, LLC LUBRICANT, LLC
TY
Q UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT
1,500 | GAL | TRANSMISSION FLUID equivalent to $8.89 $13,335.00 $23.00 $34,500.00 $34.44 | $51,660.00 $22.77 $34,155.00
TRANSYND
(55 GAL DRUMS)
5= GAL | TRANSMISSION FLUID equivalent to $9.39 $46.95 $30.00 $150.00 $35.49 $177.45 $23.72 $118.60
TRANSYND
(5 GAL put up)
SUBTOTALS $13,381.95 $34,650.00 $51,837.45 $34,273.60
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GROUP 2 (Con’t)

TOTAL | UM Description HARTOG OIL CO. HARTOG OIL CO. SIEVEKING INC. SCHAEFFER
EST (including size and/or part #’s) MANUFACTURING
QTY UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT
1,500 | GAL | TRANSMISSION FLUID equivalent to $24.41 $36,615.00 $28.87 $43,305.00 $23.70 $35,550.00 $15.57 $23,355.00

TRANSYND
(55 GAL DRUMS)
5* GAL | TRANSMISSION FLUID equivalent to $26.55 $132.75 $31.47 $157.35 $26.17 $130.85 $16.74 $83.70
TRANSYND
(5 GAL put up)
SUBTOTALS $36,747.75 $43,462.35 $35,680.85 $23,438.70

*NOTE: For all oils with quantity of one and five, actual estimated quantities were included in above numbers for previous category. Quantities
added for illustrative purposes and also to show five gallon put up container costs.
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