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Greg Horn, District Engineer

Results Posted: 9:25 am, 5/23/14

Thank you for your response to our Request for Bid: SL14-125-R7, Aerial Truck Warning Lights.
For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses which were received. Multiple-Award

If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown above.

Buyer: Stephanie Austin Rashid, CPPB, General Services Specialist

One Unit Package

Quantity | U/M DESCRIPTION Responder PSE, LLC Ed Roehr Safety Products
(including, size, and/or part #'s)
UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT UNIT PRICE
PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
2 SET | Exterior Mount Overhead Light 438.87 877.74 440.57 881.14
2 SET | Exterior Mount Rear Bumper Light 127.95 255.90 132.14 264.28
2 SET | Exterior Mount Front Grill Light 77.32 154.64 70.79 141.58
4 SET | Exterior Mounted Fender Light 154.68 618.72* 167.74 670.96
TOTAL ORDER EXTENSION FOR UNIT PACKAGE: $1,907.00* $1,957.96
Optional Pricing:
1 EA | Installation of One Unit Package 697.32 697.32 No Bid No Bid
1 EA | Directional Traffic Advisor 582.54 582.54 409.62 409.62
1 EA | Remote Control Spot Light 597.04 597.04 407.26 407.26
1 EA | Controller 189.60 189.60 337.67 337.67

*Technical error on bid document


http://www.modot.mo.gov/

One Unit Package

Quantity | U/M DESCRIPTION Whelen Engineering Terminal Supply**
(including, size, and/or part #'s) Company, Inc.
UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT UNIT PRICE
PRICE EXTENSION PRICE EXTENSION
2 SET | Exterior Mount Overhead Light 497.16 994.32 768.68 1537.36
2 SET | Exterior Mount Rear Bumper Light 119.50 239.00 73.27 146.54
2 SET | Exterior Mount Front Grill Light 79.87 159.74 73.27 146.54
4 SET | Exterior Mounted Fender Light 145.80 583.20 73.27 146.54
TOTAL ORDER EXTENSION FOR UNIT PACKAGE: $1,976.26 $1,976.98
Optional Pricing:
1 EA | Installation of One Unit Package No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 EA | Directional Traffic Advisor 601.59 601.59 1145.75 1145.75
1 EA | Remote Control Spot Light 611.40 611.40 No Bid No Bid
1 EA | Controller 195.87 195.87 No Bid No Bid

**Corrected quantities

***MoDOT will purchase lighting from lowest two bidders. ***
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