SL16-068-RW On Call Rock,
Listed below are the responses received to the above request for quotation,
Materials must meet specifications as described in the 2011 Missouri Standard Specifications for Highway
Construction. Other items may be added as needed Posted 1-29-16 10:00 am




Bussen- 5000

Antire- 6800 Bussen
Rd 63025

Trautman 8799

House Springs

Quarry
5200 Hilisboro

e | Bussen Rd, 63129- | 636-938-4910 Trautman Quarry Rd [ House Springs Rd.
BUSSEN QUARRIES 314-894-8777 63070:636-475-5555 (63051
Pickup Pifk“l" Pickup Pi"k“{’
Product Description U/M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Gabion Stone Ton 11.50 n/a nfa nfa

Rip Rap Ton 12.00 n/a na n/a

Shot Rock Ton 5.00 n/a 5.0 n/a

1"’ Clean Ton 9.50 n/a 8.80 n/a

1 % Clean Ton nfa 9.50 DJIa n/a

9 Clean Ton nfa 8.20 7.50 n/a

3" Clean Ton /a v/a n/a n/a

4" — 6" Clean Ton nfa n/a 7.50 8.20

1” Road ROCk Ton nfa nfa 5.30 5.60

{ 14" Road Rock Ton nfa fa nfa n/a

{ 14 Road Rock Ton nfa nfa n/a n/a

2 Road Rock Ton 5.60 check ;.)lant 5.30 5.60
location

3" Road Rock Ton n/a check [.)lant 5.30 n/a
location

3* Base Rock Ton n/a check [.)lant 5.30 nfa
location

Ditch Liner Ton 14.00 check ;.)lant 14.00 14.00
location

Type 2 Rock Blanket Ton 14.00 check Plant 14.00 14.00
Incation

Type | Base Ton 6.00 check plant 5.50 6.00

(MoDOT Spec. 8) location

Section 1007: Type I

Aggregate Chips Ton 9.50 check plant 8.00 9.50

(MoDOT Spec. 4) location

Aggregates for Seal Coats

Sec. 1003, Grade C

Aggrepate for Surfacing Ton 6.00 check plant 5.50 6.00

{MoDOT Spec. 3) location

1” Surface Stone

Sec. 1006 Grade A or B

Snow and Ice Control Ton 6.00 check plant 5.50 6.00

Chips (MoDOT Spec. 5) location

Limestone Only

Section 1006

Sand — Manufactured Only| Ton 6.80 check plant n/a 6.80

Section 1002.3 location

Sand — Natural River Ton 6.60 check plant n/a 6.80

Section 1005.3

location




ARCH'JOHNSON

636-337-3000 DESOTO
Pickup Pi?kup' Pickup P!cku?
Product Description U/M || Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Ton |

Gabion Stone : 12.50

Rip Rap Ton 12.50

Shot Rock Ton |14.95

1” Clean Ton 8.70

1 %7 Clean Ton |'|N/A

m Clean Ton | 8.70

3" Clean Ton 7.40

4" _ 6" Clean Ton n/a

1 Road Rock (Minus) Ton |15.20

1 %” Road Rock © Ton | {nfa

1 %" Road Rock * Ton |in/a

2% Road ROCk “® Ton 5.20

3" Road ROCk m Ton 5.20

3” Base ROCk w“ Ton | 5.20

Ditch Liner (gabion) Ton 12‘50.

Type 2 Rock Blanket Ton | 112.50

Type 1 Base Ton [115.20

(MoDOT Spec. 8)

Section 1007: Type 1 :

Snow and Ice Control Ton |:{5.20

Chips (MoDOT Spec. 5)

Limestone Only

Section 1006 :

Sand — Manufactured Only| Ton [120.00

Section 1002.3 :

Sand — Natural River Ton Hn/a

Section 1005.3




FRED WEBER- MATERIAL

TYPES AND AVAILABILITY
VARY BY LOCATION
RESOURCE INTEGRATION
CENTER: 314-739-8855 NORTH SOUTH FESTUS NEW MELLE
Pickup Pi?k“l’_ Pickup PECR“P
Product Description U/M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Ton |]16.00 16.00 16.00 16.00

Gabion Stone

Rip Rap Ton na n/a n/a n/a

Shot Rock Ton -:: 6.25 5.50 5.00 5.50

1” Clean Ton 11.95 11.45 9.75 11.00

1 1%” Clean Ton 11.95 1145 9,75 nfa

2 Clean Ton 9.50 8.95 7.95 9.00

3 Clean Ton v/a nfa n/a wa

4" _ 6" Clean Ton |{n/a n/a n/a n/a

1” Road Rock Ton _:: 5.75 5.50 5.00 5.75

114> Road Rock Ton _. n/a n/a nfa n/a

| ¥4 Road Rock Ton |in/a na n/a n/a

2% Road Rock Ton }{5.75 5.50 5.00 5.75

3» Road Rock Ton ||n/a /a n/a n/a

3" Base Rock Ton ||n/a n/a n/a n/a

Ditch Liner Ton n/a n/a n/a n/a

Type 2 Rock Blanket Ton ||16.00 16.00 16.00 n/a

Type 1 Base Ton [:i6.50 6.25 6.25 6.50

(MoDOT Spec. 8)

Section 1007: Type 1 :

Aggregate Chips Ton | |n/a wa n/a n/a

{(MoDOT Spec. 4)

Aggregates for Seal Coats

Sec. 1003, Grade C _

Aggregate for Surfacing Ton [{11.95 11.45 9.75 11.00

(MoDOT Spec. 3) :

I** Surface Stone

Sec. 1006 Grade A or B

Snow and Ice Control Ton | |n/a n/a n/a n/a

Chips (MoDOT Spec. 5)

Limestone Only

Section 1006

Sand — Manufactured Only| Ton |in/a n/a n/a nfa

Section 1002.3

Sand — Natural River Ton | |n/a n/a wa n/a

Section 1005.3




RIVERSTONE QUARRY INC

et A A 8554 HWY O,
636-742-4526 VILLA RIDGE Union
Pickup Pi:.:kup. Pickup PECRUP
Product Description U/M ||  Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Ton |

Gabion Stone : 11.00

Rip Rap Ton 3: 12.00 12.00

ShOt RDCk TOﬂ 5.25 5.25

1” Clean Ton 9.30 9.30

IR Clean Ton I]Jfa 010

27 Clean Ton 7.95 7.95

37 Clean Ton : n/a n/a

4" — 6” Clean Ton 7.95 7.95

ln Road ROCk Ton 5.80 5.80

11” Roﬂd ROCk Ton nf‘ﬂ n./a

11 Road ROCk Ton na n/a

a9 Road ROCk Ton 5.80 5.80

3 Road Rock Ton .: n/a n/a

3" Base Rock Ton n/a nfa

Ditch Liner Ton }11.00

Type 2 Rock Blanket Ton [{11.00 £1.00

Type | Base Ton }:{6.00 6.00

(MoDOT Spec. 8)

Section 1007; Type 1 :

Aggregate Chips Ton }|n/a /a

(MoDOT Spec. 4)

Aggregates for Seal Coats

Sec, 1003, Grade C

Ageregate for Surfacing Ton 16.00 6.00

(MoDOT Spec. 3)

1” Surface Stone

Sec. 1006 Grade A or B

Snow and [ce Control Ton | |n/a nfa

Chips (MoDOT Spec. 3)

Limestone Only

Section 1006 ‘

Sand — Manufactured Only| Ton |{n/a n/a

Section 1002.3

Sand — Natural River Ton |in/a n/a

Section 1005.3




. IRON MOUNTAIN
MATERIAL TYPESAND
AVAILABILITY: VARY.BY
LOCATION

RESOURCE INTEGRATION

CENTER: 314-739-8855

Iron Mountain

Produet Description UM :'

Pickup
Unit Price

Pickup
Unit Price

Pickup
Unit Price

Pickup
Unit Price

Aggregate Chips Ton
(MoDOT Spec. 4)

Aggregates for Seal Coats
Sec. 1003, Grade C

{2000

Ageregate for Surfacing Ton
{(MoDOT Spec. 3)

1" Surface Stone

Sec. 1006 Grade Aor B

n/a

Snow and [ce Control Ton
Chips (MoDOT Spec. 3)
Limestone Only

Section 1006

8.00

Sand — Manufactured Only| Ton
Section 1002.3

{8.00




APAC- BRICKEYS
BLOOMSDALE, MO.

573-483-3475 BLOOMSDALE
Pickup Pi?k“[’. Pickup PkatI{.)
Product Description U/M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Ton {110.00

Gabion Stone :

Rip Rap Ton 12.00

Shot Rock Ton _; 6.00

1 1/2” CEean Ton _. 9.00

2 Clean Ton 8.00

3" Clean Ton 9.50

4” _ 6” C!ean TO]] ._ 9.50

1”* Road Rock Ton |'{N/A

1 %" Road Rock Ton | [N/A

[ 4 Road Rock Ton | N/A

2 Road Rock Ton [ N/A

3* Road Rock Ton | [N/A

3” Base Rock Ton [ N/A

Ditch Liner Ton | [12.00

Type 2 Rock Blanket Ton |112.00

Type | Base Ton {i{6.50

(MoDOT Spec. 8) '

Section 1007: Type 1 :

Aggregate Chips Ton ||N/A

{MoDOT Spec. 4) :

Aggregates for Seal Coats

Sec, 1003, Grade C :

Aggregate for Surfacing Ton | |{N/A

{MoDOT Spec. 3) '

1" Surface Stone

Sec. 1006 Grade A or B

Snow and Ice Control Ton | |N/A

Chips (MoDOT Spec. 5)

Limestone Only

Section 1006

Sand — Manufactured Only| Ton |17.50

Section 1002.3 :

Sand — Natural River Ton | {N/A

Section 1005.3




COLUMBIA QUARRY

(Beelman Logistics)

618-646-5315 bUPO, IL WATERLQO, IL | IRONTON, MO,
Pickup Pickup Pickup Pickup
Product Deseription | UM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
. Ton |:
(Gabion Stone 11110
Rip Rap Ton 1110
Shot Rock Ton |17.10
1” Clean Ton 10.25
1 %4 Clean Ton 10.75
2 Clean Ton 9,75
3 Clean Ton 9.75
4" _ 6" C!eﬂn Ton : N/A
1” Road Rock Ton : 6.30
1 %" Road Rock Ton | IN/A
I %" Road Rock Ton : N/A
2" Road Rock Ton 116.80
3” Road Rock Ton 116.80
3” Base Rock Ton : 6.80
Ditch Liner Ton 11.10
Type 2 Rock Blanket Ton [N/A 14.20
Type 1 Base Ton |16.30
(MoDOT Spec. 8)
Section 1007: Type 1 _
Aggregate Chips Ton |{N/A N/A 14.00
(MoDOT Spec. 4)
Aggregates for Seal Coats
Sec. 1003, Grade C _
Aggrepate for Surfacing Ton ({11.30
{MoDOT Spec. 3)
I** Surface Stone
Sec. 1006 Grade Aor B
Snow and Ice Control Ton |{N/A
Chips (MoDOT Spec. 5)
Limestone Only
Section 1006
Sand - Manufactured Oniy| Ton | |N/A
Section 1002.3 _
Sand — Natural River Ton | |N/A

Section 1005.3

10




SIMPSON MATERIALS

636-343-4944 {BARNHART VALLEY PARK
. Pickup Pickup Pickup Pickup
Product Description U/M |  Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Ton | IN/A N/A

Gabion Stone :

Rip Rap Ton :31 11.00 N/A

Shot Rock Ton : 5.50 N/A

1” Clean Ton 8.00 10.25

1 147 Clean Ton 7.50 10.95

2 Clean Ton 7.50 10.95

3 Clean Ton N/A N/A

476" Clean Ton NI’A N/A

1” Road Rock Ton 4.50 6.00

l '/2” Road ROCk Ton E NI’A N/A

l %u Road ROCk TOl’l NI’A N/A

27 Road ROCk Ton 5.30 N/A

3" Road Rock Ton N/A N/A

3 Base Rock Ton [:IN/A N/A

Ditch Liner Ton |}11.00 N/A

Type 2 Rock Blanket Ton |:11.00 N/A

Type 1 Base Ton |j4.50 6.00

(MoDOT Spec. 8) :

Section 1007: Type 1

Aggregate Chips Ton | IN/A N/A

(MoDOT Spec. 4)

Aggregates for Seal Coats

Sec. 1003, Grade C :

Aggregate for Surfacing Ton |.[4.50 6.00

(MoDOT Spec. 3) '

1 Surface Stone

Sec, 1006 Grade A or B .

Snow and Ice Control Ton |]8.00 12,00

Chips (MoDOT Spec. 5) '

Limestone Only

Section 1006

Sand — Manufactured Only| Ton ||N/A N/A

Section 1002.3 -

Sand — Natural River Ton N/A

Section 1005.3

{7.00

12




Barrett Materials

036-239-1122 Enochs Knob
~ Pickup Pickup Pickup
Product Description UM | Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Ton |{11.00

Gabion Stone :

Rip Rap Ton 10.50

Shot Rock Ton |4.75

1” Clean Ton ||10.20

1 %" Clean Ton |/{8.00

2" Clean Ton 8.00

3 Clean Ton |[8:00

4” - 6" Clean Ton 8.75

1”* Road Rock Ton _' 10.00

1 % Road Rock Ton |:{10.00

1 %4” Road Rock Ton 10.00

2" Road Rock Ton .00

3" Road Rock Ton 8.00

3” Base Rock Ton 5.80

Ditch Liner Ton |in/a

Type 2 Rock Blanket Ton |[11.50
Ton |}5.90

Type | Base ,
(MoBOT Spec. 8)

Section 1007: Type 1

13




CENTRAL STONE MOSCOW LLSBOR
314-830-9000 ANTONIA MILLS FLORISSANT | HILLSBORO
_ Pickup Pi?kUP_ Pickup P?Ck“{’
Product Description U/M ]  Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Ton {:{9.80 8.95 9.30 na

Gabion Stone -

Rip Rap Ton ||12.60 12.15 14.70 n/a

Shot Rock Ton | 5.40 5.15 5.55 5.00

1” Clean Ton :; 8.30 9.15 10.65 7.85

{ 147 Clean Ton }[:]7.90 7.85 9.65 n/a

2” Clean Ton 7.90 7.50 9.85 7.15

3" Clean Ton 8.05 n/a 10.20 n/a

4”7 — 6" Clean Ton 8.00 .75 9.30 n/a

1” Road Rock Ton }:{4.90 4.15 5.55 4.90

1 [/2” Road ROCk Ton 4.90 rl}’a 5.55 n/a

1w Road Rock Ton n/a nlfa n/a n/a

2 Road Rock Ton 3: 4,90 5.00 5.55 4.90

3" Road ROCk Ton 5.05 H/a 5.55 4.90

3" Base ROCk Ton : 5.05 nfa 5.55 4.90

Ditch Liner Ton :' 8.40 12.15 10.00 n/a

Type 2 Rock Blanket Ton 11.80 13.30 14.00 nfa

Type | Base Ton |{5.50 5.00 5.25 n/a

(MoDOT Spec. 8) :

Section 1007: Type 1

Aggregate Chips Ton |19.10 nfa 12.00 n/a

(MoDOT Spec. 4) :

Aggregates for Seal Coats :

Sec. 1003, Grade C :

Agerepate for Surfacing Ton |in/a n/a 12.00 wa

(MoDOT Spec. 3) :

1” Surface Stone

Sec. 1006 Grade A or B

Snow and Ice Control Ton . n/a n/a 12.00 nfa

Chips (MoDOT Spec. 5)

Limestone Only

Section 1006

Sand — Manufactured Only| Ton ||n/a n/a 5.00 n/a

Section 1002.3

Sand — Natural River Ton | |nfa n/a 7.25 n/a

Section 1005.3

14




Mid-Missouri Limestone

573-642-1200

dough@MertensRock.com

New Haven

Pickup Pickup Pickup Pickup
Product Description U/M {|  Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Ton
Gabion Stone 151000
Rip Rap Ton ':_ $11.00
Shot Rock Ton |185.00
1” Clean Ton $10.15
1 g/zs; Clean Ton $8.50
2 Clean Ton -. $8.50
3 Clean Ton $8.50
4”6 Clean Ton $] 1.00
1” Road Rock Ton $8.40
1 ¥%” Road Rock Ton |158.40
1 ¥ Road Rock Ton |$8.40
2” Road Rock Ton | |$8.00
3” Road Rock Ton |1$8.00
3” Base Rock Ton $6.50
Ditch Liner Ton |1$12.00
Type 2 Rock Blanket Ton |311.50
Type 1 Base Ton |{$7.00
{(MoDOT Spec. 8) :
Section 1007: Type ! :
Aggregate Chips Ton §{No bid
(MoDOT Spec. 4)
Aggregates for Seal Coats
Sec. 1003, Grade C
Aggregate for Surfacing Ton |[$3.40
(MoDOT Spec. 3) '
1” Surface Stone
Sec. 1006 Grade A or B
Snow and Ice Control Ton ||No bid
Chips (MoDOT Spec. 5)
Limestone Only
Section 1006
Sand — Manufactured Only| Ton | |No bid
Section 1002.3
Sand — Natural River Ton |{No bid

Section 1005.3

e
=1




