
Request Number:  SE17-B559-RJ Missouri Department of Transportation

Southeast District

Time and   Date Posted

9/27/2016

1:24 PM

Ferrellgas AmeriGas Propane, L. P. MFA Oil Co.

Facility
Total 

Gallons Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Advance 1000 1.100$                  No Bid 1.049$           

Alton 1500 1.070$                  1.190$                                    1.049$           Awarded Vendor is highlighted.

Ava 3000 1.090$                  1.190$                                    0.880$           

Belleview 4000 1.080$                  1.190$                                    1.049$           

Bunker 1000 1.050$                  1.190$                                    1.049$           

Centerville 2000 1.080$                  No Bid 1.049$           

Charleston 1500 1.100$                  No Bid 1.049$           

Doniphan 1500 1.120$                  No Bid 1.049$           

Dora 1000 1.070$                  No Bid 0.880$           

Ellington 3000 1.080$                  No Bid 1.049$           

Ellsinore 1000 1.100$                  No Bid 1.049$           

Fredericktown 1500 1.080$                  1.190$                                    1.049$           

Gainesville 2500 1.090$                  No Bid 0.880$           

Hartville 1000 1.050$                  1.190$                                    0.880$           

Houston 5000 1.070$                  1.190$                                    0.880$           

Houston (Roadside Crew) 2000 1.070$                  1.190$                                    0.880$           

Mountain Grove 3000 1.050$                  1.190$                                    0.880$           

Perryville 2000 1.080$                  1.190$                                    1.049$           

Poplar Bluff (Project Office) 1500 1.120$                  No Bid 1.049$           

Sikeston 250 1.100$                  No Bid 1.049$           

Silva 1000 1.100$                  No Bid 1.049$           

Ste. Genevieve 1500 1.060$                  1.190$                                    1.049$           

Summersville 1500 1.070$                  1.190$                                    1.049$           

Van Buren 1500 1.100$                  No Bid 1.049$           

West Plains 4000 1.070$                  No Bid 0.880$           

WS Striping 2500 1.070$                  1.190$                                    0.880$           

Winona 2000 1.070$                  No Bid 1.049$           


