
Ed Hassinger, District Engineer 

Missouri  

Department  

of Transportation  

 

     QUOTATION 
 

     TABULATION  
       

     General Services   

          

      

St. Louis Metro District 

2309 Barrett Station Road 
Ballwin, Mo. 63021 

(314) 301-1431 

(314) 301-1437 
or (573) 526-0016 Fax 

                                  www.modot.org 

            Toll Free 1-888 ASK MoDOT 

          Thank you for your response to our Request for Quotation: SL14-075-RW, Road Sand As Needed.   

          For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses which were received.  Posted  10:30 a.m. 1-15-14 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 t = per ton 

 

*Fred Weber Plant Sites – (RS) Rutger Street, 1104 S. Wharf, St. Louis, MO  (CC) Crystal City, 100 Howard Dohack Drive, Crystal, City, MO 

 General Pick up is Monday – Friday 7:00 a.m. to 3:00 p, times will fluctuate based on weather. Opening charges will be quoted per 

 occurrence. 

 

      **Bussen Quarries Haul Rates- Ballas $10.80t, Bellefontaine $12.80t, Broadway $10.45t, Hampton $10.30t, Lemay $9.40t, Normandy $11.10t, 

          Sunset Hills $10.30t,  Eureka $10.80t; 

 

***Central Stone Co Haul Rates-Ballas $12.30t, Bellefontaine $10.60t, Broadway $12.30 t, Hampton $12.30 t, Lemay $13.30t, Normandy $10.60t,  

       St. Charles $13.10t, District Office, Traffic Center, and Service Center, $14.10t 

 

Description 

 

 

ROAD SAND 

 

Central Stone*** 

(314) 830-9000 phone 

(314) 830-9001 fax 

 

 

Bussen Quarries** 

(314) 894-8777 phone 

(314) 894-2309 fax 

 

Fred Weber* 

(314) 473-3707 phone 

(314) 793-9235 fax 

 

LaFarge North America 

(314) 739-0169 phone 

(314) 739-1244 fax 

Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered 

 

St. Louis City  

& St. Louis County 

 

$7.10 /ton 

 

Varies 

 

$5.80/ton 

 

Varies 

 

$11.00 

 

Quoted per 

occurance 

 

$7.50/ton 

 

$13.00/ton 

 

St. Charles County 

 

$7.10/ton 

 

Varies 

 

$5.80/ton 

 

Varies 

$11.00  Quoted per 

occurance 

 

$7.50/ton 

 

$12.00/ ton 

 

Jefferson &  

Franklin Counties 

 

No Bid 

 

No Bid 

 

$5.80/ton 

 

Varies 

$11.00  Quoted per 

occurance 

 

$7.50/ton 

 

$18.50/ton 

http://www.modot.org/


 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Description 

 

 

ROAD SAND 

 

Simpson Construction 

Materials**** 

(636) 343-4944 

(636) 343-4492 

 

Bobby Hoelscher 

(636) 456-8334 phone 

(636) 456-8486 fax 

 

 

Kimaterials Inc. 

636-665-5180 

Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered Pick Up Delivered 

 

St. Louis City  

& St. Louis County 

$8.70 No Bid No Bid $12.75  

$7.50 

 

No Bid 

 

St. Charles County 

$8.70 No Bid No Bid $15.35 $7.50 No Bid 

 

Jefferson &  

Franklin Counties 

$8.70 No Bid No Bid $14.95 No Bid No Bid 


