
MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORATION

NORTHWEST DISTRICT - PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

3602 NORTH BELT HIGHWAY

ST. JOSPEH, MO  64506-1399

BID TABULATION
DATE/TIME POSTED

FEBRUARY 8, 2017

9:30 AM

Buyer:  Brenda Christie

Award:  Item 1-4 Lomax Trucking

Award:  Item 5 Beelman Logistics, LLC

ITEM QTY LOCATION
UNIT 

PRICE
TOTAL

UNIT 

PRICE
TOTAL

UNIT 

PRICE
TOTAL

UNIT 

PRICE
TOTAL

UNIT 

PRICE
TOTAL

UNIT PRICE 

DELIVERED

DELIVERED 

TOTAL

PLANT 

PICKUP 

UNIT 

PRICE

PLANT 

PICKUP 

TOTAL

1 915 Chillicothe $33.92 $31,036.80 37.50 $34,312.50 43.85 $40,122.75 52.70 $48,220.50 $39.50 $36,142.50 36.40 $33,306.00 23.00 $21,045.00

2 915 Tina Lot $32.47 $29,710.05 37.50 $34,312.50 42.90 $39,253.50 53.96 $49,373.40 $38.50 $35,227.50 40.30 $36,874.50 23.00 $21,045.00

3 810 Brookfield $30.95 $25,069.50 35.75 $28,957.50 41.25 $33,412.50 48.74 $39,479.40 $35.40 $28,674.00 39.60 $32,076.00 23.00 $18,630.00

4 1350 Brookfield $30.95 $41,782.50 35.75 $48,262.50 41.25 $55,687.50 48.74 $65,799.00 $35.40 $47,790.00 39.60 $53,460.00 23.00 $31,050.00

5 1060 Braymer Lot $37.17 $39,400.20 41.50 $43,990.00 41.10 $43,566.00 56.97 $60,388.20 $42.60 $45,156.00 34.30 $36,358.00 23.00 $24,380.00

Leo O'Laughlin                         

No Bid on Plant 

Pickup

Beelman Logistics, LLC

Bobby Hoelscher                     

No Bid on Plant 

Pickup

Lomax Trucking                     

No Bid on Plant 

Pickup

Iron Mountain Trap 

Rock No Bid on 

Plant Pickup

VENDORS

LWK Trucking                        

No Bid on Plant 

Pickup


