BID TABULATION
RFB 2-160401KH TRAFFIC LIGHTING PARTS

S C Electric Inc

Voss Lighting

Item# | Unit |Group1- Lamps Unit Price Unit Price
***Havell and Halco brands NOT accepted***

001 ea 150 Watt (55 volt) High Pressure Sodium Lamps (Mogul Base, Clear) S 505 (S 4.87
002 ea 150 Watt (100 volt) High Pressure Sodium Lamps (Mogul Base, Clear) S 6.15 | S 5.84
003 ea 150 Watt (55 volt) High Pressure Sodium Lamps (Medium Base, Clear) S 495 |S 4.87
004 ea 250 Watt High Pressure Sodium Lamps (Mogul Base, Clear) S 5501|8S 5.10
005 ea 400 Watt High Pressure Sodium Lamps (Mogul Base, Clear) S 590 (S 5.10
006 ea 1000 Watt High Pressure Sodium Lamps (Mogul Base, Clear) S 2850 | S 19.48
007 ea 400 Watt Metal Halide Lamps (Mogul Base, Clear) S 850 (S 7.79
008 ea 1000 Watt Metal Halide Lamps (Mogul Base, Clear) S 17.50 | S 16.08

Group 1 Total | $ 82.05 (S 69.13




S C Electric Inc

Voss Lighting

Item # Unit |Group 2 - Luminaires Unit Price Unit Price
150 Watt (Multi Tap) High Pressure Sodium Luminaire - Type 3 Distribution, Copper
009 ea Windings, Glass Lenses (w/out Photo Cell Base) S 90.00 | NO BID
250 Watt (Multi Tap) High Pressure Sodium Luminaire - Type 3 Distribution, Copper
010 ea Windings, Glass Lenses (w/out Photo Cell Base) S 94.00 | NO BID
400 Watt (Multi Tap) High Pressure Sodium Luminaire - Type 3 Distribution, Copper
011 ea Windings, Glass Lenses (w/out Photo Cell Base) S 132.00 [ NO BID
150 Watt (480 volt) High Pressure Sodium Luminaire - Type 3 Distribution, Copper
012 ea Windings, Glass Lenses (w/out Photo Cell Base) S 92.00 | NO BID
250 Watt (480 volt) High Pressure Sodium Luminaire - Type 3 Distribution, Copper
013 ea Windings, Glass Lenses (w/out Photo Cell Base) S 96.00 | NO BID
400 Watt (480 volt) High Pressure Sodium Luminaire - Type 3 Distribution, Copper
014 ea Windings, Glass Lenses (w/out Photo Cell Base) S 132.00 | NO BID
015 ea Time-Delay Photo Cell (120 volt) S 9.00 | NO BID
016 ea Time-Delay Photo Cell (120/240 volt) S 9.00 | NO BID
017 ea Time-Delay Photo Cell (240 volt) S 9.00 | NO BID
018 ea Time-Delay Photo Cell (480 volt) S 9.00 | NO BID
019 ea Socket for Photo Cell S 11.00 | NO BID
Group 2 Total | $ 683.00 | $ -




S C Electric Inc

Voss Lighting

Item # Unit [Group 3 - Wire and Conduit Unit Price Unit Price

#6 AWG XLP\USE Pole & Bracket Wire, Stranded Copper, Single Conductor

020 spool |BLACK on 500" Wooden Spools S 240.00 | NO BID
#8 AWG XLP\USE Pole & Bracket Wire, Stranded Copper, Single Conductor

021 spool |BLACK on 500" Wooden Spools S 155.00 | NO BID
#10 AWG XLP\USE Pole & Bracket Wire, Stranded Copper, Single Conductor

022 spool |WHITE on 500' Wooden Spools S 120.00 | NO BID
#10 AWG XLP\USE Pole & Bracket Wire, Stranded Copper, Single Conductor

023 spool |BLACK on 500" Wooden Spools S 120.00 | NO BID
#2 AWG THHN/THWN?2, Stranded Copper, Single Conductor

024 spool |BLACK on 500' Wooden Spools S 448.00 | NO BID
#2 AWG XHHW-2, Stranded Copper, Single Conductor

025 spool |BLACK on 500" Wooden Spools S 448.00 | NO BID
# 6 AWG Solid Copper Conductor

026 spool |Bare, on 500' Wooden Spool S 194.00 | NO BID
# 6 AWG Stranded Copper Conductor

027 spool |Bare, on 500' Wooden Spool S 199.00 | NO BID
#2 Cable, 1-1/4" Cable Conduit - Three #2 AWG Underground Stranded Copper

028 spool |Conductors - One Bare, Two Insulated, on 500' Wooden Spool S 1,745.00 | NO BID
#6 Cable, 1" Cable Conduit - Three #6 AWG Underground Stranded Copper Conductors

029 spool |- One Bare, Two Insulated, on 500" Wooden Spool S 515.00 | NO BID

030 ea Fused Slip Connector S 29.00 [ NO BID

031 ea KTK-R-5 Fast Acting Fuses or equivalent (provide specifications) S 7.00 | NO BID

Group 3 Total | $ 4,220.00 | S -




S C Electric Inc | Voss Lighting
Item # | Unit |Group 4 - Type AT Galvanized Steel Poles & Bracket Arms Unit Price Unit Price
Type AT Galvanized Steel Poles for 45' Mounting Height
032 ea AT- 45 Design 1 (50") S 1,573.00 | NO BID
033 ea AT- 45 Design 2 (45') S 1,082.00 | NO BID
034 ea AT- 45 Design 3 (40" S 1,080.00 | NO BID
035 ea AT- 45 Design 4 (35') S 919.00 | NO BID
036 ea AT- 45 Design 5 (30") S 814.00 | NO BID
Type AT Galvanized Steel Poles for 30' Mounting Height
| 037 | ea [AT-30 B 700.00 | NO BID
Type AT-30 with 18" Rise. Must include all attaching and mounting hardware
Trussed:
038 ea 4 foot S 220.00 | NO BID
039 ea 6 foot S 264.00 | NO BID
040 ea 8 foot S 352.00 | NO BID
041 ea 10 foot S 388.00 | NO BID
042 ea 12 foot S 408.00 | NO BID
043 ea 15 foot S 448.00 | NO BID
Type AT-30 with 18" Rise. Must include all attaching and mounting hardware
Single:
044 ea 4 foot S 131.00 | NO BID
045 ea 6 foot S 156.00 | NO BID
Type AT-45 with 5'-6" Rise. Must include all attaching and mounting hardware
046 ea 6 foot (single) S 180.00 | NO BID
047 ea 15 foot (truss) S 347.00 | NO BID
Group 4 Total | $ 9,062.00 | S -




S C Electric Inc

Voss Lighting

| Item # | Unit |Group 5 - Circular Steel Foundations Unit Price Unit Price
Include all hardware for mounting to transformer bases
Type AT-30 Circular Steel Foundations -- 30' Mounting Height
See Standard Plans 901.00
048 ea 7 Foot S 450.00 | NO BID
Type AT-45 Circular Steel Foundations -- 45' Mounting Height
See Standard Plans 901.01
049 ea Design1 (10" S 789.00 | NO BID
050 ea Design2 & 3 (9") S 759.00 [ NO BID
051 ea Design 4 &5 (8') S 734.00 | NO BID
Group 5 Total | $ 2,732.00 | S -
S C Electric Inc | Voss Lighting
| Item # | Unit |Group 6 - Screw Anchor Foundations Unit Price Unit Price
Include all hardware for mounting to transformer bases.
Type AT-30 Screw Anchor Foundations -- 30' Mounting Height
See Standard Plans 901.00
052 ea 5 Foot S 344.00 | NO BID
Type AT-45 Screw Anchor Foundations -- 45' Mounting Height
See Standard Plans 901.01
053 ea 7 Foot S 493.00 | NO BID
Group 6 Total | $ 837.00 | $ -
Total for Group 5and 6 | S 3,569.00 | S -




S C Electric Inc

Voss Lighting

| Item # | Unit |Group 7 - Transformer Bases Unit Price Unit Price
Include all hardware for mounting to lighting poles.
054 ea 45' Mounting Height - TB3-17H Akron Foundry S 365.00 | NO BID
055 ea 30' Mounting Height - TB1-17H Akron Foundry S 248.00 | NO BID
Group 7 Total | $ 613.00 | $ -
S C Electric Inc | Voss Lighting
Item # Unit [Group 8 - Control Equipment Unit Price Unit Price
056 ea Meter Service Pedestal - 120 Volt Signal (Signal Only) S 1,370.00 | NO BID
Meter Service Pedestal - 120 Volt Signal w/ 2-circuit 240 Volt Lighting
057 ea (Signal & Lighting) S 2,652.00 | NO BID
Meter Service Pedestal - 120 Volt Signal w/ 2-circuit 240 Volt Lighting
058 ea Dual Meter (Signal & Lighting) S 3,540.00 | NO BID
059 ea Meter Service Pedestal 2-circuit 240 Volt Lighting (Lighting Only) S 2,970.00 | NO BID
060 ea Meter Service Pedestal 4-circuit 480 Volt Lighting (Lighting Only) S 3,110.00 | NOBID
061 ea Meter Service Pedestal 4-circuit 480 Volt Lighting (Lighting Only-Ameren) S 3,551.00 | NO BID
Group 8 Total | $ 17,193.00 | S -

Low Bid




