NORTHWEST DISTRICT PRICING PAGE
Spring Aggregate - RFB 2-141230LT

Bid Opening Date: December 30, 2014
Bid Posting Date: January 5, 2015
Bid Awards Posting Date: January 27, 2015

TABULATION OF BID AWARDS

Hinnen Hauling &
Construction, Inc. Leo O'Laughlin, Inc. Mutter Farms, LLC
PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON
STOCKPILE LOCATION/ %

ITEM #SPEC| TONS COUNTY MAINTENANCE LOT = | Delivered to MoDOT Delivered to MoDOT Delivered to MoDOT
1 8 500 BUCHANAN RUSHVILLE 1 NO BID $16.45 $17.90
2 8 400 CLINTON LATHROP 2 NO BID $15.20 $14.75
3 8 500 DAVIESS GALLATIN 3 $17.99 $16.40 $16.35
4 8 700 DEKALB CAMERON 4 $24.20 $14.75 $14.95
5 8 500 GENTRY ALBANY 5 $17.25 $16.90 $16.55
6 8 500 GENTRY KING CITY 6 NO BID $16.60 $17.50
7 8 1,000 GRUNDY TRENTON 7 $15.20 $15.15 $16.05
8 8 750 HARRISON BETHANY 8 $14.40 $15.15 $15.35
9 3 3,000 PUTNAM UNIONVILLE 9 $18.60 $18.24 $18.05
10 6A 1,000 PUTNAM UNIONVILLE 10 $17.25 $16.89 $16.69
11 8 400 WORTH GRANT CITY 11 NO BID $17.49 $18.55

Low bid awards highlighted




