2-140630RW Various Blades Tabulation Bid Opening Date: June 30, 2014
Bid Tab Posting Date: June 30, 2014

Commodity Descrition Estimated Valk
Code i Quantity Kennametal Manufacturing
Category 1
7600613442 |BLADE, CARBIDE TIPPED 3/4" X 5" X 3' 365 $221.63 $153.87
7600613452 |BLADE, CARBIDE TIPPED 3/4" X 5" X 4' 1521 $295.51 $205.16
7600613462 |BLADE, CARBIDE TIPPED 3/4" X 5" X 5' 165 $369.39 $256.45
Category 2
7600613446 (BLADE, CARBIDE TIPPED 7/8" X 5" X 3' 132 $222.84 $158.22
7600613456 |BLADE, CARBIDE TIPPED 7/8" X 5" X 4' 329 $297.12 $210.96
7600613466 (BLADE, CARBIDE TIPPED 7/8" X 5" X 5' 102 $371.40 $263.70
Category 3
7600610147 |BLADE, DUAL CARBIDE TIPPED UNDERBODY 7/8" X 5" X 3' 15 $485.10 NO BID
7600610159 (BLADE, DUAL CARBIDE TIPPED UNDERBODY 7/8" X 5" X 4' 87 $646.80 NO BID
7600610163 (BLADE, DUAL CARBIDE TIPPED UNDERBODY 7/8" X 5" X 5' 655 $808.50 NO BID
Category 4
7600670120 (BLADE, FLAT STEEL 1/2" THICKNESS X 8" WIDE X 10' LENGTH 5 NO BID $130.00
7600670121 |BLADE, FLAT STEEL 1/2" THICKNESS X 8" WIDE X 11' LENGTH 5 NO BID $143.00
7600670122 (BLADE, FLAT STEEL 1/2" THICKNESS X 8" WIDE X 12' LENGTH 78 NO BID $156.00
7600670124 |BLADE, FLAT STEEL 1/2" THICKNESS X 8" WIDE X 14' LENGTH 117 NO BID $182.00
Category 5
| 7600610107 [BLADE, MAINTAINER LENGTH 7' WIDTH 8" THICKNESS 1/2" | 48| NO BID [ | NO BID |
Category 6
| 7600610807 |BLADE, SPECIAL HARDENED MAINTAINER 5/8" TO 7/8" THICK X 8" W X 7' L | 44 | NO BID [ | NO BID |
Category 7
7600610185 |BLADE, HARDENED STEEL 1" THICKNESS X 8" WIDE X 5' LENGTH 7 NO BID NO BID
7600610186 (BLADE, HARDENED STEEL 1" THICKNESS X 8" WIDE X 6' LENGTH 3 NO BID NO BID
Category 8
7600612000 (BLADE, RUBBER SNOW PLOW 1 1/2" THICKNESS 8" WIDE X 12' LENGTH 14 NO BID | | $312.00

Low bid award highlighted
Cost is price per blade



