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Trailer Mounted Solar Powered Changeable Message Sign

Line Description American Signal | K&K Systems Signalisation
Item Company Ver-Mac
001 Full Matrix — Digital $13,849.00 $15,619.00 $19,889.00
Cellular Transceiver Installed
002 Full Matrix — Digital $13,199.00 $14,885.00 $18,939.00
Cellular Transceiver
Future Install
003 Character Matrix — Digital $12,649.00 $14,842.00 $18,443.00
Cellular Transceiver Installed
004 Character — Digital $12,099.00 $14,108.00 $17,493.00
Cellular Transceiver
Future Install
TOTALS $51,796.00 $59,454.00 $74,764.00
Truck Mounted Solar Powered Changeable Message Sign
Line Description American Sighal | K&K Systems Signalisation
Iltem Company Ver-Mac
005 Full Matrix $10,049.00 $10,900.00 $12,989.00
Wired Controller/LED
006 Full Matrix $10,299.00 NO BID $13,789.00
Wireless Controller/LED
007 Character Matrix $10,049.00 NO BID NO BID
Wired Controller/LED
008 Character Matrix $10,299.00 NO BID NO BID
Wireless Controller/LED

Contract Award — American Signal Company

Road Runner Safety Services — Irregular Bid




