
HERBICIDES BID

RFB 2-140103RW

Bid Opening Date:  January 3, 2014

Bid Tab Posting Date:  January 13, 2014

Bid Award Tab Posting Date:  January 29, 2014

Item # Product Est. Qty Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total

1 ESCORT XP 6376 $8.42 $53,685.92 $8.90 $56,746.40 $4.20 $26,779.20 $12.29 $78,361.04 $4.70 $29,967.20

1A ALTERNATIVE - METSULFURON METHYL 128 $5.25 $672.00 $4.45 $569.60 $2.62 $335.36 NO BID NO BID $4.00 $512.00

2 PLATEAU 723 $115.85 $83,759.55 $122.95 $88,892.85 $122.00 $88,206.00 NO BID NO BID $125.00 $90,375.00

3 PENDULUM AQUACAP 120 $44.50 $5,340.00 $49.99 $5,998.20 $50.50 $6,060.00 $63.37 $7,604.40 $55.00 $6,600.00

4 OUTRIDER 12240 $13.48 $164,995.20 $13.95 $170,748.00 $13.57 $166,096.80 $54.02 $661,204.80 $20.00 $244,800.00

5 PERSPECTIVE 17920 $4.60 $82,432.00 $4.60 $82,432.00 $4.60 $82,432.00 NO BID NO BID $5.60 $100,352.00

6 BASAL BARK/DORMANT STEM TREATMENT BLEND 1005 $31.45 $31,607.25 $33.95 $34,119.75 $30.30 $30,451.50 NO BID NO BID $100.00 $100,500.00

7 ESPLANADE 200CS 75 $1,031.42 $77,356.50 NO BID $75.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,050.00 $78,750.00

Product Est. Qty Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total

8 NON-IONIC SURFACTANT 2305 15.45 $35,612.25 $11.95 $27,544.75 Irregular $55.02 $126,821.10 $20.00 $46,100.00

9 WATER-SOFT WATER CONDITIONER 1445 $18.65 $26,949.25 Irregular Irregular NO BID NO BID $20.00 $28,900.00

Irregular Bids for Line Item 8 - Helena Chemical - Item does not meet specification.

Irregular Bids for Line Item 9 - CWC Chemical and Helena Chemical - Did not bid item as specified in bid.

Item # Product Est. Qty Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total

10 AQUATIC GLYPHOSATE 2985 $17.05 $50,894.25 $20.95 $62,535.75 $22.23 $66,356.55

11 MILESTONE VM 690 $294.58 $203,260.20 $294.58 $203,260.20 $296.98 $204,916.20

12 2,4-D AMINE WITH AQUATIC LABEL (Dow DMA 4 IVM or 

equivalent) 3045 $12.85 $39,128.25 $16.95 $51,612.75 $16.15 $49,176.75

13 GARLON 3A 2340 $52.45 $122,733.00 $69.95 $163,683.00 $59.40 $138,996.00

14 KRENITE S 1260 $48.20 $60,732.00 $52.75 $66,465.00 $54.90 $69,174.00

Item # Accessory Est. Qty Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total

15 TRANSFER CUBE 2.5 GALLON 55 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $15.50 $852.50

16 TRANSFER CUBE 5 GALLON 65 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $15.50 $1,007.50

17 ELECTRIC TRANSFER PUMP KIT 110 VOLT 2 $0.00 $0.00 $717.00 $1,434.00 $550.00 $1,100.00

18 ELECTRIC TRANSFER PUMP KIT 12 VOLT 7 $0.00 $0.00 $594.00 $4,158.00 $550.00 $3,850.00

19 MANUAL CHEMICAL TRANSFER PUMP 2 $0.00 $0.00 $257.00 $514.00 $177.22 $354.44

20 MICROMATIC REPLACEMENT COUPLING 6 $0.00 $0.00 $128.00 $768.00 $88.61 $531.66

$476,747.70 $554,430.70 $536,315.60

Herbicide in Non-Returnable Containers - Bid award for items 1 thru 9 below will be on an "Item by Item" basis. 

Herbicide in Returnable Containers - Bid award for items 10 thru 20 below will be on a "All or Nothing" basis.

Additives

Returnable Container Accessories

Helena ChemicalCrop Production CWC Chemical

John Deere Landscape Lawrence Pest Control

Lawrence Pest ControlJohn Deere Landscape

Crop Production CWC Chemical Helena Chemical

Low bid awards are highlighted.

***A random drawing was held to break tie bids for Perspective and Esplanade.



HERBICIDES BID

RFB 2-140103RW

Bid Opening Date:  January 3, 2014

Bid Tab Posting Date:  January 13, 2014

Bid Award Tab Posting Date:  January 29, 2014

Item # Product Est. Qty Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total

1 ESCORT XP 6376 $3.58 $22,826.08 $3.73 $23,782.48 $7.00 $44,632.00 $8.50 $54,196.00

1A ALTERNATIVE - METSULFURON METHYL 128 $2.88 $368.64 NO BID NO BID $4.00 $512.00 $4.00 $512.00

2 PLATEAU 723 $113.89 $82,342.47 $122.37 $88,473.51 $121.00 $87,483.00 $125.26 $90,562.98

3 PENDULUM AQUACAP 120 $53.08 $6,369.60 $47.27 $5,672.40 $48.00 $5,760.00 $47.23 $5,667.60

4 OUTRIDER 12240 $13.86 $169,621.92 $13.78 $168,667.20 $13.95 $170,748.00 $14.96 $183,110.40

5 PERSPECTIVE 17920 NO BID NO BID $4.60 $82,432.00 $4.60 $82,432.00 $4.60 $82,432.00

6 BASAL BARK/DORMANT STEM TREATMENT BLEND 1005 $34.74 $34,913.70 NO BID NO BID $30.76 $30,913.80 NO BID $1,005.00

7 ESPLANADE 200CS 75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,031.42 $77,356.50

Product Est. Qty Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total

8 NON-IONIC SURFACTANT 2305 14.95 $34,459.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.00 $48,405.00

9 WATER-SOFT WATER CONDITIONER 1445 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Item # Product Est. Qty Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total

10 AQUATIC GLYPHOSATE 2985 $19.35 $57,759.75 $19.74 $58,923.90

11 MILESTONE VM 690 $294.58 $203,260.20 $294.58 $203,260.20

12 2,4-D AMINE WITH AQUATIC LABEL (Dow DMA 4 IVM or 

equivalent) 3045 $14.85 $45,218.25 $15.80 $48,111.00

13 GARLON 3A 2340 $56.45 $132,093.00 $54.85 $128,349.00

14 KRENITE S 1260 $48.74 $61,412.40 $49.73 $62,659.80

Item # Accessory Est. Qty Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total Unit Price Extended Total

15 TRANSFER CUBE 2.5 GALLON 55 $17.65 $970.75 $18.00 $990.00

16 TRANSFER CUBE 5 GALLON 65 $17.65 $1,147.25 $18.00 $1,170.00

17 ELECTRIC TRANSFER PUMP KIT 110 VOLT 2 $598.00 $1,196.00 $600.00 $1,200.00

18 ELECTRIC TRANSFER PUMP KIT 12 VOLT 7 $598.00 $4,186.00 $600.00 $4,200.00

19 MANUAL CHEMICAL TRANSFER PUMP 2 $197.22 $394.44 $185.00 $370.00

20 MICROMATIC REPLACEMENT COUPLING 6 $98.45 $590.70 $95.00 $570.00

$508,228.74 $509,803.90

Winfield

Herbicide in Non-Returnable Containers - Bid award for items 1 thru 9 below will be on an "Item by Item" basis. 

Red River Specialities Van Diest Supply VM Distribution

Red River Specialities Van Diest Supply VM Distribution Winfield

Additives

Herbicide in Returnable Containers - Bid award for items 10 thru 20 below will be on a "All or Nothing" basis.

Returnable Container Accessories

Low bid awards are highlighted.

***A random drawing was held to break tie bids for Perspective and Esplanade.


