
CATEGORY #1

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

1

Scorpion Micro Digital 

Video Camera, 2.0 

mega pixel, Records 

30 frames per 

second, supports AVI 

video format and 

JPEG picture format 1-5 131.98$         $131.98 No Bid 0.00 $149.00 $149.00

6-10 131.98$         $131.98 No Bid 0.00 $149.00 $149.00

11+ 131.98$         $131.98 No Bid 0.00 $149.00 $149.00

TOTAL: 395.94$         TOTAL: -$               TOTAL: $447.00

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

1

Scorpion Micro Digital 

Video Camera, 2.0 

mega pixel, Records 

30 frames per 

second, supports AVI 

video format and 

JPEG picture format 1-5 No Bid 0 No Bid $349.00 $349.00

6-10 No Bid 0 No Bid $349.00 $349.00

11+ No Bid 0 No Bid $349.00 $349.00

TOTAL: -$               TOTAL: -$               TOTAL: $1,047.00

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

1

Scorpion Micro Digital 

Video Camera, 2.0 

mega pixel, Records 

30 frames per 

second, supports AVI 

video format and 

JPEG picture format 1-5 No Bid 0 No Bid

6-10 No Bid 0 No Bid

11+ No Bid 0 No Bid

TOTAL: -$               TOTAL: -$               

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

1

Scorpion Micro Digital 

Video Camera, 2.0 

mega pixel, Records 

30 frames per 

second, supports AVI 

video format and 

JPEG picture format 1-5 No Bid 0 No Bid

6-10 No Bid 0 No Bid

11+ No Bid 0 No Bid

TOTAL: -$               TOTAL: -$               

OFFICER CAMERAS
Bid Request #5-140108CN

16-Jan-14

Business Services Taser International Inc

Voice Products

Safety Innovations Inc

Safety Vision LLC Coban Technologies

MediaSolv Solutions Corp Protective Solutions Inc

Digital Ally Inc MOS-IT



CATEGORY #1

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

OFFICER CAMERAS
Bid Request #5-140108CN

16-Jan-14

Business Services Taser International Inc Safety Innovations Inc

CATEGORY #1#2

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

1

Vievu LE2 Camera, 

4GB Internal Memory, 

SD Video Resolution, 

30 Frames per 

second, Color Video 

and Audio, 

Waterproof 1-5 749.98$         $749.98 308.00$         $308.00 $499.00 $499.00

6-10 749.98$         $749.98 308.00$         $308.00 $499.00 $499.00

11+ 749.38$         $749.38 308.00$         $308.00 $499.00 $499.00

TOTAL: $2,249.34 TOTAL: $924.00 TOTAL: $1,497.00

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

1

Vievu LE2 Camera, 

4GB Internal Memory, 

SD Video Resolution, 

30 Frames per 

second, Color Video 

and Audio, 

Waterproof 1-5 No Bid 0 714.95$         $714.95 $699.00 $699.00

6-10 No Bid 0 672.95$         $672.95 $699.00 $699.00

11+ No Bid 0 658.00$         $658.00 $699.00 $699.00

TOTAL: $0 TOTAL: $2,045.90 TOTAL: $2,097.00

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

1

Vievu LE2 Camera, 

4GB Internal Memory, 

SD Video Resolution, 

30 Frames per 

second, Color Video 

and Audio, 

Waterproof 1-5 No Bid $0 No Bid $0

6-10 No Bid $0 No Bid $0

11+ No Bid $0 No Bid $0

TOTAL: $0 TOTAL: $0

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

1

Vievu LE2 Camera, 

4GB Internal Memory, 

SD Video Resolution, 

30 Frames per 

second, Color Video 

and Audio, 

Waterproof 1-5 625.00$         $625.00 $550.00 $550.00

6-10 600.00$         $600.00 $525.00 $525.00

11+ 575.00$         $575.00 $500.00 $500.00

TOTAL: $1,800.00 TOTAL: $1,575.00

Business Services Taser International Inc Safety Innovations Inc

Safety Vision LLC Coban Technologies Voice Products

Digital Ally Inc MOS-IT

MediaSolv Solutions Protective Solutions Inc



CATEGORY #1

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

OFFICER CAMERAS
Bid Request #5-140108CN

16-Jan-14

Business Services Taser International Inc Safety Innovations Inc

CATEGORY #1#3

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

1

FirstVu HD Body 

Camera Video 

System, 25-54 Hours 

record time, 

Waterproof, 

Extendable 

Breakaway 1-5 839.98$         $839.98 No Bid $0.00 $499.00 $499.00

6-10 839.98$         $839.98 No Bid $0.00 $499.00 $499.00

11+ 839.98$         $839.98 No Bid $0.00 $499.00 $499.00

TOTAL: $2,519.94 TOTAL: $0.00 TOTAL: $1,497.00

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

1

FirstVu HD Body 

Camera Video 

System, 25-54 Hours 

record time, 

Waterproof, 

Extendable 

Breakaway 1-5 684.24$         $684.24 No Bid $0.00 $889.00 $889.00

6-10 631.48$         $631.48 No Bid $0.00 $889.00 $889.00

11+ 621.43$         $621.43 No Bid $0.00 $889.00 $889.00

TOTAL: $1,937.15 TOTAL: $0.00 TOTAL: $2,667.00

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

1

FirstVu HD Body 

Camera Video 

System, 25-54 Hours 

record time, 

Waterproof, 

Extendable 

Breakaway 1-5 1,010.00$      $1,010.00 $1,110.00 $1,110.00

6-10 960.00$         $960.00 $1,060.00 $1,060.00

11+ 935.00$         $935.00 $1,035.00 $1,035.00

TOTAL: $2,905.00 TOTAL: $3,205.00

Business Services Taser International Inc Safety Innovations Inc

Safety Vision LLC Coban Technologies Voice Products

Digital Ally Inc MOS-IT



CATEGORY #1

ITEM: DESCRIPTON: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

OFFICER CAMERAS
Bid Request #5-140108CN

16-Jan-14

Business Services Taser International Inc Safety Innovations Inc

RECOMMENDATION:  Award Category #1 to Business Services , as they are apparent low bidder

RECOMMENDATION:  Award Category #2 to Taser International Inc, as they are apparent low bidder

RECOMMENDATION:  Award Category #3 to Business Services, as they are apparent low bidderNot  awarded - Posted as Single Feasible Source with Digital Ally


