
Tabulation Sheet 

RFB 5-130226LK On-Call Emergency Roadside Vehicle and Equipment Repair Services

Vendor Location Hourly Rate Overtime Rate Holiday Rate % Parts Cost Markup

Fleming Auto Center, Inc., d/b/a Jackson 

County Tow Service - Blue Springs, MO
Kansas City District by County

Platte No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Clay No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ray No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Jackson $125.00 $150.00 $150.00 25%

Lafayette $125.00 $150.00 $150.00 25%

Saline No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cass No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Johnson $125.00 $150.00 $150.00 25%

Pettis No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Regular Hours : Monday - Friday 8am - 

5pm Overtime Hours: Monday - Friday 5pm-

8am (All 24 hour period on Saturday & 

Sunday) Holiday Hours:  All Federal 

Holidays (All 24 hour period on holiday)

Percentage of Maximum Increase for 

Renewal Periods

1st Renewal 

10%

2nd Renewal 

10%

3rd Renewal 

10%

Vendor Location Hourly Rate Overtime Rate Holiday Rate % Parts Cost Markup

Meyers Truck Service LLC - Mexico, 

MO
Northwest District by County

Atchison No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Nodaway No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Worth No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Holt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Andrew No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Gentry No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DeKalb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Buchanan No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Clinton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Harrison No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Daviess No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Mercer No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Putnam No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Grundy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sullivan No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Linn $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Caldwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Livingston No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Carroll No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Chariton $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Regular Hours : Monday - Friday 7am - 

5pm Overtime Hours: Monday - Friday 5pm-

7am (All 24 hour period on Saturday & 

Sunday) Holiday Hours:  New Years Day, 

Memorial Day, July 4th, Labor Day, 

Thanksgiving Day, and Christmas Day (All 

24 hour period on holiday)

1st Renewal 

3%

2nd Renewal 

3%

3rd Renewal 3%



Tabulation Sheet 

RFB 5-130226LK On-Call Emergency Roadside Vehicle and Equipment Repair Services

Location Hourly Rate Overtime Rate Holiday Rate % Parts Cost Markup

Northeast District by County

Schuyler $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Scotland $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Clark $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Adair $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Knox $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Lewis $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Macon $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Shelby $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Marion $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Randolph $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Monroe $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Ralls $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Audrain $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Pike $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Montgomery $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Lincoln $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Warren $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

1st Renewal 

3%

2nd Renewal 

3%

3rd Renewal 3%

Location Hourly Rate Overtime Rate Holiday Rate % Parts Cost Markup

Central District by County

Howard $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Boone $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Callaway $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Cooper $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Moniteau $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Morgan No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cole $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Miller No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Camden No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Maries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Laclede No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Osage $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Gasconade $85.00 $170.00 $170.00 Fleet Charge Pricing

Pulaski No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Phelps No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Crawford No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Washington No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1st Renewal 

3%

2nd Renewal 

3%

3rd Renewal 3%

Vendor Location Hourly Rate Overtime Rate Holiday Rate % Parts Cost Markup

Chillicothe Truck Repair & Towing - 

Chillicothe, MO
Northwest District by County

Atchison No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Nodaway No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Worth No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Holt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Andrew No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Gentry No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DeKalb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Buchanan No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Clinton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Harrison $84.00 $105.00 $105.00 7%

Daviess $84.00 $105.00 $105.00 7%

Mercer $84.00 $105.00 $105.00 7%

Putnam No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Grundy $84.00 $105.00 $105.00 7%

Sullivan $84.00 $105.00 $105.00 7%

Linn $84.00 $105.00 $105.00 7%

Caldwell $84.00 $105.00 $105.00 7%

Livingston $84.00 $105.00 $105.00 7%

Carroll $84.00 $105.00 $105.00 7%

Chariton $84.00 $105.00 $105.00 7%

Regular Hours : Monday - Friday 8am - 

5pm Overtime Hours: Monday - Friday 5pm-

8am (All 24 hour period on Saturday & 

Sunday) Holiday Hours:  5pm - 8am the day 

before until the day after.

1st Renewal 

1%

2nd Renewal 

1%

3rd Renewal 1%

Vendor



Tabulation Sheet 

RFB 5-130226LK On-Call Emergency Roadside Vehicle and Equipment Repair Services

Al Scheppers Motor Company - 

Jefferson City, MO
Location Hourly Rate Overtime Rate Holiday Rate % Parts Cost Markup

Central District by County

Howard $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Boone $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Callaway $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Cooper $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Moniteau $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Morgan $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Cole $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Miller $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Camden $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Maries $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Laclede $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Osage $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Gasconade $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Pulaski $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Phelps $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Crawford $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Washington $75.00 $112.50 $150.00 10%

Regular Hours : Monday - Friday 7am - 

5pm Overtime Hours: Monday - Friday 5pm-

7am (All 24 hour period on Saturday & 

Sunday) Holiday Hours:  New Years Day, 

Memorial Day, July 4th, Labor Day, 

Thanksgiving Day, and Christmas Day (All 

24 hour period on holiday)

1st Renewal 

4%

2nd Renewal 

4%

3rd Renewal 4%


