Changeable Message Signs

RFB 2-160726RW

Changeable Message Sign (CMS) - Trailer Mounted Solar Powered

Line Item

Description

American Signal Company

K and K Systems, Inc.

Signalisation Ver-Mac, Inc.

SIND X1 [Ind

Full Matrix - Digital Cellular Tranciever -
Installed
Rotatable w/15 day battery life

$14,600.00

$13,852.42

$18,247.00

Full Matrix - Digital Cellular Tranciever -
For Future Install
Rotatable w/15 day battery life

$13,800.00

$13,154.58

$17,747.00

Full Matrix - Digital Cellular Tranciever -
Installed
Rotatable w/30 day battery life

$15,300.00

$15,031.10

$19,597.00

Full Matrix - Digital Cellular Tranciever -
For Future Install
Rotatable w/30 day battery life

$14,500.00

$14,333.26

$19,097.00

Full Matrix - Digital Cellular Tranciever -
Installed
Fixed w/15 day battery life

$13,700.00

$13,852.42

$18,247.00

Full Matrix - Digital Cellular Tranciever -
For Future Install
Fixed w/15 day battery life

$12,900.00

$13,154.58

$17,747.00

Full Matrix - Digital Cellular Tranciever -
Installed
Fixed w/30 day battery life

$14,500.00

$15,031.10

$19,597.00

Full Matrix - Digital Cellular Tranciever -
For Future Install
Fixed w/30 day battery life

$13,700.00

$14,333.26

$19,097.00

SIND XLIBA Ja1oeley)

Character Matrix - Digital Cellular
Tranciever - Installed
Rotatable w/15 day battery life

$13,900.00

$13,240.85

$16,697.00

10

Character Matrix - Digital Cellular
Tranciever - For Future Install
Rotatable w/15 day battery life

$13,100.00

$12,543.01

$15,993.00

11

Character Matrix - Digital Cellular
Tranciever - Installed
Rotatable w/30 day battery life

$14,200.00

$14,419.53

$17,743.00

12

Character Matrix - Digital Cellular
Tranciever - For Future Install
Rotatable w/30 day battery life

$13,400.00

$13,721.69

$17,243.00

13

Character Matrix - Digital Cellular
Tranciever - Installed
Fixed w/15 day battery life

$13,100.00

$13,240.85

$16,697.00

14

Character Matrix - Digital Cellular
Tranciever - For Future Install
Fixed w/15 day battery life

$12,300.00

$12,543.01

$15,993.00

15

Character Matrix - Digital Cellular
Tranciever - Installed
Fixed w/30 day battery life

$13,400.00

$14,419.53

$17,743.00

16

Character Matrix - Digital Cellular
Tranciever - For Future Install
Fixed w/30 day battery life

$12,600.00

$13,721.69

$17,243.00

GROUP 1 TOTAL

$219,000.00

$220,592.88

$284,728.00

Bid Opening Date: July 26, 2016
Bid Tab Posting Date: July 27, 2016



Changeable Message Signs

RFB 2-160726RW

Changeable Message Sign (CMS) - Truck Mounted Solar Powered

No award for items 19, 20, 23 and 24
Signalisation Ver-Mac - Irregular Bid Response

K & K Systems - Irregular Bid Response

Line Item Description American Signal Company K and K Systems, Inc. Signalisation Ver-Mac, Inc.
Full Matrix - Wired Controller
17 LED w/15 day battery life $11,400.00 $8,668.71 $10,750.00
p Full Matrix - Wired Controller
E 18 LED w/30 day battery life $11,400.00 $9,315.71 $11,850.00
Q
;’, GROUP 2 TOTAL $22,800.00 $17,984.42 $22,600.00
2 Full Matrix - Wireless Controller
@ 19 LED w/15 day battery life $11,600.00 NO BID $10,950.00
Full Matrix - Wireless Controller
20 LED w/30 day battery life $11,600.00 NO BID $12,050.00
GROUP 3 TOTAL $23,200.00 $23,000.00
Character Matrix - Wired Controller
Q 21 LED w/15 day battery life $11,400.00 NO BID NO BID
3 Character Matrix - Wired Controller
% 22 LED w/30 day battery life $11,400.00 NO BID NO BID
4 GROUP 4 TOTAL $22,800.00
§ Character Matrix - Wireless Controller
2 23 LED w/15 day battery life $11,600.00 NO BID NO BID
»n Character Matrix - Wireless Controller
24 LED w/30 day battery life $11,600.00 NO BID NO BID
GROUP 5 TOTAL $23,200.00
Pricing for Emergency Alert Light System that may be purchased as an option
Description American Signal Company K and K Systems, Inc. Signalisation Ver-Mac, Inc.
Option Emergency Alert Light System $2,500.00 $900.00 $2,500.00
Bid Award

Bid Opening Date: July 26, 2016
Bid Tab Posting Date: July 27, 2016



