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Thank you for your response to our Request for Quote # CD17030B. Following is a tabulation of all responses which were received. This bid/quote was awarded

to: Leo O’Laughlin, Inc.

Buyer: Sheldon Redel, Procurement Agent
CD17030B REQUEST FOR BID: Cold Mix / Pre-Mix Material

SEE ATTACHED

A total of 245 vendors (25 of which were MBE/WBE/DBE vendors) were sent notification of the online posting of this RFB opportunity. Zero MBE/WBE/DBE

responded.

Our mission is to provide a world-class transportation experience that delights our customers and promotes a prosperous Missouri.



Bid Tab - CD17030B Cold Mix / Pre-Mix Material

Item |Qty |De|ivery Location Leo O'Laughlin Vance Bros Willard Asphalt NB West
Group 1 Per Ton Extended Price Per Ton Extended Price Per Ton [Extended Price Per Ton |Extended Price
2,250 Boonville Maint. $37.25 $83,812.50 $43.50 $97,875.00
750 Fayette $43.19 $32,392.50 $46.50 $34,875.00
Group 1 Total $116,205.00 $132,750.00 no bid no bid
Group 2
1,000 Swiss Stockpile $41.75 $41,750.00 no bid $72.00 $72,000.00
2,000 Fulton Maint $38.65 $77,300.00 $47.25 $94,500.00 $80.00 $160,000.00
Group 2 Total $119,050.00 no bid no bid $232,000.00
Group 3
3,000 Lebanon Maint. $43.65 $130,950.00 $52.00 $156,000.00
Group 3 Total $130,950.00 no bid $156,000.00 no bid
Item |Qty |De|ivery Location Higgins Asphalt Carter Waters Fred Weber
Group 1 Per Ton Extended Price Per Ton Extended Price Per Ton [Extended Price
2,250 Boonville Maint. $71.00 $159,750.00 $94.00 $211,500.00( $123.00 $276,750.00
750 Fayette $72.50 $54,375.00 $96.05 $72,037.50| $124.00 $93,000.00
Group 1 Total $214,125.00 $283,537.50 $369,750.00
Group 2
1,000 Swiss Stockpile $62.05 $62,050.00 $112.25 $112,250.00( $123.00 $123,000.00
2,000 Fulton Maint $62.65 $125,300.00 $101.16 $202,320.00( $120.00 $240,000.00
Group 2 Total $187,350.00 $314,570.00 $363,000.00
Group 3
3,000 Lebanon Maint. $78.00 $234,000.00 $105.53 $316,590.00( $135.00 $405,000.00
Group 3 Total $234,000.00 $316,590.00 $405,000.00




VENDORS

Leo O’Laughlin, Inc.

Attn: Russell O’Laughlin
499 N. 4™ St.

Shelbina, MO 63468
573-588-4151 phone
573-588-4153 fax
rolaughin@olaughlinin.com

Vance Brothers

Attn: Robert Vance

5201 Brighton

PO Box 300107

Kansas City, MO 64130-0107
816-923-4325 phone
816-923-6472 fax
sbrost@vancebrothers.com

Willard Asphalt Paving, Inc.
Attn: Brennon Willard

PO Box 869

Lebanon, MO 65536
417-532-7107 phone
417-532-5962 fax
josh@willardasphalt.com

NB West Contracting Company
Attn: Jim Fitzgerald

2780 Mary Ave.

Brentwood, MO 63144
314-962-3145 phone
314-962-8650 fax
crwest@nbwest.com

Higgins Asphalt Paving, Inc.

Attn: Micah Higgins

35086 Higgins Rd

Tipton, MO 65081
660-252-4540 phone
660-458-6297 fax
micah@higginsasphalt.com

Carter-Waters

Attn: Coby Hess

2440 W. Pennway
Kansas City, MO 64108
816-872-3301 phone
816-221-9562 fax
chess@carter-waters.com

Fred Weber

Attn: Konn Wilson

2320 Creve Coeur Mill Rd
Maryland Heights MO 63043
314-344-0070 phone
314-344-0970 fax
slbartlett@fredweberinc.com
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