Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation for 3-110726RJ for Truck and Trailer Mounted Attenuators

Make and Model

Item 1 Energy Absorption System Model Alpha 100K 8190

NO BID

Item 2 Energy Absorption System Inc. Model safe-Stop 8290

Vendor: HC |

Street: P O Box 681064, 5421 W. 86th. Street
City: Indianapolis

State: IN. 46268

Contact: Todd Thurston

Phone: 800-521-4184

Delivery 30 days ARO

MSRP Discount - 0%

Outright Purchase of one to three units--EACH
Outright Purchase of four to six units-EACH
Outright Purchase of more than six units--EACH
Options
Option A - Hydraulic power system for use with the truck hydraulic system in lieu of electric power
system--EACH
Option B - Charges for ON-Site Installation of one to three units--EACH
Option C - Charges for ON-Site Installation of four to six units--EACH
Option D - Charges for ON-Site Installation of more than six units--EACH

Optional Attachment Hardware for Item 2 Safe Stop TMA 8291CLC
Tailgate Mount Assembly, TMA 8290 part # 3524384-0000--EACH
Underride frame Assy. For Tailgate, part #3524390-0000--EACH

Verticle Tube Support for arrowboard to mount to Tailgate mount
Assy. (two req'd), part # 3524108-0000--EACH

Item 3 Energy Absorption System Inc. Model Safe-Stop 9182

Vendor: HC |

Street: P O Box 681064, 5421 W. 86th. Street
City: Indianapolis

State: IN. 46268

Contact: Todd Thurston

Phone: 800-521-4184

Delivery 30 days ARO

MSRP Discount - 0%

Outright Purchase of one to three units--EACH
Outright Purchase of four to six units-EACH
Outright Purchase of more than six units--EACH
Options
Option A - Hydraulic power system for use with the truck hydraulic system in lieu of electric power
system--EACH
Option B - Charges for ON-Site Installation of one to three units--EACH
Option C - Charges for ON-Site Installation of four to six units--EACH
Option D - Charges for ON-Site Installation of more than six units--EACH

Optional Attachment Hardware for Item 2 Safe Stop TMA 9182CLC
Tailgate Mount Assembly, TMA 8290 part # 3524384-0000--EACH
Underride frame Assy. For Tailgate, part #3524390-0000--EACH

Verticle Tube Support for arrowboard to mount to Tailgate mount
Assy. (two req'd), part # 3524108-0000--EACH

Item 4 Trinity Industries, Model Syro MPS 350-I1l

Vendor: HC |

Street: P O Box 681064, 5421 W. 86th. Street
City: Indianapolis

State: IN. 46268

Contact: Todd Thurston

Phone: 800-521-4184

Delivery 30 days ARO

MSRP Discount - 0%

Outright Purchase of one to three units--EACH

Outright Purchase of four to six units-EACH

Outright Purchase of more than six units--EACH
Options

Bid Tab .xIs

Amount

$17,100.00
$16,740.00
$16,740.00

Less $900.00 From prices above
$3,031.00
$1,891.00
$1,553.00

$3,600.00
No Bid

No Bid

$17,719.00
$17,719.00
$17,719.00

Less $900.00 From prices above
$3,031.00
$1,891.00
$1,553.00

$3,600.00
No Bid

No Bid

$14,850.00
$14,850.00
$14,850.00
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation for 3-110726RJ for Truck and Trailer Mounted Attenuators

Make and Model

Option A - Hydraulic power system for use with the truck hydraulic system in lieu of electric power
system--EACH

Option B - Charges for ON-Site Installation of one to three units--EACH

Option C - Charges for ON-Site Installation of four to six units--EACH

Option D - Charges for ON-Site Installation of more than six units--EACH

Item 5 Barrier Systems, Inc. Model U-MAD 100K

Vendor: PCI Roads, LLC
Street: 14123 42nd Street NE
City: St. Michael

State: MN 55376

Contact: Scott Halek

Phone: 763-497-6100
Delivery 21 days ARO

MSRP Discount - 5%

Outright Purchase of one to three units--EACH
Outright Purchase of four to six units-EACH
Outright Purchase of more than six units--EACH
Options
Option A - Hydraulic power system for use with the truck hydraulic system in lieu of electric power
system--EACH
Option B - Charges for ON-Site Installation of one to three units--EACH
Option C - Charges for ON-Site Installation of four to six units--EACH
Option D - Charges for ON-Site Installation of more than six units--EACH

Optional Attachment Hardware for the U-MAD 100K:

Tailgate Mount Assembly, TMA U-MAD 100K, part # DMS-001
(complete with underride frame assy.)

Item 5 Barrier Systems, Inc. Model U-MAD100 TRV Trailer

Vendor: PCl Roads, LLC
Street: 14123 42nd Street NE
City: St. Michael

State: MN 55376

Contact: Scott Halek

Phone: 763-497-6100
Delivery 21 days ARO

MSRP Discount - 5%

Outright Purchase of one to three units--EACH
Outright Purchase of four to six units-EACH
Outright Purchase of more than six units--EACH
Options
Option A - Hydraulic power system for use with the truck hydraulic system in lieu of electric power
system--EACH
Option B - Charges for ON-Site Installation of one to three units--EACH
Option C - Charges for ON-Site Installation of four to six units--EACH
Option D - Charges for ON-Site Installation of more than six units--EACH

Optional Attachment Hardware for the U-MAD 100K:

Tailgate Mount Assembly, TMA U-MAD 100K, part # DMS-001

Item 6 TrafFix Devices Inc. Model Scorpion C 10,000

Vendor: Traffix Devices Inc.
Street: 160 Avenida La Pata
City: San Clemente

State: CA. 92673

Contact: Julie Edwards
Phone 949-361-5663
Delivery 30 Days ARO
MSRP Discount - 5%

Outright Purchase of one to three units--EACH
Outright Purchase of four to six units--EACH
Outright Purchase of more than six units--EACH
Options
Option A - Hydraulic power system for use with the truck hydraulic system in lieu of electric power
system--EACH
Option B - Charges for ON-Site Installation of one to three units--EACH
Option C - Charges for ON-Site Installation of four to six units--EACH
Option D - Charges for ON-Site Installation of more than six units--EACH

Bid Tab .xIs

Amount

No Bid
$3,031.00
$1,891.00
$1,553.00

$12,140.00
$11,890.00
$11,640.00

Less $1,134.00
$2,000.00
$1,750.00
$1,500.00

$7,672.00

$16,550.00
$16,300.00
$16,050.00

NA
$500.00
$400.00
$300.00

NA

$14,990.86
$14,590.77
$14,380.65

Less $300
$2,400.00
$2,200.00
$2,000.00

From prices above
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation for 3-110726RJ for Truck and Trailer Mounted Attenuators

Make and Model
Note: TMA's will be delivered un-assembled

Item 7 Energy Absorption System Inc. Model Safe-Stop Trailer Mounted Attenuator 9000

Vendor: HC |

Street: P O Box 681064, 5421 W. 86th. Street
City: Indianapolis

State: IN. 46268

Contact: Todd Thurston

Phone: 800-521-4184

Delivery 30 days ARO

MSRP Discount - 0%

Outright Purchase of one to three units--EACH
Outright Purchase of four to six units-EACH
Outright Purchase of more than six units--EACH
Options
Option A - Hydraulic power system for use with the truck hydraulic system in lieu of electric power
system--EACH
Option B - Charges for ON-Site Installation of one to three units--EACH
Option C - Charges for ON-Site Installation of four to six units--EACH
Option D - Charges for ON-Site Installation of more than six units--EACH

Item 8, Safety Trailers Inc. Model TTMA-100 Trailer Mounted Attenuator

Vendor: Roadway Safety Technologies, LLC
Street: 3937 Randall Drive

City: Jefferson City

State: MO 65109

Contact: Robert Lannert

Phone: 573-301-0101

E-mail: roadwaysafety@aol.com

Delivery 30 days ARO

MSRP Discount - 0%

Outright Purchase of one to three units--EACH
Outright Purchase of four to six units-EACH
Outright Purchase of more than six units--EACH
Options
Option A - Hydraulic power system for use with the truck hydraulic system in lieu of electric power
system--EACH
Option B - Charges for ON-Site Installation of one to three units--EACH
Option C - Charges for ON-Site Installation of four to six units--EACH
Option D - Charges for ON-Site Installation of more than six units--EACH

Item 9, Traffix Devices, Inc. Model Scorpion Trailer Mounted Attenuator

Vendor: Traffix Devices Inc.
Street: 160 Avenida La Pata
City: San Clemente

State: CA. 92673

Contact: Julie Edwards
Phone 949-361-5663
Delivery 30 Days ARO
MSRP Discount - 5%

Outright Purchase of one to three units--EACH
Outright Purchase of four to six units-EACH
Outright Purchase of more than six units--EACH
Options
Option A - Hydraulic power system for use with the truck hydraulic system in lieu of electric power
system--EACH
Option B - Charges for ON-Site Installation of one to three units--EACH
Option C - Charges for ON-Site Installation of four to six units--EACH
Option D - Charges for ON-Site Installation of more than six units--EACH

Note: Trailer TMAs will be delivered assembled.

Item 10 Vorteq Trailer TMA Model VTQ-TL-3xxx w/spare tire

Vendor: HC |

Street: P O Box 681064, 5421 W. 86th. Street
City: Indianapolis

State: IN. 46268

Contact: Todd Thurston

Phone: 800-521-4184

Delivery 30 days ARO

MSRP Discount - 0%

Bid Tab .xIs

Amount

$21,044.00
$21,044.00
$21,044.00

NA
$2,485.00
$1,853.00
$1,411.00

$14,400.00
$14,000.00
$13,800.00

NA
$250.00
$175.00
$100.00

$14,950.21
$14,450.43
$13,989.69

$0.00
$500.00
$450.00
$400.00
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation for 3-110726RJ for Truck and Trailer Mounted Attenuators

Make and Model

Outright Purchase of one to three units--EACH
Outright Purchase of four to six units-EACH
Outright Purchase of more than six units--EACH
Options
Option A - Hydraulic power system for use with the truck hydraulic system in lieu of electric power
system--EACH
Option B - Charges for ON-Site Installation of one to three units--EACH
Option C - Charges for ON-Site Installation of four to six units--EACH
Option D - Charges for ON-Site Installation of more than six units--EACH

Optional Items

Vendor: HC |

Street: P O Box 681064, 5421 W. 86th. Street
City: Indianapolis

State: IN. 46268

Contact: Todd Thurston

Phone: 800-521-4184

Arrowboard, 36" x 72", PAR 46, LED by Trafcon (No skid mount frame)

Arrowboard plus wireless remote, 36" x 72", PAR 46, LED by Trafcon (No skid mount frame)
Arrowboard, 48" x 96", PAR 46, LED by Trafcon (No skid mount frame)

Bid Tab .xIs

Amount

$14,250.00
$13,750.00
$13,650.00

NA
$2,485.00
$1,853.00
$1,411.00

$2,429.00
$2,891.00
$2,576.00
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