Missouri Department of Transportation 2/15/2011
General Services Division - Fleet Section
2011 Extension

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  Altorfer, Inc COOP - YES
3520 Moberly Ave.
Hannibal, MO 63401
Contact: Chris Akright
Phone #: (573) 248-7942
cakright@aotorfer.com

***x* Service area includes these counties: Schuyler, Scotland, Clark, Adair, Knox, Lewis, Macon, Shelby, Marion,
Randolph, Monroe, Ralls, Pike

Standard Warranty: 12 months / 1500 Hours Total Machine
Begin Date: On Delivery

Extended Warranty: 36 months / 3000 Hours Total Machine
Begin Date: On Delivery

Item #1: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower NO BID

Item #2: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower NO BID

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 216B3
Base Price: $23,332

Option 1 Cold planer: PC203 $11,592
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 226B3
Base Price: $26,030

Option 1 Cold planer: PC203 $11,592
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order


mailto:cakright@aotorfer.com

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 242B3
Base Price: $30,095

Option 1 Cold planer: $15,302 (PC205)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 247B3
Base Price: $32,389

Option 1 Cold planer: $13,858 (PC204)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 257B3
Base Price: $36,367

Option 1 Cold planer: $15,302 (PC205)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 259BC
Base Price: $37,945

Option 1 Cold planer: $15,302 (PC205)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order



Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 236B3
Base Price: $27,782

Option 1 Cold planer: $13,858 (PC204)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 246C
Base Price: $31,023

Option 1 Cold planer: $18,934 (PC206)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 252B3
Base Price: $30,428

Option 1 Cold planer: $13,858 (PC204)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 256C
Base Price: $33,077

Option 1 Cold planer: $18,934 (PC206)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order



Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 262C
Base Price: $34,153

Option 1 Cold planer: $24,810
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order
Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 277C
Base Price: $46,361

Option 1 Cold planer: $18,934 (PC210)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $150 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 287C
Base Price: $48,950

Option 1 Cold planer: $24,810
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 279C
Base Price: $45,956

Option 1 Cold planer: $18,934 (PC206)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order



Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 289C
Base Price: $48,507

Option 1 Cold planer: $24,810 (PC210)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 272C
Base Price: $37,343

Option 1 Cold planer: $24,810 (PC210)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 297C
Base Price: $53,905

Option 1 Cold planer: $27,810 (PC210)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 299C
Base Price: $53,574

Option 1 Cold planer: $24,810 (PC210)
Option 2 Training Modules:  $120 per student with a 10 student minimum

28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

2011 Extension

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:

Bobcat Company COOP - YES
250 East Beaton Drive

West Fargo, ND 58078-6000

Contact: Mike Kotzbacher

Phone #: (701) 241-8700

mike.kotzbacher@doosan.com

**k*% Service area includes: Statewide

Standard Warranty: 12 months
Begin Date: On Delivery

Extended Warranty: Protection Plus
Begin Date: After standard 12-month warranty expires

Item #1: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 25 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S70
Base Price: $12,454

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $100
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing
Guide Options: 30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after
receipt of order.

2/15/2011


mailto:mike.kotzbacher@doosan.com

Item #2: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 35 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S100 Bobcat T110
Base Price: $15,140 $22,525

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $100
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing
Guide Options: 30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after
receipt of order.

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S130 Bobcat S150 Bobcat S175
Base Price: $17,547 $18,675 $19,590

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $100
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing
Guide Options: 30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after
receipt of order.



Item #4: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S160 Bobcat S185 Bobcat S205
Base Price: $20,498 $21,899 $22,600
Bobcat T180 Bobcat T190
$28,935 $31,086

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $100
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing
Guide Options: 30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after
receipt of order.

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S630 Bobcat S250 Bobcat S650
Base Price: $23,957 Discontinued $25,329
Bobcat T630 Bobcat T650
$32,583 $34,526

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $100
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing
Guide Options: 30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after
receipt of order.



Item #6: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S750 Bobcat T750 Bobcat A750
Base Price: $29,485 $40,485 $36,572

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $100
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing
Guide Options: 30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after
receipt of order.

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Bobcat S770 Bobcat T770
Base Price: $32,057 $42,662

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor
for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $100
per student with a 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing
Guide Options: 30%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after
receipt of order.



Missouri Department of Transportation 2/15/2011
General Services Division - Fleet Section

2011 Extension

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:

Dean Machinery Co COORP - YES, but only in 40-county Cat territory.
5701 E. 87th Street Call vendor for details.

Kansas City, MO 64132-3071

Contact: Steven C. Phillips

Phone #: (816) 753-5300

steve.phillips@deancat.com

**k*% Service area includes: Statewide

Standard Warranty: 12 mos or 1500 Hrs., whichever comes first. Full Machine; Parts & Labor
Begin Date: On Delivery

Extended Warranty:  Full, 36 mo./3,000 Hrs., whichever comes first. Powertrain Only; Parts & Labor
Begin Date: On Delivery

Item #1: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower NO BID

Item #2: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower NO BID

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 216B3 (wheel) Option 1: Cold planer: Caterpillar PC 203 (14")
Base Price: $23,332 $11,592

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $120 with a 10 student minimum.
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: -13% Attachments
-28% Machine Options

For other options, please contact vendor.

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order


mailto:steve.phillips@deancat.com

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 226B3 (wheel) Option 1: Cold planer: Cat PC 203 (14")
Base Price: $26,030 $11,529
Cat 242B3 (wheel) Option 1: Cold planer: Cat PC 205 (18")
$30,095 $15,302
Cat 247B3 (wheel) Option 1: Cold planer: Cat PC 204 (18")
$32,389 $13,858
Cat 257B3 (track) Option 1: Cold planer: Cat PC 205 (18")
$36,367 $15,302

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $120 each student; 10 student minimum.
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: -13% Attachments
-28% Machine Options

For other options, please contact vendor

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 236B3 (wheel) Option 1: Cold planer: Cat PC 204 (18")
Base Price: $27,782 $13,858
Cat 246C (wheel) Option 1: Cold planer: Cat PC 206 (24")
$31,023 $18,934
Cat 252B3 (wheel) Option 1: Cold planer: Cat PC 204 (18")
$30,428 $13,858

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $120 each student; 10 student minimum.
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: -13% Attachments
-28% Machine Options

For other options, please contact vendor

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order



Make & Model:
Base Price:

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 horsepower

Cat 256C (wheel)
$33,077

Cat 262C (wheel)
$34,153

Cat 277C (track)
$46,361

Cat 279C (track)
$45,956

Cat 287C (track)
$48,895

Cat 289C (track)
$48,507

Option 1: Cold planer:
$18,934

Option 1: Cold planer:
$24,810

Option 1: Cold planer:
$18,934

Option 1: Cold planer:
$18,934

Option 1: Cold planer:
$24,810

Option 1: Cold planer:
$24,810

Cat PC 206 (24")

Cat PC 210 (40"

Cat PC 206 (24")

Cat PC 206 (24")

Cat PC 210 (40"

Cat PC 210 (40"

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $120 each student; 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: -13% Attachments
-28% Machine Options

For other options, please contact vendor

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Make & Model:
Base Price:

Cat 272C (wheel)
$37,473

Cat 297C (track)
$53,905

Cat 299C (track)
$53,574

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Option 1: Cold planer:
$24,810

Option 1: Cold planer:
$24,810

Option 1: Cold planer:
$24,810

Cat PC 210 (40"

Cat PC 210 (40"

Cat PC 210 (40"

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $120 each student; 10 student minimum.

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: -13% Attachments
-28% Machine Options

For other options, please contact vendor

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Standard Warranty: 12 Months/Unlimited Hours Beginning on Delivery.

Extended Warranty: Powertrain Only: Parts & Labor, 36 Mo./3,000 Hr. (whichever occurs first).

COOP: Yes, but only in DMC 40 county Cat territory.



Missouri Department of Transportation

General Services Division - Fleet Section
2011 Extension

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID
Vendor Name:  Fabick / Cat COOP - YES, but only in 40-county Cat territory.
One Fabick Drive Call vendor for details.

Fenton, MO 63026
Contact: Chris Burns
Phone #: (636) 680-1309
chris.burns@fabickcat.com

*x%x* Service area includes: Statewide

Standard Warranty: 12 mos or 1500 Hrs., whichever comes first. Full Machine; Parts & Labor
Begin Date: On Delivery

Extended Warranty:  Full, 36 mo./3,000 Hrs., whichever comes first. Powertrain Only; Parts & Labor
Begin Date: On Delivery

Item #1: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower NO BID

Item #2: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower NO BID

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

2/15/2011

Make & Model: Cat 216B3 (wheel) Option 1: Cold planer: Caterpillar PC 203 (14")

Base Price: $23,332 $11,592

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order


mailto:chris.burns@fabickcat.com

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower
Make & Model: Cat 226B3 (wheel) Option 1: Cold planer: Caterpillar PC 203 (18")
Base Price: $26,030 $11,592
Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower
Make & Model: Cat 242B3 Option 1: Cold planer: Caterpillar PC 205
Base Price: $30,095 $15,302
Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order



Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 247B3 Option 1: Cold planer: PC 204
Base Price: $32,389 $13,858

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 257B3 Option 1: Cold planer: PC 205
Base Price: $36,367 $15,302

Option 2:  Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 70-85 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 259B3 Option 1: Cold planer: PC 205
Base Price: $37,945 $15,302

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order



Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 236B3 Option 1: Cold planer: PC 204
Base Price: $27,782 $13,858

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 246C Option 1: Cold planer: PC 206
Base Price: $31,023 $18,934

Option 2:  Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 252B3 Option 1: Cold planer: PC 204
Base Price: $30,428 $13,858

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order



Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 256C Option 1: Cold planer: PC 206
Base Price: $33,077 $18,934

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 262C Option 1: Cold planer: PC 210
Base Price: $34,153 $24,810

Option 2:  Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 277C Option 1: Cold planer: PC 206
Base Price: $46,361 $18,934

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order



Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 287C Option 1: Cold planer: PC 210
Base Price: $48,895 $24,810

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 279C Option 1: Cold planer: PC 206
Base Price: $45,956 $18,934

Option 2:  Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 289C Option 1: Cold planer: PC 210
Base Price: $48,507 $24,810

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order



Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 272C Option 1: Cold planer: PC 210
Base Price: $37,343 $24,810

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 297C Option 1: Cold planer: PC 210
Base Price: $53,905 $24,810

Option 2:  Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Cat 299C Option 1: Cold planer: PC 210
Base Price: $53,574 $24,810

Option 2: Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $150 with an 8 student minimum.
28% discount off MSRP for all Machine Options and 13% for all Work Tool Options
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT Buyer

Delivery will be made approximately 120-140 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation

General Services Division - Fleet Section
2011 Extension

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID
Vendor Name:  Logan Contractors Supply COOP - YES
1325 S. Enterprise Dr Logan Contractors Supply
Olathe, KS 66061 1325 S. Enterprise Dr
Contact: Jon Krueger Olathe, KS 66061
Phone #: (913) 768-1551 Contact: Jon Krueger
jon@logancontractors.com Phone #: (913) 768-1551

jon@logancontractors.com
**x*% Service area includes: Districts 1, 4,7

Standard Warranty: 12 mos. Parts & Labor, 24 mos. Engine
Begin Date: On Delivery

Extended Warranty: Contact vendor or Warren Blanchard for Power Protection Plan details
Begin Date: After Standard Warranty

Item #1: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower
Make & Model: Gehl 1640E
Base Price: $15,390
Option 1: Cold planer: Not available
Option 2: Training Modules: $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 25%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order
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Item #2: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower
Make & Model: Gehl 3640E w/ Bucket 60"
Base Price: $16,960
Option 1: Cold planer: Conegtec AP 300 Il $10,100
Option 2:  Training Modules: $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 25%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower
Make & Model: Gehl 4240E w/ Bucket 62"
Base Price: $18,350
Option 1: Cold planer: Conegtec AP 300 Il $10,100 12" Cutting Width $10,100
Option 2: Training Modules: $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 25%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower
Make & Model: Gehl 4640E I1I w/ Bucket 66"
Base Price: $22,100
Option 1: Cold planer: Coneqtec AP 300 Il $10,100 12" Cutting Width $10,100
Option 2: Training Modules: $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 25%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order



Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower
Make & Model: Gehl 5240 w/ Bucket 66"
Base Price: $23,200
Option 1: Cold planer: Coneqgtec AP 300 Il $10,100 12" Cutting Width $10,100
Option 2:  Training Modules: $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 25%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower
Make & Model: Gehl CTL-65 Track Loader w/ Bucket 66"
Base Price: $34,800
Option 1: Cold planer: Conegtec AP 300 Il $10,100 12" Cutting Width $10,100
Option 2: Training Modules: $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 15%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30-45 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower
Make & Model: Gehl 5640E 111 w/ Bucket 70"
Base Price: $25,670
Option 1: Cold planer: Coneqgtec AP 300 Il $10,100 12" Cutting Width $10,100
Option 2: Training Modules: $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 25%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order



Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower
Make & Model: Gehl CTL-75 Track Loader w/ Bucket 74"
Base Price: $43,805
Option 1: Cold planer: Coneqgtec AP 300 Il $10,100 12" Cutting Width $10,100
Option 2:  Training Modules: $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 25%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Gehl 6640E 11l w/ Bucket 74" Gehl V270 w/ Bucket 70"
Base Price: $28,100 $29,950

Gehl 7810E

$39,485

Option 1: Cold planer for 6640E and Gehl VV270: Coneqgtec AP 300 Il 12" Cutting Width $10,100

Option 1: Cold planer for 7810E: Coneqgtec AP 1000 1l 40" Cutting Width $17,100
(Hi-Flow Required for AP1000)

Option 2: Training Modules: $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 25%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower
Make & Model: Gehl CTL-85 Track Loader w/ Bucket 84"
Base Price: $52,700
Option 1: Cold planer: Coneqgtec AP 300 Il $10,100 12" Cutting Width $10,100
Option 2: Training Modules: $50 per student with a 4 minimum class size
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 25%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 30 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation 2/15/2011
General Services Division - Fleet Section
2011 Extension

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  John Deere Company COOP - YES
1515 5th Ave
Moline, IL 61265
Contact: Sheri Kerr
Phone #: (309) 765-0260
KerrSheriA@JohnDeere.com

*#***% Service area includes: Statewide

Standard Warranty: 12 mos. Full Machine
Begin Date: On Delivery

Extended Warranty: Cost is variable depending on model, type, and time of coverage requested

Item #1: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower NO BID
Item #2: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower NO BID

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 315 (wheel)
Base Price: $20,890.17
Option 1: Cold planer: CP12C $7,698.00

Option 2:  Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 28%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 315 (track)
Base Price: $33,083.77
Option 1: Cold planer: CP12C $8,526.00

Option 2:  Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 20%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
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Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 318D (wheel) JD 320D (wheel)
Base Price: $23,434.04 $25,603.40
Option 1: Cold planer: CP12C $7,698.00

Option 2: Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 28%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 319D (track) JD 323D (wheel)
Base Price: $35,804.95 $39,549.11
Option 1: Cold planer: CP12C $8,526.00 (track) $7,698.00 (wheel)

Option 2: Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 20%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 326D (wheel)
Base Price: $27,932.85
Option 1: Cold planer: CP12C $7,698.00

Option 2: Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 28%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 328D (wheel)
Base Price: $30,636.47
Option 1: Cold planer: CP12C $7,698.00

Option 2: Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 28%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 329D (track)
Base Price: $49,749.89
Option 1: Cold planer: CP18C $14,671.60

Option 2:  Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 20%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 332D (wheel)
Base Price: $35,912.68
Option 1: Cold planer: CP18C $13,229.04

Option 2:  Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 28%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: JD 333D (track)
Base Price: $55,336.79
Option 1: Cold planer: CP18C $14,671.60

Option 2: Training Modules: Contact vendor for additional training options
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 20%
For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation

General Services Division - Fleet Section
2011 Extension

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  Luby Equipment COOP - YES
2300 Cassens Dr.
Fenton, MO 63026
Contact: Jerry Jansen
Phone #: (636) 343-9970
jjansen@Ilubyepuipment.com

**kkk Service area includes: Districts 3, 6, and 10
Standard Warranty: One Year Full Machine. Two Year/2000 Hour Engine
Begin Date: Date of warranty registration

Extended Warranty: Please contact vendor for details

Item #1: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower NO BID

Item #2: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower NO BID

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR130 Case SR150

Base Price: $21,500 (includes base bucket) $22,500 (includes base bucket)
Takeuchi TL220, ROPS Takeuchi TL220, Cab w/ heat and A/C
$30,750 (includes base bucket) $34,400 (includes base bucket)

Option 1: Cold planer Not available

Option 2:  Training Modules: $100 per student with a 1 minimum class size
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order
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Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR175 Case SV185
Base Price: $24,000 (includes base bucket) $24,400 (includes base bucket)

Option 1: Cold planer Not available

Option 2:  Training Modules: $100 per student with a 1 minimum class size
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR200 Case TR270 (track loader)

Base Price: $27,000 (includes base bucket) $37,000 (includes base bucket)
Takeuchi TL230, ROPS Takeuchi TL230C, Cab w/ heat and A/C
$35,550 (includes base bucket) $40,000 (includes base bucket)

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:  Training Modules: $100 per student with a 1 minimum class size

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery for Case equipment will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order

Delivery for Takeuchi equipment will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR220 Case SV250 (vertical lift)
Base Price: $28,450 (includes base bucket) $29,450 (includes base bucket)
Case SR250 Case SV300 (vertical lift)
$30,750 (includes base bucket) $31,000 (includes base bucket)
TR320 (track loader) TV380 (track loader/vertical lift)
$42,400 (includes base bucket) $45,400 (includes base bucket)
Takeuchi TL240, ROPS Takeuchi TL240C, Cab w/ heat and A/C
$42,600 (includes base bucket) $47,300 (includes base bucket)

Takeuchi TL240C, Cab w/ heat and A/C, Hi-flow auxiliary hydraulics
$49,500 (includes base bucket)

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2: Training Modules: $100 per student with a 1 minimum class size

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery for Case equipment will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order

Delivery for Takeuchi equipment will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Takeuchi TL250, ROPS Takeuchi TL250C, Cab w/ heat and A/C
Base Price: $52,000 (includes base bucket) $56,600 (includes base bucket)

Takeuchi TL240C, Cab w/ heat and A/C, Hi-flow auxiliary hydraulics
$58,800 (includes base bucket)

Option 1: Cold planer Call MoDOT buyer or vendor for pricing

Option 2:  Training Modules: $100 per student with a 1 minimum class size

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options 20%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery for Case equipment will be made approximately 90-120 days after receipt of order

Delivery for Takeuchi equipment will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation 2/15/2011
General Services Division - Fleet Section
2011 Extension

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID
Vendor Name:  Pat Kelly Equipment Co. COOP - YES

5920 N. Lindbergh Blvd.

Hazelwood, MO 63042-3124

Contact: Bob Harter

Phone #: (314) 895-9500

sales@patkelly.com

**xxx Service area includes: Statewide
Standard Warranty: 12 months, Unlimited Hours
Begin Date: Day of Delivery
Extended Warranty: Please contact vendor for details

Item #1: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower NO BID

Item #2: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L213; 43 net hp. 1,300 Ib. rated operating load
Base Price: $22,338

Option 1: Cold planer, Conegtec Univeral Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2: Additional training modules ~ $1,000

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 25%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L215; 49 net hp. w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $23,661

Option 1: Cold planer, Conegtec Universal Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2: Additional training modules ~ $1,000

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 25%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order
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Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L218; 57 net hp. w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $25,044

Option 1: Cold planer, Conegtec Universal Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2: Additional training modules ~ $1,000

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 26%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L220; 57 net hp. w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $26,677

Option 1: Cold planer, Conegtec Universal Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2:  Additional training modules ~ $1,000

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 30%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order

Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L223; 68 net hp. w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $28,961

Option 1: Cold planer, Conegtec Universal Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2:  Additional training modules ~ $1,000

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 30%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order



Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland C227; 70 net hp. w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $38,065

Option 1: Cold planer, Conegtec Universal Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2: Additional training modules ~ $1,000

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 26%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L225; 76 net hp. w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $30,297

Option 1: Cold planer, Conegtec Universal Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2:  Additional training modules ~ $1,000

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 30%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland C232; 76 net hp w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $42,671

Option 1: Cold planer, Conegtec Universal Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2: Additional training modules ~ $1,000

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 26%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order



Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland L230: 84 net hp w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $31,755

Option 1: Cold planer, Conegtec Universal Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2: Additional training modules ~ $1,000

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 30%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: New Holland C238: 84 net hp w/ Universal Mechanical Quick Attach
Base Price: $46,219

Option 1: Cold planer, Conegtec Universal Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2:  Additional training modules ~ $1,000

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: New Holland 26%
Paladin Pages: 23%

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made approximately 45-270 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section
2011 Extension

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-100126 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  Victor L Phillips Co COOP - YES
4100 Gardner Avenue
Kansas City, MO 64120
Contact: Greg Knipp
Phone #: (816) 803-9550
kni vipco.com

****%% Service area includes: Districts 1,2, 3,4, 7,and 8
Standard Warranty: Case Equipment 12 Months / Unlimited Hours, Engines 24 Months / 2000 Hours

Standard Warranty: Takeuchi Equipment 24 Months / 2000 Hours

Begin Date: Upon Delivery Extended Warranty: Please contact vendor for details
Item #1: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 25 net horsepower NO BID
Item #2: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 35 net horsepower NO BID

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 45 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR130; 43 net hp.
Base Price: $21,265
Case SR150; 49 net hp. Takeuchi TL220; 52 net hp.
$22,465 $32,950

Option 1: Cold planer, Coneqtec Univeral Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2:  Additional training modules
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 30% off Case options
15% off Takeuchi options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made 60 - 90 days after receipt of order. Liquidated damages will apply.
See terms and Conditions for details.

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 55 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR 175; 57 net hp.
Base Price: $23,525
Case SV185; 57 net hp. Takeuchi TL220; 52 net hp.
$23,985 $32,950

Option 1: Cold planer, Coneqtec Univeral Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2:  Additional training modules
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 30% off Case options
15% off Takeuchi options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made 60 - 90 days after receipt of order. Liquidated damages will apply.
See terms and Conditions for details.
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Item #5: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 65 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR200; 70 net hp. Case TR270; 70 net hp.
Base Price: $26,575 $37,075

Takeuchi TL230; 68.4 net hp.
$38,015
Option 1: Cold planer, Coneqtec Univeral Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2:  Additional training modules
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 30% off Case options
15% off Takeuchi options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made 60 - 90 days after receipt of order. Liquidated damages will apply.
See terms and Conditions for details.

Item #6: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 75 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SR220; 76 net hp. Case SV250; 76 net hp.
Base Price: $28,050 $29,050
Case TR320; 84 net hp. Takeuchi TL240; 83 net hp.
$42,100 $45,365

Option 1: Cold planer, Coneqtec Univeral Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2:  Additional training modules
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 30% off Case options
15% off Takeuchi options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made 60 - 90 days after receipt of order. Liquidated damages will apply.
See terms and Conditions for details.

Item #7: One (1) new skid steer/track loader with min. 85 net horsepower

Make & Model: Case SV300; 84 net hp. Case SR250; 84 net hp.
Base Price: $30,595 $30,345
Case TV380; 84 net hp. Takeuchi TL250; 92 net hp.
$45,190.00 $55,435

Option 1: Cold planer, Coneqtec Univeral Model AP 10011 or equivalent
Option 2:  Additional training modules
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 30% off Case options
15% off Takeuchi options

For other options, please contact vendor or MoDOT buyer.

Delivery will be made 60 - 90 days after receipt of order. Liquidated damages will apply.
See terms and Conditions for details.
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VENDOR INFORMATION

Name:

Contact name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Name:

Contact name:

Address Line:
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Telephone #:

Name:

Contact name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Name:

Contact name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Name:

Contact name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Altorfer, Inc

3520 Moberly Ave.
Hannibal, MO 63401
Contact: Chris Akright
Phone #: (573) 248-7942
cakright@aotorfer.com

Bobcat Company

250 East Beaton Drive

West Fargo, ND 58078-6000
Contact: Mike Kotzbacher
Phone #: (701) 241-8700
mike.kotzbacher@doosan.com

Pat Kelly Equipment Co.

5920 N. Lindbergh Blvd.
Hazelwood, MO 63042-3124
Contact: Rich Sahrman
Phone #: (314) 895-9500
sales@patkelly.com

Dean Machinery Co

5701 E. 87th Street

Kansas City, MO 64132-3071
Contact: Steven C. Phillips
Phone #: (816) 753-5300
steve.phillips@deancat.com

Fabick / Cat

One Fabick Drive
Fenton, MO 63026
Contact: Chris Burns
Phone #: (636) 680-1309

chris.burns@fabickcat.com

Multiple Award
2011 Extension

John Deere Company
1515 5th Ave

Moline, IL 61265
Contact: Richard Murga
Phone #: (309) 765-0260

MurgaRichard@JohnDeere.com

Luby Equipment

2625 North24th Street
Quincy, IL 62305
Contact: Jerry Jansen
217-222-5454
jlansen@Ilubyequipment.com

Victor L Phillips Co
4100 Gardner Avenue
Kansas City, MO 64120
Contact: Susan Parman
Phone #: (816) 241-9290

sparman@vlpco.com

Logan Contractors Supply
1325 S. Enterprise Dr
Olathe, KS 66061
Contact: Jon Krueger
Phone #: (913) 768-1551
jon@logancontractors.com
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