Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-070124 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  Bobcat Company COOP - YES
250 East Beaton Drive

West Fargo, ND 58078-6000
Contact: Mike Kotzbacher

Phone #: (701) 241-8746

Bobcat prices good until December 31, 2009

***** Service area includes: Statewide

Item #1: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 45 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: Bobcat S100 Option 1 Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $200 per
Base Price: $13,305.00 student with a 10 student minimum.
Make & Model: Bobcat S130 Option 1 Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $200 per
Base Price: $15,284.00 student with a 10 student minimum.
Make & Model: Bobcat S150 Complete set of manuals: $140.00
Base Price: $16,493.00
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing
Make & Model: Bobcat S160 Guide Options: 36%
Base Price: $18,189.00
For other options, please contact Warren Blanchard at
Make & Model: Bobcat S175 573-526-2529, or warren.blanchard@modot.mo.gov
Base Price: $16,838.00
Delivery will be made approximately 45-60 days after
Make & Model: Bobcat S185 receipt of order.
Base Price: $18,918.00
Make & Model: Bobcat S205
Base Price: $20,500.00



Item #2: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

No Bid

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 70 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

No Bid

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: Bobcat S220 Option 1 Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $200 per
Base Price: $22,526.00 student with a 10 student minimum.
Make & Model: Bobcat S250 Complete set of manuals: $140.00
Base Price: $23,101.00
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing
Make & Model: Bobcat S300 Guide Options: 36%
Base Price: $25,143.00
For other options, please contact Warren Blanchard at
Make & Model: Bobcat S330 573-526-2529, or warren.blanchard@modot.mo.gov
Base Price: $29,309.00

Other Bobcat models added to contract:

Delivery will be made approximately 45-60 days after
receipt of order.

Make & Model: Bobcat T140 Make & Model: Bobcat T180
Base Price: $25,530.00 Base Price: $28,507.00
Make & Model: Bobcat T190 Make & Model: Bobcat T250
Base Price: $29,256.00 Base Price: $35,461.00
Make & Model: Bobcat T300 Make & Model: Bobcat T320
Base Price: $39,656.00 Base Price: $42,323.00
Make & Model: Bobcat A300 Make & Model: Bobcat MT52
Base Price: $34,463.00 Base Price: $12,741.00
Make & Model: Bobcat MT55

Base Price: $13,550.00



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-070124 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID
Vendor Name:  Dean Machinery Co COORP - YES, but only in 40-county Cat territory.
1201 W. 31st Street Call vendor for details.

Kansas City, MO 64108-3534
Contact: Steven C. Phillips
Phone #: (816) 753-5300

***** Service area includes: Statewide

Item #1: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 45 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Makes & Models: Cat 216B2 Cat 226B2
Base Price: $25,520.00 $27,485.00

Option 1 Training Modules:  $100 per student with a 4 student minimum
Vendor supplied options: PC 203 Cold Planer 14" $10,740.00
Hydraulic quick coupler $646.50
HD battery $35.40
Block heater $62.85
Beacon $143.00
Rear working lights $ Included
% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 16%

For other options, please contact Warren Blanchard at 573-526-2529, or warren.blanchard@modot.mo.gov

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order

Item #2: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

No Bid



Item #3: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 70 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: Cat 236B2
Base Price: $30,425.00

Option 1 Training Modules:  $100 per student with a 4 student minimum

Vendor supplied options: PC 204 Cold Planer 18" $12,800.00
Hydraulic quick coupler $646.50
HD battery $35.40
Block heater $62.85
Beacon $143.00
Rear working lights $ Included

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: Cat 256C with 72" bucket
Base Price: $35,757.00

Option 1 Training Modules:  $100 per student with a 4 student minimum
Vendor supplied options: PC 210 Cold Planer 40" $25,785.00
Hydraulic quick coupler $646.50

Block heater $127.85
Beacon $143.00

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 16%
For other options, please contact Warren Blanchard at 573-526-2529, or warren.blanchard@modot.mo.gov

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-070124 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  John Deere Company COOP - YES Vendor supplied options:
1515 5th Ave 8 Button Control ~ $455.25
Moline, IL 61265 High Flow $1,377.00
Contact: Keri Suiter Wiring Harness $108.75

Phone #: (309) 765-0260

****% Service area includes: Statewide

Item #1: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 45 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: John Deere 313
Base Price: $17,936.25

Make & Model: John Deere 315
Base Price: $19,344.00

Make & Model: John Deere 317
Base Price: $21,262.50

Make & Model: John Deere CT322 Compact Track Loader
Base Price: $36,368.64

Option 1 Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $175 per student per day with a minimum of $2500 per week.
At John Deere facility: $150 per student per day.
Product Safety, Maintenance & Operation Video (part# DGDVD05974) FOR $46.70

Vendor supplied options: CP12C Cold Planer $8,002.50
CP24C Cold Planer $16,582.50

Item #2: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: John Deere 320
Base Price: $23,224.50

Option 1Training Modules At MoDOT facility: $175 per student per day with @ minimum of $2500 per week.
At John Deere facility: $150 per student per day.
Product Safety, Maintenance & Operation Video (part# DGDVD05974) FOR $46.70

Vendor supplied options: CP12C Cold Planer $8,002.50

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 25%
For other options, please contact Warren Blanchard at 573-526-2529, or warren.blanchard@modot.mo.gov

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Item #3: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 70 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: John Deere 325
Base Price: $26,970.75

Option 1Training Modules At MoDOT facility: $175 per student per day with a minimum of $2500 per week.
At John Deere facility: $150 per student per day.

Product Safety, Maintenance & Operation Video (part# DGDVD05974) FOR $46.70
Vendor supplied options CP18C Cold Planer (Includes high flow option on skid steer & controls) $13,942.00

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: John Deere 328
Base Price: $29,055.00

Make & Model: John Deere CT332 Compact Track Loader
Base Price: $48,363.60

Option 1Training Modules At MoDOT facility: $175 per student per day with a minimum of $2500 per week.
At John Deere facility: $150 per student per day.
Product Safety, Maintenance & Operation Video (part# DGDVD05974) FOR $46.70

Vendor supplied options CP18C Cold Planer (Includes high flow option on skid steer & controls) $13,942.00
CP30C Cold Planer  $18,480.00

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 25%
For other options, please contact Warren Blanchard at 573-526-2529, or warren.blanchard@modot.mo.gov

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-070124 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  John Fabick Tractor Co. COOP - YES

One Fabick Drive
Fenton, MO 63026
Contact: Rod Byers

Phone #: (636) 343-5900

***** Service area includes: Statewide

Item #1: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 45 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: Cat 216B2
Base Price: $25,520.00

Option 1 Training Modules:
Vendor supplied options:

Make & Model: Cat 226B2
Base Price: $27,485.00

Option 1 Training Modules:
Vendor supplied options:

At MoDOT facility: $100 per student with a 4 student minimum.
PC203 Cold Planer 14" $10,740.00

Hydraulic quick coupler $646.50

HD battery $35.40

Block heater $62.85

Beacon $143.00

Rear Working Lights $ Included

At MoDOT facility: $100 per student with a 4 student minimum.
PC203 Cold Planer 14" $10,740.00

Hydraulic quick coupler $646.50

HD battery $35.40

Block heater $62.85

Beacon $143.00

Rear Working Lights $ Included

Item #2: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

No Bid

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 16%

For other options, please contact Warren Blanchard at 573-526-2529, or warren.blanchard@modot.mo.gov

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order.



Item #3: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 70 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: Cat 236B2
Base Price: $30,425.00

Option 1 Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $100 per student with a 4 student minimum.
Vendor supplied options: PC204 Cold Planer 18" $12,800.00

Hydraulic quick coupler $646.00

HD battery $35.40

Block heater $62.85

Beacon $143.00

Rear Working Lights $ Included

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: Cat 256C
Base Price: $35,785.00

Option 1 Training Modules: At MoDOT facility: $100 per student with a 4 student minimum.
Vendor supplied options: PC210 Cold Planer 40" $25,757.00

Hydraulic quick coupler $646.00
Block heater $127.85

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 16%
For other options, please contact Warren Blanchard at 573-526-2529, or warren.blanchard@modot.mo.gov

Delivery will be made approximately 60-90 days after receipt of order.



Missouri Department of Transportation
General Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-070124 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  Logan Contractors Supply COOP - YES
1325 S. Enterprise Dr
Olathe, KS 66061
Contact: Jon Krueger
Phone #: (913) 768-1551

*x*%* GService area includes: Districts 1, 4, 7

Item #1: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 45 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: Gehl 4240E
Base Price: $18,465.00
Option 1 Training Modules: $100 per student with a 5 student minimum

Vendor supplied options: Not recommended for planer use

Make & Model: Gehl 4640E Turbo
Base Price: $21,720.00
Option 1 Training Modules: $100 per student with a 5 student minimum

Vendor supplied options: Hi flow hydraulics for planer use $1,095.00
FFC Hi flow planer model LAF S420 20" w/ mount $14,550.00

Joystick Pilot Controls $1,340.00

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 22%
For other options, please contact Warren Blanchard at 573-526-2529, or warren.blanchard@modot.mo.gov

Delivery will be made approximately 30-45 days after receipt of order



Item #2: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: Gehl 5240E Turbo
Base Price: $22,685.00
Option 1 Training Modules: $100 per student with a 5 student minimum

Vendor supplied options: Hi flow hydraulics for planer use $1,095.00
FFC Hi flow planer model LAF S420 20" w/ mount $14,550.00

Joystick Pilot Controls $1,340.00

Item #3: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 70 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: Gehl 5640E Turbo
Base Price: $25,460.00
Option 1 Training Modules: $100 per student with a 5 student minimum

Vendor supplied options: Hi flow hydraulics for planer use $1,095.00
FFC Hi flow planer model LAF S420 20" w/ mount $14,550.00

Joystick Pilot Controls $1,340.00

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Make & Model: Gehl 6640E Turbo
Base Price: $27,895.00
Option 1 Training Modules: $100 per student with a 5 student minimum

Vendor supplied options: Hi flow hydraulics for planer use $1,095.00
FFC Hi flow planer model LAF S420 20" w/ mount $14,550.00

Joystick Pilot Controls $1,340.00

% discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: 22%

For other options, please contact Warren Blanchard at 573-526-2529, or warren.blanchard@modot.mo.gov

Delivery will be made approximately 30-45 days after receipt of order



Missouri Department of Transportation

General

Services Division - Fleet Section

Bid Tabulation on Bid Request # 3-070124 for Skid Steers MULTIPLE AWARD BID

Vendor Name:  Pat Kelly Equipment Co COOP - YES

5920 N Lindbergh Blvd
Hazelwood, MO 63042-3124
Contact: Rich Sahrman
Phone #: (314) 895-9500

***** Service area includes: Statewide

Item #1:

Item #2:

One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 45 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Makes & Models: New Holland L170
Base Price: $22,202.00

Option 1 Training Modules:  $200 per student with a 6 student minimum. Additional training modules $1,200
% discount off MSRP for all Loadstar attachments: 18%
For other options, please contact Warren Blanchard at 573-526-2529, or warren.blanchard@modot.mo.gov

NOTE: Options must be ordered with machine

Delivery will be made approximately 90-270 days after receipt of order

One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 65 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Makes & Models: New Holland L180
Base Price: $26,037.00

Option 1 Training Modules:  $200 per student with a 6 student minimum. Additional training modules $1,200
% discount off MSRP for all Loadstar attachments: 18%
For other options, please contact Warren Blanchard at 573-526-2529, or warren.blanchard@modot.mo.gov

NOTE: Options must be ordered with machine



Item #3: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 70 net horsepower with universal

See Item 4

Item #4: One (1) new skid steer loader with min. 75 net horsepower with universal
quick detachable couplings by Coneqtec or equivalent

Makes & Models: New Holland L185
Base Price: $27,701.00

Option 1 Training Modules:  $200 per student with a 6 student minimum. Additional training modules $1,200
% discount off MSRP for all Loadstar attachments: 18%
For other options, please contact Warren Blanchard at 573-526-2529, or warren.blanchard@modot.mo.gov

NOTE: Options must be ordered with machine



VENDOR INFORMATION

Name:

Contact name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Name:

Contact name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Name:

Contact name:

Address Line:
Address Line:
Telephone #:

Pat Kelly Equipment Co

Rich Sahrman

5920 N Lindbergh Blvd
Hazelwood, MO 63024-3124
314-895-9500

Bobcat Company

Mike Kotzbacher

250 East Beaton Drive

West Fargo, ND 58078-6000
701-241-8746

Dean Machinery Co.

Steve Phillips

1201 W. 31st Street

Kansas City, MO 64108-3534
816-753-5300

Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-070124 Skid Steers

Opened on 1/24/07
Multiple Award

John Deere Construction Retail Sales
Keri Suiter

1515 5th Ave.

Moline, IL 61265

309-765-0260

John Fabick Tractor Co.
Rod Byers

One Fabick Drive
Fenton, MO 63026
636-343-5900

Logan Contractors Supply
Jon Krueger

1325 S. Enterprise Dr.
Olathe, KS 66061
913-768-1551
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