
Item #1 20 Ton Hydraulic Truck Mounted Crane
Vendor Crane Make/Model Price Opt. 1 Opt. 2 C/C Make/Model Price Total W/O Opt. ARO Coop MSRP

International Truck / Busey Tk Mantex 2801C LMI Non-Responsive
Busey Truck Equipment Manitex 2801C LMI Non-Responsive
Busey Truck Equipment Manitex 2801C LMI Non-Responsive
Custom Truck National 680H $104,900.00 $10,000.00 $3,000.00 2009 Freightliner M2-112 $89,000.00 $193,900.00 120-150 Yes 0%
International Truck / Pat Kelly Eq.National 680H $122,436.00 $10,638.00 $4,448.00 2008 IHC 7600 SBA 6x4 $71,987.00 $195,423.00 150-365 Yes 21%
Busey Truck Equipment Manitex 2801C LMI Non-Responsive
Pat Kelly Equipment Co. National 680H $122,436.00 $10,638.00 $4,448.00 2008 Sterling LT 9500 $82,359.00 $204,795.00 150-365 Yes 21%
Altec Industries Altec AC26-95B Non-Responsive
Kranz Body No Bid
Custom Truck (option) National 680H $104,900.00 $10,000.00 $3,000.00 2007 Freightliner ( New) $76,800.00 $181,700.00 90-120 Yes 0%

Notes
Manitex crane does not meet specification 
Altec crane does not meet specification

Bold denotes awarded bid

Item #2 Knuckle Boom Crane
Vendor Crane Make/Model Price Opt. 1 Opt. 2 ARO Coop MSRP

Hiab H122-4.5 HiDuo $55,796.00 No bid No Bid 90-120 N/A N/A
Busey Truck Equipment Cormach 12,000 E4 $57,995.00 $16,768.00 $1,525.00 100-120 yes 20%
Custom Truck IMT 12/89 K4 Non-Responsive 120-160 yes 15%
Custom Truck IMT 16/117 K4 $76,032.00 No Bid $1,200.00 120-160 yes 15%
Pat Kelly National 38/45 Non-Responsive 150-365 Yes N/A
Kranz Body IMT 12/89 Non-Responsive 120-150 yes 5%
Kranz Body IMT 16/117 $113,800.00 $16,000.00 $1,200.00 120-150 yes 5%

Notes
IMT 12/89 crane does not meet specification
National 38/45 crane does not meet specification 

Bold denotes awarded bid
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