
Item #1  (LEASE Tractors)

Two One Two Three Cost End of Cost End of Cost End of Order by to
Vendor Make/Model HP Weeks Month Months Months Per/Hour Lease Price Per/Hour Lease Price Per/Hour Lease Price rec Mar 1st

St. Joseph Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 4320 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09

JD 4520 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 4720 56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09

JD 5065M 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 5075M 60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 5085M 70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 5095M 80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 6230P 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 6230S 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 6100D 82 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 5083E 65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 5093E 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 5101E 82 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 5055D 45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 5055E 45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 5065E 53 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 5075E 61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09

S&H Farm Supply Inc. NO BID
Vestal Equipment NO BID
Lauf Equipment NO BID
Golden Valley Tractor NO BID

Payment Upfront
8 Month 12 Month 24 Month

Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Item #1  (LEASE Tractors)

Cost Semi (2) End of Cost Monthly End of Cost Semi (2) 
Vendor Make/Model HP Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s

St. Joseph Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 4320 40 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75

JD 4520 50 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 4720 56 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75

JD 5065M 50 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 5075M 60 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 5085M 70 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 5095M 80 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 6230P 75 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 6230S 75 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 6100D 82 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 5083E 65 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 5093E 75 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 5101E 82 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 5055D 45 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 5055E 45 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 5065E 53 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75
JD 5075E 61 $11.25 $1,687.50 No Bid $11.25 $421.88 No Bid $11.25 $1,968.75

S&H Farm Supply Inc. NO BID
Vestal Equipment NO BID
Lauf Equipment NO BID
Golden Valley Tractor NO BID

Vendor Make/Model HP 1a 1b 1c(deduct) 1d 1e 1f 1g 1h
St. Joseph Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 4320 40 $0.00 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 STD $5.00/per hr. $250.00

JD 4520 50 $0.00 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 STD $5.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 4720 56 $0.00 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 STD $5.00/per hr. $250.00

JD 5065M 50 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $5.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 5075M 60 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $5.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 5085M 70 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $5.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 5095M 80 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $5.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 6230P 75 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $6.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 6230S 75 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $6.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 6100D 82 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $6.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 5083E 65 $0.00 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 NA $5.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 5093E 75 $0.00 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 NA $5.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 5101E 82 $0.00 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 NA $5.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 5055D 45 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $5.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 5055E 45 NA NA NA $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $5.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 5065E 53 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $5.00/per hr. $250.00
JD 5075E 61 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $5.00/per hr. $250.00

S&H Farm Supply Inc. NO BID
Vestal Equipment NO BID
Lauf Equipment NO BID

Installments
8 Month (300 Hours)

Option Pricing
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Golden Valley Tractor NO BID

See Option Page for Description
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Item #2  (LEASE Tractors)

Two One Two Three Cost End of Cost End of Cost End of Order by to
Vendor Make/Model HP Weeks Month Months Months Per/Hour Lease Price Per/Hour Lease Price Per/Hour Lease Price rec Mar 1st

St. Joseph Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 6330P 85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09

JD 6330S 85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 6430P 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid 10/01/09
JD 6430S 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 6115D 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 6130D 105 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid 14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 6140D 115 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid 14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 5105M 90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid 14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09

S&H Farm Supply Inc. New Holland T5060 105 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 08/15/09
New Holland T5070 110 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 08/15/09
New Holland T6020 110 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 08/15/09

Vestal Equipment Case IH MXU110 90 $14.50 $14.50 $14.50 $14.50 $14.50 $53,000.00 $14.50 $52,500.00 $14.50 $50,000.00 8/15/09
Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 5460 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 $52,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12/01/09
Golden Valley Tractor New Holland T6020 90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 $65,500.00 No Bid No Bid 08/01/09

Payment Upfront
8 Month 12 Month 24 Month
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Item #2  (LEASE Tractors)

Cost Semi (2) End of Cost Monthly End of Cost Semi (2) 
Vendor Make/Model HP Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s

St. Joseph Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 6330P 85 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75

JD 6330S 85 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
JD 6430P 95 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
JD 6430S 95 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
JD 6115D 95 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
JD 6130D 105 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
JD 6140D 115 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
JD 5105M 90 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75

S&H Farm Supply Inc. New Holland T5060 105 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
New Holland T5070 110 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
New Holland T6020 110 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75

Vestal Equipment Case IH MXU110 90 $14.50 $2,175.00 $53,000.00 $14.50 $544.00 $53,000.00 $14.50 $2,538.00
Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 5460 95 $15.00 $2,250.00 $52,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Golden Valley Tractor New Holland T6020 90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Month (300 Hours)
Installments
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Item #2  (LEASE Tractors)

Vendor Make/Model HP 2a 2b 2c(deduct) 2d 2e 2f 2g 2h
St. Joseph Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 6330P 85 NA NA NA $0.00 $0.00 NA $6.00/hr NA

JD 6330S 85 NA NA NA $0.00 $0.00 NA $6.00/hr NA
JD 6430P 95 NA NA NA $0.00 $0.00 NA $6.00/hr NA
JD 6430S 95 NA NA NA $0.00 $0.00 NA $6.00/hr NA
JD 6115D 95 NA NA NA $0.00 $0.00 NA $6.00/hr NA
JD 6130D 105 NA NA NA $0.00 $0.00 NA $6.00/hr NA
JD 6140D 115 NA NA NA $0.00 $0.00 NA $6.00/hr NA
JD 5105M 90 NA NA NA $0.00 $0.00 NA $6.00/hr NA

S&H Farm Supply Inc. New Holland T5060 105 NA NA NA $100/ea. $1.00/lb. NA $7.00/hr NA
New Holland T5070 110 NA NA NA $100/ea. $1.00/lb. NA $7.00/hr NA
New Holland T6020 110 NA NA NA $100/ea. $1.00/lb. NA $7.00/hr NA

Vestal Equipment Case IH MXU110 90 -$6,500.00 NA -$7,600.00 $100.00 $600.00 NA $7,500.00 NA
Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 5460 95 -$8,000.00 NA -$6,500.00 $100.00 $1.00/per lb. NA $8,500.00 $4,000.00
Golden Valley Tractor New Holland T6020 90 NA NA NA $0.00 $0.00 NA $6.00/hr NA

Option Pricing

See Option Page for Description
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Item #3  (LEASE Tractors)

Two One Two Three Cost End of Cost End of Cost End of Order by to
Vendor Make/Model HP Weeks Month Months Months Per/Hour Lease Price Per/Hour Lease Price Per/Hour Lease Price rec Mar 1st

St. Joseph Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 7130P 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09

JD 7130S 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 7230P 125 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 7230S 110 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 7330P 125 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 7330S 125 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09
JD 7430P 140 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10/01/09

S&H Farm Supply Inc. New Holland T6030 115 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 08/15/09
New Holland T6050 125 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 08/15/09

Vestal Equipment Case - MXU115 95 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $54,500.00 $15.00 $54,000.00 $15.00 $51,000.00 08/15/09
Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 5465 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 $55,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12/01/09
Golden Valley Tractor New Holland T6050 105 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 $65,500.00 No Bid No Bid 08/01/09

New Holland T6030 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 $65,500.00 No Bid No Bid 01-Aug-09

Payment Upfront
8 Month 12 Month 24 Month
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Item #3  (LEASE Tractors)

Cost Semi (2) End of Cost Monthly End of Cost Semi (2) 
Vendor Make/Model HP Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s

St. Joseph Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 7130P 100 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75

JD 7130S 100 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
JD 7230P 125 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
JD 7230S 110 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
JD 7330P 125 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
JD 7330S 125 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
JD 7430P 140 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75

S&H Farm Supply Inc. New Holland T6030 115 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75
New Holland T6050 125 $14.25 $2,137.50 No Bid $14.25 $534.38 No Bid $14.25 $2,493.75

Vestal Equipment Case - MXU115 95 $15.00 $2,250.00 $54,500.00 $15.00 $563.00 $54,500.00 $15.00 $2,625.00
Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 5465 100 $15.00 $2,250.00 $2,250.00 $55,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Golden Valley Tractor New Holland T6050 105 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

New Holland T6030   95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Month (300 Hours)
Installments

Page 8 of 45 Bid Tab Lease-Purch Tractors



Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Item #3  (LEASE Tractors)

Vendor Make/Model HP 3a 3b 3c 3d 3e 3f 3g 3h
St. Joseph Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 7130P 100 NA NA NA $0 $0 NA $6.00/hr NA

JD 7130S 100 NA NA NA $0 $0 NA $6.00/hr NA
JD 7230P 125 NA NA NA $0 $0 NA $6.00/hr NA
JD 7230S 110 NA NA NA $0 $0 NA $6.00/hr NA
JD 7330P 125 NA NA NA $0 $0 NA $6.00/hr NA
JD 7330S 125 NA NA NA $0 $0 NA $6.00/hr NA
JD 7430P 140 NA NA NA $0 $0 NA $6.00/hr NA

S&H Farm Supply Inc. New Holland T6030 115 NA NA NA $100/Ea $1.00/lb. NA $7.00/hr NA
New Holland T6050 125 NA NA NA $100/Ea $1.00/lb. NA $7.00/hr NA

Vestal Equipment Case - MXU115 95 -$6,500 NA -$7,600 $100 $600 NA $7,500 NA
Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 5465 100 -$8,000 NA -$6,500 $100 $1.00/lb. NA $9,000 $4,000
Golden Valley Tractor New Holland T6050 105 NA NA NA $0 $0 NA $6.00/hr NA

New Holland T6030  95 NA NA NA $0 $0 NA $6.00/hr NA

Option Pricing

See Option Page for Description
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Item #4  (PURCHASE Tractors)

Base
Vendor Make/Model HP Price 4a 4b 4c 4d 4e 4f 4g

St. Joseph Tractor New Holland T5050 95 $54,574.00 Included Std NA Included $746.00 NA $7,750.00
John Deere Company JD 4320 40 $23,263.60 $6,174.35 NA NA $72.45 $430.00 Std $3,654.20

JD 4520 50 $24,680.40 $6,515.67 NA NA $72.45 $430.00 Std $3,654.20
JD 4720 56 $27,657.93 $5,851.54 NA NA $72.45 $430.00 Std $3,654.20

JD 5055D 45 $15,873.85 NA NA STD $76.50 $430.00 $35.75 $3,676.75
JD 5055E 45 $21,719.30 NA NA NA $76.50 $430.00 $35.75 $4,300.45
JD 5065E 53 $23,340.25 NA NA -$5,291.25 $76.50 $430.00 $35.75 $4,673.90
JD 5075E 61 $25,400.65 NA NA -$5,291.25 $76.50 $430.00 $35.75 $4,673.90
JD 5101E 82 $38,182.80 STD NA NA $72.00 $227.20 $35.75 $5,214.26
JD 5065M 50 $27,965.25 $7,592.97 NA -$5,230.61 $69.30 $218.68 $35.75 $3,367.21
JD 5075M 60 $30,205.95 $7,592.97 NA -$5,230.61 $69.30 $218.68 $35.75 $3,367.21
JD 5085M 70 $32,637.61 $7,592.97 NA -$5,230.61 $69.30 $218.68 $35.75 $3,367.21
JD 5095M 80 $36,826.41 $7,592.97 NA -$5,590.97 $69.30 $218.68 $35.75 $3,367.21
JD 5083E 65 $32,551.60 STD NA NA $72.00 $227.20 $35.75 $5,052.56
JD 5093E 75 $35,500.40 STD NA NA $72.00 $227.20 $35.75 $5,052.56
JD 6100D 82 $31,953.65 $5,473.75 NA -$4,567.50 $65.25 $271.88 NA $5,856.62
JD 6230S 75 $36,607.53 $7,044.82 NA -$5,912.38 $65.25 $941.78 NA $6,386.07
JD 6230P 75 $49,414.03 STD NA -$6,290.83 $65.25 $941.78 NA $7,473.57

S&H Farm Supply Inc. New Holland TT60A 56 $19,349.00 NA NA -$3,500.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. Included $5,495.00
New Holland TT75A 75 $20,849.00 NA NA -$3,500.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. Included $5,495.00
New Holland T4030 76 $28,298.00 $6,750.00 NA -$3,900.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. NA $6,950.00

New Holland TD5030 75 $25,198.00 $6,975.00 NA -$3,390.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. NA $6,740.00
New Holland TD5050 93 $28,998.00 $6,975.00 NA -$3,390.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. NA $6,940.00

Vestal Equipment Case IH Farmall 65L 50 $25,000.00 $6,500.00 Std -$4,200.00 $100.00 $385.00 No Charge $6,500.00
Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 1652 41 $20,700.00 $7,500.00 NA NA $100.00 $1.00/lb. Included $4,000.00

Massey Ferguson 1655 43 $20,800.00 $7,500.00 NA NA $100.00 $1.00/lb. Included $4,000.00
Massey Ferguson 1660 46 $22,795.00 $7,500.00 NA NA $100.00 $1.00/lb. Included $4,000.00
Massey Ferguson 2615 42 $18,900.00 NA Included -$3,200.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. Included $5,500.00
Massey Ferguson 2625 52 $20,900.00 NA Included -$3,200.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. Included $5,500.00
Massey Ferguson 573 60 $24,900.00 $7,500.00 NA -$4,000.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $7,500.00
Massey Ferguson 583 70 $26,900.00 $7,500.00 NA -$4,000.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $7,500.00
Massey Ferguson 593 77 $28,950.00 $7,500.00 NA -$4,000.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $7,500.00
Massey Ferguson 596 85 $30,400.00 $7,500.00 NA -$4,000.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $7,500.00
Massey Ferguson 5445 70 $46,700.00 $8,000.00 NA -$5,000.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $8,500.00

Golden Valley Tractor NO BID

Option Pricing
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Item #5  (PURCHASE Tractors)

Base
Vendor Make/Model HP Price 5a 5b 5c 5d 5e 5f 5g

St. Joseph Tractor New Holland T5050 95 $54,574.00 NA NA Included $746.00 NA $7,750.00 NA
John Deere Company JD 5105M 90 $47,227.03 -$6,568.33 NA $69.30 $218.68 $57.73 $5,858.93 NA

JD 6130D 105 $43,431.10 -$4,248.75 NA $65.25 $271.88 NA $5,856.62 NA
JD 6140D 115 $46,931.78 -$4,223.75 NA $65.25 $271.88 NA $5,856.62 NA
JD 6115D 95 $39,849.25 -$4,223.75 -$4,567.50 $65.25 $271.88 NA $5,856.62 NA
JD 6330S 85 $45,218.25 -$5,272.82 -$6,391.60 $65.25 $941.78 NA $7,252.32 NA
JD 6430S 95 $47,964.55 -$6,193.57 -$7,443.57 $65.25 $941.78 NA $7,252.32 NA
JD 6330P 85 $51,267.85 NA -$6,290.82 $65.25 $941.78 NA $9,701.37 NA
JD 6430P 95 $53,877.13 NA -$6,486.58 $65.25 $941.78 NA $9,701.37 NA

S&H Farm Supply Inc. New Holland T5060 105 $39,998.00 NA -$4,930.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. NA $8,495.00 NA
New Holland T5070 110 $42,998.00 NA -$4,930.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. NA $8,495.00 NA

New Holland T6020 Delta 110 $48,875.00 -$5,900.00 -$6,000.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. NA $8,495.00 NA
New Holland T6020 Plus 110 $53,998.00 NA -$6,000.00 $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. NA $8,495.00 NA

Vestal Equipment CASE IH MXU110 90 $51,300.00 -$6,500.00 -$7,600.00 $100.00 $600.00 NA $7,500.00 NA
Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 5455 85 $48,900.00 -$8,000.00 -$6,000.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $8,500.00 $4,000.00

Massey Ferguson 5460 95 $52,700.00 -$8,000.00 -$6,000.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $8,500.00 $4,000.00
Massey Ferguson 5470 105 $58,750.00 NA -$6,000.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $9,000.00 $4,000.00
Massey Ferguson 5480 115 $61,900.00 NA -$6,000.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $9,500.00 $4,200.00

Golden Valley Tractor NO BID

Option Pricing
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Item #6  (PURCHASE Tractors)

Base
Vendor Make/Model HP Price 6a 6b 6c 6d 6e 6f 6g

St. Joseph Tractor New Holland T6050 105 $55,100.00 NA NA NA Included $700.00 NA $9,100.00
John Deere Company JD 7330S 125 $64,956.30 -$10,002.72 -$6,179.90 NA $65.25 $941.78 NA $9,041.11

JD 7230S 110 $56,309.38 -$6,266.80 -$6,391.60 NA $65.25 $941.78 NA $8,297.98
JD 7130S 100 $53,496.30 -$5,554.85 -$6,261.10 NA $65.25 $941.78 NA $8,297.98
JD 7130P 100 $66,197.46 NA -$6,511.95 $3,203.78 $65.25 $941.78 NA $8,486.48
JD 7230P 110 $72,212.06 NA -$6,511.95 $3,203.78 $65.25 $941.78 NA $8,486.48
JD 7330P 125 $80,608.94 NA -$6,511.95 $3,203.78 $65.25 $941.78 NA $8,486.48
JD 7430P 140 $85,955.96 NA NA $4,101.33 $65.25 $667.73 NA $8,923.07

S&H Farm Supply Inc. New Holland T6030 Delta 115 $50,998.00 NA -$5,690.00 NA $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. NA $9,450.00
New Holland T6030 Plus 115 $54,798.00 NA -$5,690.00 NA $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. NA $9,450.00
New Holland T6050 Delta 125 $54,498.00 NA -$5,690.00 NA $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. NA $9,450.00
New Holland T6050 Plus 125 $59,998.00 NA -$5,690.00 NA $1.00/lb. $1.00/lb. NA $9,450.00

Vestal Equipment Case IH- MXU115 95 $55,300.00 -$6,500.00 -$7,500.00 NA $100.00 $600.00 NA $7,500.00
Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 5465 100 $55,900.00 NA -$5,500.00 $4,500.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $9,500.00

Massey Ferguson 5475 110 $60,550.00 NA -$5,500.00 $4,500.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $9,500.00
Massey Ferguson 6465 100 $64,500.00 NA -$8,000.00 $5,000.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $9,500.00
Massey Ferguson 6475 110 $69,750.00 NA -$8,000.00 $5,000.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $9,500.00
Massey Ferguson 7465 100 $70,500.00 NA NA $4,500.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $9,500.00
Massey Ferguson 7475 110 $73,600.00 NA NA $4,500.00 $100.00 $1.00/lb. NA $9,500.00

$76,682.00 NA NA $70.00 $160.00 NA $9,000.00 $4,500.00
$83,024.00 NA NA $70.00 $160.00 NA $9,000.00 $4,500.00

Golden Valley Tractor NO BID

Option Pricing
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Item #7  (MUNICIPAL LEASE Tractors)

Payment
Vendor Make/Model HP Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Interest Rate Factor

St. Joseph Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 4320 39.9 $4,135.15 $4,135.15 $4,135.15 $4,135.15 $4,135.15 $4,135.15 5.25% 0.177752

JD 4520 50 $4,386.99 $4,386.99 $4,386.99 $4,386.99 $4,386.99 $4,386.99 5.25% 0.177752
JD 4720 56 $4,916.25 $4,916.25 $4,916.25 $4,916.25 $4,916.25 $4,916.25 5.25% 0.177752

JD 5055D 45 $2,821.61 $2,821.61 $2,821.61 $2,821.61 $2,821.61 $2,821.61 5.25% 0.177752
JD 5055E 45 $3,860.65 $3,860.65 $3,860.65 $3,860.65 $3,860.65 $3,860.65 5.25% 0.177752
JD 5065E 53 $4,148.78 $4,148.78 $4,148.78 $4,148.78 $4,148.78 $4,148.78 5.25% 0.177752
JD 5075E 61 $4,515.02 $4,515.02 $4,515.02 $4,515.02 $4,515.02 $4,515.02 5.25% 0.177752
JD 5101E 82 $6,787.07 $6,787.07 $6,787.07 $6,787.07 $6,787.07 $6,787.07 5.25% 0.177752
JD 5065M 50 $4,970.88 $4,970.88 $4,970.88 $4,970.88 $4,970.88 $4,970.88 5.25% 0.177752
JD 5075M 60 $5,369.17 $5,369.17 $5,369.17 $5,369.17 $5,369.17 $5,369.17 5.25% 0.177752
JD 5085M 70 $5,801.40 $5,801.40 $5,801.40 $5,801.40 $5,801.40 $5,801.40 5.25% 0.177752
JD 5095M 80 $6,545.97 $6,545.97 $6,545.97 $6,545.97 $6,545.97 $6,545.97 5.25% 0.177752
JD 5083E 65 $5,786.11 $5,786.11 $5,786.11 $5,786.11 $5,786.11 $5,786.11 5.25% 0.177752
JD 5093E 75 $6,310.27 $6,310.27 $6,310.27 $6,310.27 $6,310.27 $6,310.27 5.25% 0.177752
JD 6100D 82 $5,679.83 $5,679.83 $5,679.83 $5,679.83 $5,679.83 $5,679.83 5.25% 0.177752
JD 6230S 75 $6,507.06 $6,507.06 $6,507.06 $6,507.06 $6,507.06 $6,507.06 5.25% 0.177752
JD 6230P 75 $8,783.44 $8,783.44 $8,783.44 $8,783.44 $8,783.44 $8,783.44 5.25% 0.177752

S&H Farm Supply Inc. NO BID
Vestal Equipment Case IH- Farmall 75C 62 $5,965.70 $5,965.70 $5,965.70 $5,965.70 $5,965.70 $5,965.70 0.078% 0.21558
Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 573 60 $4,514.25 $4,514.25 $4,514.25 $4,514.25 $4,514.25 $1.00 6.99% 0.356091
Golden Valley Tractor NO BID

Item #8  (MUNICIPAL LEASE Tractors)

Payment
Vendor Make/Model HP Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Interest Rate Factor

St. Joseph Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 5105M 90 $8,394.70 $8,394.70 $8,394.70 $8,394.70 $8,394.70 $8,394.70 5.25% 0.177752

JD 6130D 105 $7,719.96 $7,719.96 $7,719.96 $7,719.96 $7,719.96 $7,719.96 5.25% 0.177752
JD 6115D 95 $7,083.28 $7,083.28 $7,083.28 $7,083.28 $7,083.28 $7,083.28 5.25% 0.177752
JD 6330S 85 $8,037.63 $8,037.63 $8,037.63 $8,037.63 $8,037.63 $8,037.63 5.25% 0.177752
JD 6430S 95 $8,525.79 $8,525.79 $8,525.79 $8,525.79 $8,525.79 $8,525.79 5.25% 0.177752
JD 6330P 85 $9,112.96 $9,112.96 $9,112.96 $9,112.96 $9,112.96 $9,112.96 5.25% 0.177752
JD 6430P 95 $9,576.77 $9,576.77 $9,576.77 $9,576.77 $9,576.77 $9,576.77 5.25% 0.177752
JD 6140D 115 $8,342.22 $8,342.22 $8,342.22 $8,342.22 $8,342.22 $8,342.22 5.25% 0.177752

S&H Farm Supply Inc. New Holland T5060 105 $7,351.68 $7,351.68 $7,351.68 $7,351.68 $7,351.68 $7,351.68 7.80% 0.18300
New Holland T5070 110 $7,900.69 $7,900.69 $7,900.69 $7,900.69 $7,900.69 $7,900.69 7.80% 0.18300

New Holland T6020 Delta 110 $8,976.21 $8,976.21 $8,976.21 $8,976.21 $8,976.21 $8,976.21 7.80% 0.18300
New Holland T6020 Plus 110 $9,913.74 $9,913.74 $9,913.74 $9,913.74 $9,913.74 $9,913.74 7.80% 0.18300

Vestal Equipment Case - MXU110 90 $11,463.21 $11,463.21 $11,463.21 $11,463.21 $11,463.21 $11,463.21 0.078% .21559

1st Installment 2nd Installment

1st Installment 2nd Installment
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Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-090709 Lease/Purchase Tractors

Multiple Award

Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 5460 95 $9,499.03 $9,499.03 $9,499.03 $9,499.03 $9,499.03 $1.00 6.49% 0.356091
Golden Valley Tractor NO BID

Item #9  (MUNICIPAL LEASE Tractors)

Payment
Vendor Make/Model HP Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Interest Rate Factor

St. Joseph Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 7330S 125 $11,546.11 $11,546.11 $11,546.11 $11,546.11 $11,546.11 $11,546.11 5.25% 0.177752

JD 7230S 110 $10,009.10 $10,009.10 $10,009.10 $10,009.10 $10,009.10 $10,009.10 5.25% 0.177752
JD 7130S 100 $9,509.07 $9,509.07 $9,509.07 $9,509.07 $9,509.07 $9,509.07 5.25% 0.177752
JD 7130P 100 $11,766.73 $11,766.73 $11,766.73 $11,766.73 $11,766.73 $11,766.73 5.25% 0.177752
JD 7230P 110 $12,835.84 $12,835.84 $12,835.84 $12,835.84 $12,835.84 $12,835.84 5.25% 0.177752
JD 7330P 125 $14,328.40 $14,328.40 $14,328.40 $14,328.40 $14,328.40 $14,328.40 5.25% 0.177752
JD 7430P 140 $15,278.84 $15,278.84 $15,278.84 $15,278.84 $15,278.84 $15,278.84 5.25% 0.177752

S&H Farm Supply Inc. New Holland T6030 Delta 115 $9,364.73 $9,364.73 $9,364.73 $9,364.73 $9,364.73 $9,364.73 7.80% 0.18300
New Holland T6030 Plus 105 $10,060.14 $10,060.14 $10,060.14 $10,060.14 $10,060.14 $10,060.14 7.80% 0.18300
New Holland T6050 Delta 125 $10,005.24 $10,005.24 $10,005.24 $10,005.24 $10,005.24 $10,005.24 7.80% 0.18300
New Holland T6050 Plus 125 $11,011.17 $11,011.17 $11,011.17 $11,011.17 $11,011.17 $11,011.17 7.80% 0.18300

Vestal Equipment Case IH- MXU115 95 $12,109.97 $12,109.97 $12,109.97 $12,109.97 $12,109.97 $12,109.97 0.078% 0.21559
Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 5465 100 $10,075.84 $10,075.84 $10,075.84 $10,075.84 $10,075.84 $1.00 6.49% 0.356091
Golden Valley Tractor NO BID

Item #10  (Training - Line Items 4-6 - Purchase Tractors Only)

Optional Optional Optional
Training Software Maint.

John Deere Company $615.00 NA $500.00
Lauf Equipment Col, Inc. NA NA $500.00
St. Joseph Tractor No Bid No Bid No Bid
Golden Valley Tractor $0.00 NA NA
Vestal Equipment NA NA NA
S&H Farm Supply Inc. $995.00 $1,547 $300

1st Installment 2nd Installment
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Std
ARO

60-90 days
60-90 days
60-90 days

90 - 180 days
90 - 180 days
90 - 180 days
90 - 180 days
90 - 180 days
90 - 180 days
90 - 180 days
60 - 120 days
60 - 120 days
60 - 120 days
60 - 120 days
60 - 120 days
60 - 120 days
60 - 120 days
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End of
Lease Price

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

1i

$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
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Std
ARO

90-180 days
90-180 days
90 - 180 days
90 - 180 days
90 - 180 days
90 - 180 days
90 - 180 days
90 - 180 days
120-150 days
120-150 days
120-150 days

180 days
120 days
170 days
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End of
Lease Price

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$52,500.00
No Bid

$65,500.00

Page 20 of 45 Bid Tab Lease-Purch Tractors



2i

$250.00
$250.00
$250.00
$250.00
$250.00
$250.00
$250.00
$250.00

Per Price List
Per Price List
Per Price List

$82.06
$75.00

NA
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Std
ARO

90-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days

120 - 150 days
120 - 150 days

180 days
120 days
170 days
170 days
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End of
Lease Price

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$54,000.00
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
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3i

$250.00
$250.00
$250.00
$250.00
$250.00
$250.00
$250.00

Per Price List
Per Price List

$82.06
$75.00

NA
NA
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4h
$563.00
$368.69
$368.69
$368.69

NA
NA
NA
NA

$660.00
$591.25
$591.25
$591.25
$591.25
$660.00
$660.00
$319.00
$334.23
$334.23

NA
NA

$549.00
$1,295.00
$1,295.00
$500.00

NA
NA
NA
NA
NA

$900.00
$900.00
$900.00
$900.00
$950.00
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5h
$563.00
$591.25
$319.00
$319.00
$319.00
$334.23
$334.23
$334.23
$334.23
$595.00
$595.00
$695.00
$695.00
$600.00
$900.00
$900.00
$900.00
$900.00
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6h
$867.23
$334.23
$334.23
$334.23
$334.23
$334.23
$334.23
$334.23
$695.00
$695.00
$695.00
$695.00
$600.00
$900.00
$900.00

$1,000.00
$1,000.00
$1,000.00
$1,000.00
$900.00
$900.00
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Std
ARO

60-90 days
60-90 days
60-90 days
60-180 days
60-180 days
60-180 days
60-180 days
60-180 days
60-180 days
60-180 days
60-180 days
60-180 days
60-180 days
60-180 days
60-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days

180 days
120 days

Std
ARO

60-180 days
60-180 days
60-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days
60-180 days

120-150 days
120-150 days
120-150 days
120-150 days

180 days
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120 days

Std
ARO

90-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days
90-180 days

120-150 days
120-150 days
120-150 days
120-150 days

180 days
120 days
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Districts
Provided

All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
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Cost Monthly End of 
Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price

$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid
$11.25 $328.13 No Bid

1j 1k 1l

NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00
NA NA $0.00

Installments
12 Month (350 Hours)
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Districts
Provided

All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All

7,8,9
7,8,9
7,8,9

9
5
4
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Cost Monthly End of 
Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price

$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.50 $423.00 $52,500.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 $65,500.00

12 Month (350 Hours)
Installments
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2j 2k 2l

$500.00 NA NA
$500.00 NA NA
$500.00 NA NA
$500.00 NA NA
$500.00 NA NA
$500.00 NA NA
$500.00 NA NA
$500.00 NA NA
$300.00 NA NA
$300.00 NA NA
$300.00 NA NA
$212.06 $845.78 $930.98
$150.00 Sourced Sourced

NA NA NA
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Districts
Provided

All
All
All
All
All
All
All

7,8,9
7,8,9

9
5
4
4
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Cost Monthly End of 
Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price

$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 No Bid
$15.00 $438.00 $54,000.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid
$14.25 $415.63 $65,500.00
$14.25 $415.63 $65,500.00

Installments
12 Month (350 Hours)
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3j 3k 3l

$500.00 NA NA
$500.00 NA NA
$500.00 NA NA
$500.00 NA NA
$500.00 NA NA
$500.00 NA NA
$500.00 NA NA
$300.00 NA NA
$300.00 NA NA
$212.06 $845.78 $930.98
$150.00 Sourced Sourced

NA NA NA
NA NA NA
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Std Districts
4i 4j 4k ARO Provided

NA NA NA 120 days 1,2,4
NA NA NA 60-90 days All
NA NA -$196.42 60-90 days All
NA NA -$196.42 60-90 days All
NA NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA -$781.60 60-240 days All
NA NA -$769.23 60-240 days All
NA NA -$769.23 60-240 days All
NA NA -$769.23 60-240 days All
NA NA -$769.23 60-240 days All
NA NA -$781.60 60-240 days All
NA NA -$781.60 60-240 days All
NA NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA -$654.68 60-240 days All
NA NA -$579.28 60-240 days All
NA NA $795.00 120-150 days 7,8,9
NA NA $795.00 120-150 days 7,8,9
NA NA -$600.00 120-150 days 7,8,9
NA NA -$400.00 120-150 days 7,8,9
NA NA -$400.00 120-150 days 7,8,9
NA NA $650.00 180 days 9

Sourced Sourced -$500.00 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced -$500.00 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced -$500.00 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced NA 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced NA 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced -$600.00 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced -$600.00 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced -$600.00 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced -$600.00 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced -$600.00 120 days 5
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Std Districts
5i 5j ARO Provided

NA NA 120 days 1,2,4
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 120-150 days 7,8,9
NA NA 120-150 days 7,8,9
NA NA 120-150 days 7,8,9
NA NA 120-150 days 7,8,9

$845.78 $930.98 180 days 9
Sourced Sourced 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced 120 days 5
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Std Districts
6i 6j ARO Provided

NA NA 120 days 1,2,4
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 60-240 days All
NA NA 120-150 days 7,8,9
NA NA 120-150 days 7,8,9
NA NA 120-150 days 7,8,9
NA NA 120-150 days 7,8,9

$845.78 $930.98 180 days 9
Sourced Sourced 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced 120 days 5
Sourced Sourced 120-150 days All
Sourced Sourced 120-150 days All
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Districts
Provided

All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All

9
5

Districts
Provided

All
All
All
All
All
All
All
All

7,8,9
7,8,9
7,8,9
7,8,9

9
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5

Districts
Provided

All
All
All
All
All
All
All

7,8,9
7,8,9
7,8,9
7,8,9

9
5
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