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MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION  
GENERAL SERVICES DIVISION 
FLEET SECTION 

 
NOTIFICATION OF STATEWIDE CONTRACT 

 
CONTRACT TITLE:     
 
CURRENT CONTRACT PERIOD:   
 
BUYER INFORMATION:  Jerry Dunn 
    573-526-7932 
    jerry.dunn@modot.mo.gov
 
 

RENEWAL INFORMATION 
Bid prices should be firm for purchase until 12/31/09. Three (3) one-year extensions 
are available upon mutual consideration by Missouri Department of Transportation 
and the successful bidder.  Allowance for inflation increases will be considered at the 
time of offer of these extensions. 

 
 

ALL PURCHASES MADE UNDER THIS CONTRACT MUST BE FOR PUBLIC USE ONLY. 
PURCHASES FOR PERSONAL USE BY PUBLIC EMPLOYEES OR OFFICIALS ARE PROHIBITED. 

 
 

CONTRACT 
NUMBER 

 
VENDOR 
NUMBER 

 
VENDOR INFORMATION 

 
District 

 

COOP 
PROCURE-

MENT 

 
 

    

3-061120 371324032 G.W. Van Keppel Co. 2,3,6,10 Yes 
  1801 N. 9th. St.   
  Kansas City KS. 66101   
  Steve Stone   
  913-281-4800   
  kkientz@Vankeppel.com   
     
3-061120 3710905680 Tri-State Equipment Co. 2,3,5 No 
  6787 County Rd. 312   
  Palmyra MO.   
  Kevin Smyser   
  573-769-2274   
  kevinsmyser@meoi.com   
     
3-061120 4306983050 Erb Equipment Co. 6,10 Yes 
  200 Erb industrial Dr.   
  Fenton MO. 63026   
  Tim Smith   
  636-349-0200   
  timsmith@erbequipment.com   
     
     

mailto:jerry.dunn@modot.mo.gov
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CONTRACT 

NUMBER 

 
VENDOR 
NUMBER 

 
VENDOR INFORMATION 

 
District 

 

COOP 
PROCURE-

MENT 

  Murphy Tractor Equipment Co.   
  1601 N. Corrington   
  Kansas City MO. 64015   
  Jim Levy   
  816-483-5721   
  jlevy@murphytractor.com   
     
3-061120 371324032 Roland Machinery Co. 2,3,5,6,10 Yes 
  4620 Crossroads Industrial Dr.   
  Bridgeton MO. 63044   
  Vic Keough   
  314-291-1330   
  vickeough@rolandmachinery.com   
     
3-061120 4213460500 Logan Contractors 1,2,4,5,7,8 Yes 
  1325 S Enterprise Dr.   
  Olathe KS. 66061   
  Jon Krueger   
  913-768-1551   
  jon@logancontractors   
     
3-061120 431037077 Luby Equipment 3,6,10 Yes 
  2625 N. 24 Street   
  Quincy Il. 62305   
  217-222-5454   
  Jerry Jansen   
  jjansen@lubyequipment.com   
     
3-061120 10801731 Cummings McGowan & West 2,5,6,10 Yes 
  8668 Olive Blvd,   
  St. Louis MO. 63132   
  Doug Cornett   
  314-993-1336   
  sandyd@cmw-equip.com   
     
3-061120  John Fabick Tractor 3,5,6.7, Yes 
  One Fabick Drive 8,9,10  
  Fenton MO. 63026   
  Rod Byers   
  636-343-5900   
  Rod.Byers@fabickcat.com   
     
3-061120  Dean Machinery Co. 2,4,5,7,8 Yes 
  1201 W. 31 Street   
  Kansas City MO.   
  816-753-5300   
  Steve Phillips   
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CONTRACT 

NUMBER 

 
VENDOR 
NUMBER 

 
VENDOR INFORMATION 

 
District 

 

COOP 
PROCURE-

MENT 

3-061120  Altorfer Inc 2,3 Yes 
  3520 Moberly Ave.   
  Hannibal Mo. 63401   
  573-221-8600   
  Chris Akright   
     
3-061120  Cooke Sales & Service All Yes 
  1422 N. Washington St.   
  Chillicothe Mo. 64601   
  660-646-1166   
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Compaction Rollers (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 
______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Contract Number:  3-061120       Vendor: G.W. Van Keppel   
 
Item – 2   Outright purchase of one (1) new minimum 10-12 Ton Vibratory Smooth Roller  
    
 
MAKE/MODEL:  Hypac C766D   PRICE:      $117367.00  
 
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:  
 
Operating weight 20,600lbs 
Centrifugal force each drum 27,580 / 32950 lbs 
Water tank size 250 gals 
Compaction width 66 inches 
Engine (Type) Cummins Diesel 
     Hp  130   
     Rpm  2500     
     Cylinder  4 
     # of speeds 2 
     Cooling type Water 
 
 
AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   
 
Option 1:  MoDOT may purchase additional training modules after the initial training at a cost of 

$450.00 per student with no minimum class size. 
  

Option 2:   Standard  Highway yellow paint Federal Std. #595B 
 
Option 3:  N/A  Steering knob 
 
Option 4:  N/A  Edge cutter  
 
Option 5:  Standard  Vibration frequency gauges, front/rear drums 
   
Notes: 
 
Additional options available contact fleet buyer for complete list. 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount N/A% 
 
Delivery will be made 30 days after receipt of order.   

 
Vendor bidding only Districts 2,3,6,10.  
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Compaction Rollers (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 
______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Contract Number:  3-061120       Vendor: Tri State   
 
Item – 2   Outright purchase of one (1) new minimum 10-12 Ton Vibratory Smooth Roller  
  
MAKE/MODEL:  Hypac C766D   PRICE:      $112500.00  
 
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:  
 
Operating weight 20,600lbs 
Centrifugal force each drum 27,580 / 32950 lbs 
Water tank size 250 gals 
Compaction width 66 inches 
Engine (Type) Cummins Diesel 
     Hp  130   
     Rpm  2200     
     Cylinder  4 
     # of speeds 2 
     Cooling type Water 
 
AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   
 
Option 1:  MoDOT may purchase additional training modules after the initial training at a cost of 

$100.00 per student with 10 minimum class size. 
  

Option 2:   N/A   Highway yellow paint Federal Std. #595B 
 
Option 3:  Standard Steering knob 
 
Option 4:  Standard Edge Roller and Cutter Assembly  
 
Option 5:  Standard Vibration frequency gauges, front/rear drums 
 
Bid Exceptions: 
 
Cocoa mats not available 
 
Technician training provided at dealer shop only. 
 
Notes: 
 
Additional options available contact fleet buyer for complete list. 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 30% 
 
Delivery will be made 60 to 90 days after receipt of order.   

 
Vendor bidding only Districts 2,3,5.  
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Compaction Rollers (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 
______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Contract Number:  3-061120       Vendor: ERB Equipment   
 
Item – 2   Outright purchase of one (1) new minimum 10-12 Ton Vibratory Smooth Roller 
  
MAKE/MODEL:  Bomag BW266AD-4 Dual Drum Vibratory Roller  PRICE:      $110,144.00  
(Replaces BW161AD-4) 
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:  
 
Operating weight 24000 lbs 
Centrifugal force each drum 30300 / 32800 lbs 
Water tank size 318 gals 
Compaction width 66 inches 
Engine (Type) Cummins QSB4.5 Tier 3 Diesel 
     Hp  130 
     Rpm  2250     
     Cylinder  3 
     # of speeds 2 
     Cooling type Air/ Oil 
 
AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   
 
Option 1:  N/B   Training 

  
Option 2:   $3400.00 Highway yellow paint Federal Std. #595B 
 
Option 3:  N/B  Steering knob 
 
Option 4:  $5500.00 Edge Roller and Cutter Assembly  
 
Option 5:  N/B   Vibration frequency gauges, front/rear drums 
 
 
Notes: 
 
Additional options available contact fleet buyer for complete list. 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 0% 
 
Delivery will be made 45 days after receipt of order.   

 
Vendor bidding only Districts 6,10.  
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Compaction Rollers (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 
______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Contract Number:  3-061120       Vendor: Logan Contractors   
 
Item – 2   Outright purchase of one (1) new minimum 10-12 Ton Vibratory Smooth Roller  
  
MAKE/MODEL:  Dyna Pac CC424   PRICE:      $115575.00  
 
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:  
 
Operating weight 23150 lbs 
Centrifugal force each drum 31950 lbs 
Water tank size 238 gals 
Compaction width 68 inches 
Engine (Type) Cummins QSB 4.5 T3 Turbo w / aftercooler Diesel 
     Hp  125 
     Rpm  2200     
     Cylinder  4 
     # of speeds Variable 
     Cooling type Liquid 
 
AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   
 
Option 1:  Additional training modules may be purchased by MoDOT after initial training at a cost of 

$120.00 per student with a 1 minimum class size 
  

Option 2:   $3395.00  Highway yellow paint Federal Std. #595B 
 
Option 3:  Standard Steering knob 
 
Option 4:  $6578.00 Edge cutter  
 
Option 5:  Standard Vibration frequency gauges, front/rear drums 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
Asphalt Temperature meter is standard 
 
Front & Rear Working Light is standard 
 
Additional options available contact fleet buyer for complete list. 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 10% 
 
Delivery will be made 60 days after receipt of order.   

 
Vendor bidding only Districts 1,2,4,5,7,8  
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Compaction Rollers (Statewide) 
Multiple Award 

______________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Contract Number:  3-061120       Vendor: Luby Equipment   
 
Item –2   Outright purchase of one (1) New Minimum 10-12 Ton Vibratory Smooth Roller  
  
MAKE/MODEL:  DynaPac CC424HF   PRICE:      $107,700.00  
 
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:  
 
Operating weight 23150 lbs 
Centrifugal force each drum 16650 lbs low / 26100 lbs high 
Water tank size 316 gals 
Compaction width 68 inches 
Engine (Type) Cummins QSB 4.5 T3 Diesel 
     Hp  125 
     Rpm  2200     
     Cylinder  4 
     # of speeds 1 
     Cooling type Water Cooled 
 
AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   
 
Option 1:  Additional training modules may be purchased by MoDOT after initial training at a cost of 

$100.00 per student with a 1 minimum class size 
  

Option 2:   $2600.00  Highway yellow paint Federal Std. #595B 
 
Option 3:  Standard Steering knob 
 
Option 4:  $3450.00 Edge roller and cutter assembly  
 
Option 5:  Standard  Vibration frequency gauges, front/rear drums 
 
Option  Standard Asphalt temp meter 
 
Option    Standard Front and rear work lights 
 
Option  $5800.00 Offset rear steer 
 
Option  Standard Rotating beacon 
 
Notes: 
 
Additional options available contact fleet buyer for complete list. 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 10% 
 
Delivery will be made 90 days after receipt of order.   

 
Vendor bidding only Districts 3,6,10  
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Compaction Rollers (Statewide) 
Multiple Award 

 
 
Contract Number:  3-061120       Vendor: CMW Equipment   
 
Item – 2   Outright purchase of one (1) New Minimum 10-12 Ton Vibratory Smooth Roller  
  
MAKE/MODEL:  Volvo/Ingersoll Rand DD90  PRICE:      $116849.00  
 
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:  
 
Operating weight 21820 lbs 
Centrifugal force each drum 1850 - 2500 lbs 
Water tank size 260 gals 
Compaction width 66 inches 
Engine (Type) Cummins B.3C  Diesel 
     Hp  110 
     Rpm  2200     
     Cylinder  4 
     # of speeds 1 
     Cooling type Liquid 
 
AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   
 
Option 1:  No Bid  Additional Training 

  
Option 2:   $1398.00 Highway yellow paint Federal Std. #595B 
 
Option 3:  $60.00  Steering knob 
 
Option 4:  $13250.00 Edge roller and cutter assembly  
 
Option 5:  No Bid   Vibration frequency gauges, front/rear drums 
Notes: 
 
Additional options available contact fleet buyer for complete list. 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount N/A% 
 
Delivery will be made 60 days after receipt of order.   

 
Vendor bidding only Districts 2,,5,6,10  
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Compaction Rollers (Statewide) 
Multiple Award 

 
 
Contract Number:  3-061120       Vendor: Dean Machinery   
 
Item – 2   Outright purchase of one (1) New Minimum 10-12 Ton Vibratory Smooth Roller  
  
MAKE/MODEL:  Caterpillar CB534D  PRICE:      $119984.00  
 
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:  
 
Operating weight 22836 lbs 
Centrifugal force each drum 8100 / 20925 lbs 
Water tank size 290 gals 
Compaction width 67 inches 
Engine (Type) 3054/Diesel 
     Hp  46 
     Rpm  2200     
     Cylinder  4 
     # of speeds Infinite 
     Cooling type Liquid 
 
AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   
 
Option 1:  Additional training modules may be purchased by MoDOT after initial training at a cost of 

$100.00 per student with a 4 minimum class size. 
  

Option 2:   $3925.00 Highway yellow paint Federal Std. #595B 
 
Option 3:  STD.  Steering knob 
 
Option 4:  No-Bid Edge roller and cutter assembly  
 
Option 5:   Standard  Vibration frequency gauges, front/rear drums 
 
 
Notes: 
 
Additional options available contact fleet buyer for complete list. 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 0 % 
 
Delivery will be made 60 days after receipt of order.   

 
Vendor bidding only Districts 1,2,4,5,7,8 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 

Page 11 of 14 

 
Compaction Rollers (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 
 
 
 
Contract Number:  3-061120       Vendor: Fabick Cat   
 
Item –2   Outright purchase of one (1) New Minimum 10-12 Ton Vibratory Smooth Roller  
  
MAKE/MODEL:  Caterpillar CB534D  PRICE:      $119984.00  
 
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:  
 
Operating weight 22836 lbs 
Centrifugal force each drum 8100 / 20925 lbs 
Water tank size 290 gals 
Compaction width 67 inches 
Engine (Type) 3054/Diesel 
     Hp  46 
     Rpm  2200     
     Cylinder  4 
     # of speeds Infinite 
     Cooling type Liquid 
 
AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   
 
Option 1:  Additional training modules may be purchased by MoDOT after initial training at a cost of 

$100.00 per student with a 4 minimum class size. 
  

Option 2:   $3925.00 Highway yellow paint Federal Std. #595B 
 
Option 3:  STD.  Steering knob 
 
Option 4:  No-Bid Edge roller and cutter assembly  
 
Option 5:   Included  Vibration frequency gauges, front/rear drums 
 
 
 
 
Notes: 
 
Additional options available contact fleet buyer for complete list. 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 23 % 
 
Delivery will be made 120 days after receipt of order.   

 
Vendor bidding only Districts 3,5,6,7,8,9,10 
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Compaction Rollers (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 
 
Contract Number:  3-061120       Altorfer Inc:    
 
Item – 2   Outright purchase of one (1) New Minimum 10-12 Ton Vibratory Smooth Roller  
  
MAKE/MODEL:  Caterpillar CB34D  PRICE:      $119984.00  
 
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:  
 
Operating weight 22836 lbs 
Centrifugal force each drum 8100 / 20925 lbs 
Water tank size 290 gals 
Compaction width 67 inches 
Engine (Type) 3054/Diesel 
     Hp  46 
     Rpm  2200     
     Cylinder  4 
     # of speeds Infinite 
     Cooling type Liquid 
 
 
AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   
 
Option 1:  Additional training modules may be purchased by MoDOT after initial training at a cost of 

$100.00 per student with a 4 minimum class size. 
  

Option 2:   $3925.00 Highway yellow paint Federal Std. #595B 
 
Option 3:  STD.  Steering knob 
 
Option 4:  No-Bid Edge roller and cutter assembly  
 
Option 5:  Included  Vibration frequency gauges, front/rear drums 
 
Notes: 
 
Additional options available contact fleet buyer for complete list. 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 23 % 
 
Delivery will be made 120 days after receipt of order.   

 
Vendor bidding only Districts ,2,3 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

Page 13 of 14 

 
Compaction Rollers (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 
 
Contract Number:  3-061120       Murphy Tractor Equipment CO:    
 
Item – 2   Outright purchase of one (1) New Minimum 10-12 Ton Vibratory Smooth Roller  
  
MAKE/MODEL:  Hamm HD 110HV  PRICE:      $91735.00  
 
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:  
 
Operating weight 22707 lbs 
Centrifugal force each drum 27675 / 25650 lbs 
Water tank size 238 gals 
Compaction width 66 inches 
Engine (Type) Deutz/Diesel 
     Hp  131 
     Rpm  2300     
     Cylinder  4 
     # of speeds 2 
     Cooling type Water 
 
 
AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   
 
 
Option 1:  N/A 

  
Option 2:   $1250.00 Highway yellow paint Federal Std. #595B 
 
Option 3:  STD.  Steering knob 
 
Option 4:  $6750.00 Edge roller and cutter assembly  
 
Option 5:  STD.   Vibration frequency gauges, front/rear drums 
 
Notes: 
 
Additional options available contact fleet buyer for complete list. 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 0 % 
 
Delivery will be made 90 - 120 days after receipt of order.   

 
Vendor bidding only Districts 1,4,7,8,9 
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Compaction Rollers (Statewide) 

Multiple Award 
 
Contract Number:  3-061120       Roland Machinery :    
 
Item – 2   Outright purchase of one (1) New Minimum 10-12 Ton Vibratory Smooth Roller  
  
MAKE/MODEL:  Hamm HD 110HV  PRICE:      $94520.00  
 
EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN PRICE:  
 
Operating weight 22652 lbs 
Centrifugal force each drum 27675 / 25650 lbs 
Water tank size 238 gals 
Compaction width 66/70 inches 
Engine (Type) Deutz/Diesel 
     Hp  134 
     Rpm  2300     
     Cylinder  4 
     # of speeds variable 
     Cooling type Water 
 
 
AVAILABLE OPTIONS:   
 
 
Option 1:  Additional training modules may be purchased by MoDOT after initial training at a cost of 

$150.00 per student with a 6 minimum class size. 
  

Option 2:   $1170.00 Highway yellow paint Federal Std. #595B 
 
Option 3:  STD.  Steering knob 
 
Option 4:  $6469.00 Edge roller and cutter assembly  
 
Option 5:  STD.   Vibration frequency gauges, front/rear drums 
 
Notes: 
 
Additional options available contact fleet buyer for complete list. 
 
% Discount off MSRP for all Data Book or Pricing Guide Options: - % Discount 0 % 
 
Delivery will be made 90 - 120 days after receipt of order.   

 
Vendor bidding only Districts 2,3,5,6,10 
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