M&EDOT

ltem #1 (LEASE 40-50 HP Tractors)

*Tractors are to have front wheel assist and ROPS with canopies

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Earley Tractor
John Deere Company

S&H Farm Supply Inc.
Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment

Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Missouri Department of Transportation

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing
Multiple Award

Payment Upfront

Order by to Std Districts

rec Mar 1st ARO Provided
11/01/07 60-90 days All
11/01/07 60-90 days All
11/01/07 60-90 days All
11/01/07 60-90 days All
11/01/07 60-90 days All

8 Month 12 Month 24 Month
Two One Two Three Cost End of Cost End of Cost End of

Make/Model HP | Weeks Month | Months | Months Per/Hour | Lease Price | Per/Hour Lease Price Per/Hour Lease Price

NO BID

NO BID

JD 4320 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid _$3,000.00 $10.99 $15,653.71 $10.99 $15,104.21 $12.99 $11,676.31

JD 4520 45 No Bid No Bid No Bid _$3,000.00 $10.99 $16,814.71 $10.99 $16,265.21 $12.99 $12,837.31

JD 4720 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid _$3,000.00 $10.99 $19,037.26 $10.99 $18,487.76 $12.99 $15,059.86

JD 5203 47 No Bid No Bid No Bid _$3,000.00 $10.99 $11,110.19 $10.99 $10,560.69 $12.99 $7,132.79

JD 5225 45 No Bid No Bid No Bid _$3,000.00 $10.99 $20,674.32 $10.99 $20,124.82 $12.99 $16,696.92

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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M&EDOT

ltem #1 (LEASE 40-50 HP Tractors)

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Earley Tractor
John Deere Company

S&H Farm Supply Inc.
Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment

Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Earley Tractor
John Deere Company

S&H Farm Supply Inc.
Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment

Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Missouri Department of Transportation

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing
Multiple Award

Installments Installments
8 Month (300 Hours) 12 Month (350 Hours)
Cost Semi (2) End of Cost Monthly End of Cost Semi (2) End of Cost Monthly End of
Make/Model HP Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price | Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price
NO BID
NO BID
JD 4320 40 $10.99 $1,648.50 $15,653.71 $10.99 $412.13 $15,653.71 $10.99 $1,923.25 $15,104.21 $10.99 $320.54 $15,104.21
JD 4520 45 $10.99 $1,648.50 $16,814.71 $10.99 $412.13 $16,814.71 $10.99 $1,923.25 $16,265.21 $10.99 $320.54 $16,265.21
JD 4720 50 $10.99 $1,648.50 $19,037.26 $10.99 $412.13 $19,037.26 $10.99 $1,923.25 $18,487.76 $10.99 $320.54 $18,487.76
JD 5203 47 $10.99 $1,648.50 $11,110.19 $10.99 $412.13 $11,110.19 $10.99 $1,923.25 $10,560.69 $10.99 $320.54 $10,560.69
JD 5225 45 $10.99 $1,648.50 $20,674.32 $10.99 $412.13 $20,674.32 $10.99 $1,923.25 $20,124.82 $10.99 $320.54 $20,124.82
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
Option Pricing
Make/Model HP la 1b 1c(deduct) 1d le 1f 1g 1h 1i 1j 1k
NO BID
NO BID
JD 4320 40 $0.00 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.00/per hr. $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
JD 4520 45 $0.00 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.00/per hr. $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
JD 4720 50 $0.00 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.00/per hr. $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
JD 5203 47 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.00/per hr. $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
JD 5225 45 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.00/per hr. $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
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M&EDOT

ltem #2 (LEASE 50-75 HP Tractors)

**Tractors are to have cabs, air conditioning and front wheel assist

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Earley Tractor
John Deere Company

S&H Farm Supply Inc.
Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment

Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Missouri Department of Transportation

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing
Multiple Award

Payment Upfront

Order by to Std Districts

rec Mar 1st ARO Provided
10/10/07 150 days 1
11/01/07 60-90 days All
11/01/07 60-90 days All
11/01/07 60-90 days All
11/01/07 60-90 days All
11/01/07 60-90 days All
11/01/07 60-90 days All
11/01/07 60-90 days All
10/09/07 90-180 days All
10/15/07 90-180 days All
10/10/07 160 days 9

8 Month 12 Month 24 Month
Two One Two Three Cost End of Cost End of Cost End of

Make/Model HP | Weeks Month | Months | Months Per/Hour | Lease Price | Per/Hour Lease Price Per/Hour Lease Price

New Holland TN75D 62 | $1,320.00 | $1,644.50 |$2,467.30| $3,289.00 $16.45 $287,085.60 $17.00 $28,486.70 $17.55 $23,476.20
NO BID

JD 5303 55 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,000.00 $11.25 $12,263.59 $11.25 $11,714.09 $13.25 $8,286.19

JD 5403 64 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,000.00 $11.25 $14,843.41 $11.25 $14,293.91 $13.25 $10,866.01

JD 5325 55 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,000.00 $11.25 $28,386.13 $11.25 $27,836.63 $13.25 $24,408.73

JD 5425 65 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,000.00 $11.25 $30,744.03 $11.25 $30,194.53 $13.25 $26,766.63

JD 5525 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,000.00 $11.25 $33,340.64 $11.25 $32,791.14 $13.25 $29,363.24

JD 5603 82 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,000.00 $11.25 $29,530.29 11.25 $28,967.79 $13.25 $25,485.29

JD 5625 82 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,000.00 $11.25 $33,962.31 11.25 $33,399.81 $13.25 $29,917.31

JD 6230 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,000.00 $11.25 $41,754.95 11.25 $41,205.45 $13.25 $37,777.55

JD 6230S 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,000.00 $11.25 $36,210.71 11.25 $35,648.21 $13.25 $32,165.71
NO BID
NO BID

Case - JX1095C 75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $12.00 $32,000.00 $12.00 $31,000.00 $12.00 $29,000.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
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M&EDOT

ltem #2 (LEASE 50-75 HP Tractors)

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Earley Tractor
John Deere Company

S&H Farm Supply Inc.
Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment

Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Missouri Department of Transportation

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing
Multiple Award

Installments Installments
8 Month (300 Hours) 12 Month (350 Hours)
Cost Semi (2) End of Cost Monthly End of Cost Semi (2) End of Cost Monthly End of

Make/Model HP Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price | Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price

New Holland TN75D 62 $16.45 $2,466.75 $28,870.60 $16.45 $616.68 $28,983.90 $17.00 $2,974.13 $28,783.70 $17.00 $495.68 $28,937.70
NO BID

JD 5303 55 $11.25 $1,687.50 $12,263.59 $11.25 $421.88 $12,263.59 $11.25 $1,968.75 $11,714.09 $11.25 $328.13 $11,714.09

JD 5403 64 $11.25 $1,687.50 $14,843.41 $11.25 $421.88 $14,843.41 $11.25 $1,968.75 $14,293.91 $11.25 $328.13 $14,293.91

JD 5325 55 $11.25 $1,687.50 $28,286.13 $11.25 $421.88 $28,386.13 $11.25 $1,968.75 $27,836.63 $11.25 $328.13 $27,836.63

JD 5425 65 $11.25 $1,687.50 $30,744.03 $11.25 $421.88 $30,744.03 $11.25 $1,968.75 $30,194.53 $11.25 $328.13 $30,194.53

JD 5525 75 $11.25 $1,687.50 $33,340.64 $11.25 $421.88 $33,340.64 $11.25 $1,968.75 $32,791.14 $11.25 $328.13 $32,791.14

JD 5603 82 $11.25 $1,687.50 $29,530.29 $11.25 $421.88 $29,530.29 $11.25 $1,968.75 $28,967.79 $11.25 $328.13 $28,967.79

JD 5625 82 $11.25 $1,687.50 $33,962.31 $11.25 $421.88 $33,962.31 $11.25 $1,968.75 $33,399.81 $11.25 $328.13 $33,399.81

JD 6230 75 $11.25 $1,687.50 $41,754.95 $11.25 $421.88 $41,754.95 $11.25 $1,968.75 $41,205.45 $11.25 $328.13 $41,205.45

JD 6230S 75 $11.25 $1,687.50 $36,210.71 $11.25 $421.88 $36,210.71 $11.25 $1,968.75 $35,648.21 $11.25 $328.13 $35,648.21
NO BID
NO BID

Case - JX1095C 75 $12.00 $1,800.00 $32,000.00 $12.00 $450.00 $32,000.00 $12.00 $2,100.00 $31,000.00 $12.00 $350.00 $31,000.00
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
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MOD>OT Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing
Multiple Award

ltem #2 (LEASE 50-75 HP Tractors)

Option Pricing
Vendor HP 2a 2b 2c(deduct) 2d 2e 2f 29 2h 2i 2j 2k
St. Joseph Tractor New Holland TN75D 62 -$572.00 NA -$495.00 $33.00 $220.00 NA $1,925.00 NA NA NA NA
Earley Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 5303 55 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.00 per hour| $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
JD 5403 64 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.00 per hour| $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
JD 5325 55 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.00 per hour| $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
JD 5425 65 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.00 per hour| $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
JD 5525 75 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.00 per hour| $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
JD 5603 82 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NA $5.00 per hour| $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
JD 5625 82 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.00 per hour| $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
JD 6230 75 NA NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NA $5.00 per hour| $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
JD 6230S 75 $0.00 NA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.00 per hour| $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
S&H Farm Supply Inc. NO BID
Davis Farm Supplies NO BID
Vestal Equipment Case - JX1095C 75 NA NA NA $90.00 $600.00 NA $5,500.00 NA NA $200.00 $475.00
Lauf Equipment NO BID
Crown Power & Equipment NO BID
Golden Valley Tractor NO BID

See Option Page for Description

Page 5 of 14

Bid Tab Lease-Purch Tractors.xls



M&EDOT

ltem #3 (LEASE 85-115 HP Tractors)

**Tractors are to have cabs, air condtioning and front wheel assist

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Earley Tractor

John Deere Company

S&H Farm Supply Inc.
Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment

Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Missouri Department of Transportation

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing
Multiple Award

Payment Upfront

8 Month 12 Month 24 Month
Two One Two Three Cost End of Cost End of Cost End of
Make/Model HP | Weeks Month | Months | Months Per/Hour | Lease Price | Per/Hour Lease Price Per/Hour Lease Price
New Holland TS110A 90 |$1,320.00 | $2,084.50 |$2,906.20| $3,729.00 $16.45 $43,044.10 $17.00 $43,376.30 $17.55 $40,181.90
New Holland T6020 Delta | 90 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,300.00 $13.95 $49,700.00 $13.95 $49,700.00 NO BID NO BID
New Holland T6030 Delta | 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,300.00 $13.95 $52,242.00 $13.95 $52,242.00 NO BID
New Holland T6050 Delta | 105 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,300.00 $13.95 $51,199.00 $13.95 $51,199.00 NO BID
New Holland T6050 Plus | 115 | No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,300.00 $13.95 $57,139.00 $13.95 $57,139.00 NO BID
New Holland T6070 Plus 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,300.00 $13.95 $61,673.00 $13.95 $61,673.00 NO BID
New Holland T6050 Elite | 105 | No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,300.00 $13.95 $66,873.00 $13.95 $66,873.00 NO BID
JD 6403 85 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $32,426.28 $14.25 $31,876.78 $16.25 $28,448.88
JD 6603 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $35,834.65 $14.25 $35,285.15 $16.25 $31,857.25
JD 6330 85 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $43,464.61 $14.25 $42,915.11 $16.25 $39,487.21
JD 6330S 85 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $37,943.82 $14.25 $37,231.32 $16.25 $33,118.82
JD 6430 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $45,860.47 $14.25 $45,310.97 $16.25 $41,883.07
JD 6430S 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $40,507.58 $14.25 $39,795.08 $16.25 $35,682.58
JD 7130S 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $39,986.27 $14.25 $39,273.77 $16.25 $35,161.27
JD 72308 110 | NoBid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $47,860.14 $14.25 $47,147.64 $16.25 $43,035.14
JD 7330S 125 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $55,959.49 $14.25 $55,246.99 $16.25 $51,134.49
JD 7130P 100 | NoBid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $65,136.57 $14.25 $55,874.07 $16.25 $51,761.57
JD 7230P 110 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $62,133.84 $14.25 $61,421.34 $16.25 $57,308.84
JD 7330P 125 | NoBid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $69,873.30 $14.25 $69,160.80 $16.25 $65,048.30
JD 7430P 140 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $74,813.21 $14.25 $74,100.71 $16.25 $69,988.21
NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID
Case - MXU115 95 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $14.00 $49,000.00 $14.00 $48,500.00 $14.00 $47,000.00
Massey Ferguson 6465 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 $10.00 $55,000.00 $12.00 $55,000.00 $15.00 $55,000.00
NO BID
New Holland T6050 105 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.50 $57,820.00 $13.50 $57,820.00 NO BID NO BID

Order by to Std Districts
rec Mar 1st ARO Provided
10/10/07 150 days 1
10/31/07 120-150 days 1,2,4
10/31/07 120-150 days 1,24
10/31/07 120-150 days 1,2,4
10/31/07 120-150 days 1,24
10/31/07 120-150 days 1,2,4
10/31/07 120-150 days 1,24
10/09/07 90-180 days All
10/09/07 90-180 days All
10/09/07 90-180 days All
10/15/07 90-180 days All
10/09/07 90-180 days All
10/15/07 90-180 days All
10/15/07 90-180 days All
10/15/07 90-180 days All
10/15/07 90-180 days All
10/15/07 90-180 days All
10/15/07 90-180 days All
10/15/07 90-180 days All
10/15/07 90-180 days All
11/01/07 120 days 8
10/10/07 160 days 9
11/01/07 120 days 5
10/10/07 155 days 4
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M&EDOT

ltem #3 (LEASE 85-115 HP Tractors)

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Earley Tractor

John Deere Company

S&H Farm Supply Inc.

Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment

Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Missouri Department of Transportation

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing
Multiple Award

Installments Installments
8 Month (300 Hours) 12 Month (350 Hours)

Cost Semi (2) End of Cost Monthly End of Cost Semi (2) End of Cost Monthly End of
Make/Model HP Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price | Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price
New Holland TS110A 920 $16.45 $2,466.75 $43,167.30 $16.45 $616.68 $43,321.30 $17.00 $2,974.13 $43,425.80 $17.00 $495.68 $43,600.70
New Holland T6020 Delta | 90 $15.00 $2,250.00 $49,700.00 $15.00 $562.50 $49,700.00 $15.00 $2,625.00 $49,700.00 $15.00 $437.50 $49,700.00
New Holland T6030 Delta | 95 $15.00 $2,250.00 $52,242.00 $15.00 $562.50 $52,242.00 $15.00 $2,625.00 $52,242.00 $15.00 $437.50 $52,242.00
New Holland T6050 Delta | 105 $15.00 $2,250.00 $51,199.00 $15.00 $562.50 $51,199.00 $15.00 $2,625.00 $51,199.00 $15.00 $437.50 $51,199.00
New Holland T6050 Plus | 115 $15.00 $2,250.00 $57,139.00 $15.00 $562.50 $57,139.00 $15.00 $2,625.00 $57,139.00 $15.00 $437.50 $57,139.00
New Holland T6070 Plus 95 $15.00 $2,250.00 $61,673.00 $15.00 $562.50 $61,673.00 $15.00 $2,625.00 $61,673.00 $15.00 $437.50 $61,673.00
New Holland T6050 Elite | 105 $15.00 $2,250.00 $66,873.00 $15.00 $562.50 $66,873.00 $15.00 $2,625.00 $66,873.00 $15.00 $437.50 $66,873.00
JD 6403 85 $14.25 $2,137.50 $32,426.28 $14.25 $534.38 $32,426.28 $14.25 $2,493.75 $31,876.78 $14.25 $415.63 $31,876.78
JD 6603 95 $14.25 $2,137.50 $35,834.65 $14.25 $534.38 $35,834.65 $14.25 $2,493.75 $35,285.15 $14.25 $415.63 $35,285.15
JD 6330 85 $14.25 $2,137.50 $43,464.61 $14.25 $534.38 $43,464.61 $14.25 $2,493.75 $42,915.11 $14.25 $415.63 $42,915.11
JD 6330S 85 $14.25 $2,137.50 $37,943.82 $14.25 $534.38 $37,943.82 $14.25 $2,493.75 $37,231.32 $14.25 $415.63 $37,231.32
JD 6430 95 $14.25 $2,137.50 $45,860.47 $14.25 $534.38 $45,860.47 $14.25 $2,493.75 $45,310.97 $14.25 $415.63 $45,310.97
JD 6430S 95 $14.25 $2,137.50 $40,507.58 $14.25 $534.38 $40,507.58 $14.25 $2,493.75 $39,795.08 $14.25 $415.63 $39,795.08
JD 7130S 100 $14.25 $2,137.50 $39,986.27 $14.25 $534.38 $39,986.27 $14.25 $2,493.75 $39,273.77 $14.25 $415.63 $39,273.77
JD 72308 110 $14.25 $2,137.50 $47,860.14 $14.25 $534.38 $47,860.14 $14.25 $2,493.75 $47,147.64 $14.25 $415.63 $47,147.64
JD 7330S 125 $14.25 $2,137.50 $55,959.49 $14.25 $534.38 $55,959.49 $14.25 $2,493.75 $55,246.99 $14.25 $415.63 $55,246.99
JD 7130P 100 $14.25 $2,137.50 $65,136.57 $14.25 $534.38 $65,136.57 $14.25 $2,493.75 $55,874.07 $14.25 $415.63 $55,874.07
JD 7230P 110 $14.25 $2,137.50 $62,133.84 $14.25 $534.38 $62,133.84 $14.25 $2,493.75 $61,421.34 $14.25 $415.63 $61,421.34
JD 7330P 125 $14.25 $2,137.50 $69,873.30 $14.25 $534.38 $69,873.30 $14.25 $2,493.75 $69,160.80 $14.25 $415.63 $69,160.80
JD 7430P 140 $14.25 $2,137.50 $74,813.21 $14.25 $534.38 $74,813.21 $14.25 $2,493.75 $74,100.71 $14.25 $415.63 $74,100.71

New Holland T6030 95 $14.25 $2,137.50 $54,960.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

New Holland T6050 105 $14.25 $2,137.50 $61,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID
Case - MXU115 95 $14.00 $2,100.00 $49,000.00 $14.00 $525.00 $49,000.00 $14.00 $2,450.00 $48,500.00 $14.00 $408.33 $48,500.00
Massey Ferguson 6465 95 $10.00 $1,500.00 $55,000.00 $10.00 $375.00 $55,000.00 $12.00 $2,100.00 $55,000.00 $12.00 $350.00 $55,000.00
NO BID

New Holland T6050 105 $13.50 $2,025.00 $57,820.00 $13.50 $506.25 $57,820.00 $13.50 $2,362.50 $57,820.00 $13.50 $393.75 $57,820.00
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M&EDOT

ltem #3 (LEASE 85-115 HP Tractors)

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Earley Tractor

John Deere Company

S&H Farm Supply Inc.

Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment

Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Missouri Department of Transportation

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing
Multiple Award

Option Pricing
HP 3a 3b 3c 3d 3e. 3f 3g 3h 3i 3j 3k 3l

New Holland TS110A 90 NA NA NA $33 $220 NA $2,310 NA NA NA NA NA
New Holland T6020 Delta | 90 NA NA NA $100 $1.00/Ib. NA $3,500 NA Per Price List NA NA NA
New Holland T6030 Delta | 95 NA NA NA $100 $1.00/1b. NA $3,500 NA Per Price List NA NA NA
New Holland T6050 Delta | 105 NA NA NA $100 $1.00/1b. NA $3,500 NA Per Price List NA NA NA
New Holland T6050 Plus | 115 NA NA NA $100 $1.00/1b. NA $3,500 NA Per Price List NA NA NA
New Holland T6070 Plus | 95 NA NA NA $100 $1.00/Ib. NA $3,500 NA Per Price List NA NA NA
New Holland T6050 Elite | 105 NA NA NA $100 $1.00/1b. NA $3,500 NA Per Price List NA NA NA

JD 6403 85 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour Not Offered $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced

JD 6603 95 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour Not Offered $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced

JD 6330 85 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour Not Offered $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced

JD 6330S 85 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour Not Offered $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced

JD6430 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour Not Offered $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced

JD 6430S 95 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour Not Offered $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced

JD 71308 100 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour Not Offered $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced

JD 7230S 110 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour Not Offered $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced

JD 7330S 125 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour Not Offered $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced

JD 7130P 100 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour $0 $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced

JD 7230P 110 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour $0 $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced

JD 7330P 125 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour $0 $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced

JD 7430P 140 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour $0 $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
New Holland T6030 95 NA NA NA $100 $600 NA $6/hour NA NA NA NA NA
New Holland T6050 105 NA NA NA $100 $600 NA $6/hour NA NA NA NA NA

NO BID

MXU115 95 NA NA NA $90 $600 NA $7,000 NA $214.75 $195.00 $321.89 $547.44

Massey Ferguson 6465 95 NA NA NA $60 $1,500 NA $8,500 $4,500 $65.00 $150.00 NA NA
NO BID
New Holland T6050 105 NA NA NA No Charge No Charge NA $6.00/hour $5.00/hour $93.00 $250.00 $536.00 $663.00
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M&EDOT

ltem #4 (LEASE Smaller Frame 85-115 HP Tractors)

**Tractors are to have cabs, air conditioning and front wheel assist

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Earley Tractor

John Deere Company
S&H Farm Supply Inc.
Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment

Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Earley Tractor

John Deere Company
S&H Farm Supply Inc.
Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment

Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Missouri Department of Transportation

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing
Multiple Award

Payment Upfront

8 Month 12 Month 24 Month
Two One Two Three Cost End of Cost End of Cost End of Order by to Std Districts
Make/Model HP | Weeks Month | Months | Months Per/Hour | Lease Price | Per/Hour Lease Price Per/Hour Lease Price rec Mar 1st ARO Provided
New Holland TL100A 85 | $1,320.00 | $2,084.50 |$2,907.30| $3,729.00 $16.45 $32,044.10 $17.00 $32,376.30 $17.55 $29,181.90 10/10/07 150 days 1
New Holland T6020 Delta | 90 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,300.00 $13.95 $49,700.00 $13.95 $49,700.00 No Bid No Bid 10/31/07 120-150 days 12,4
New Holland T6030 Delta | 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,300.00 $13.95 $52,242.00 $13.95 $52,242.00 No Bid No Bid 10/31/07 120-150 days 1,24
New Holland T6050 Delta | 105 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,300.00 $13.95 $51,199.00 $13.95 $51,199.00 No Bid No Bid 10/31/07 120-150 days 124
New Holland T6050 Plus | 115 | No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,300.00 $13.95 $57,139.00 $13.95 $57,139.00 No Bid No Bid 10/31/07 120-150 days 1,24
New Holland T6070 Plus 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,300.00 $13.95 $61,673.00 $13.95 $61,673.00 No Bid No Bid 10/31/07 120-150 days 124
New Holland T6050 Elite | 105 | No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,300.00 $13.95 $66,873.00 $13.95 $66,873.00 No Bid No Bid 10/31/07 120-150 days 1,24
JD 6330 85 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $3,400.00 $14.25 $43,464.61 $14.25 $42,915.11 $16.25 $39,487.21 10/09/07 90-180 days All
NO BID
NO BID
Case - MXU110 920 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $13.00 $46,500.00 $13.00 $45,000.00 $13.00 $43,000.00 10/10/07 160 days 9
AGCO LT959 95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 $10.00 $52,000.00 $12.00 $52,000.00 $15.00 $52,000.00 11/01/07 120 days 5
New Holland T5060 85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 $14.25 $43,100.00 $14.25 $43,100.00 $14.25 $43,100.00 10/17/07 60-180 days 5
New Holland TL100A 85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.00 $37,000.00 No Bid No Bid 10/10/07 155 days 4
Installments Installments
8 Month (300 Hours) 12 Month (350 Hours)
Cost Semi (2) End of Cost Monthly End of Cost Semi (2) End of Cost Monthly End of
Make/Model HP. Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price | Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price Per/Hour Install.'s Lease Price
New Holland TL100A 85 $16.45 $2,466.75 $32,044.10 $16.45 $616.68 $32,044.10 $17.00 $2,974.13 $31,973.70 $17.00 $495.68 $31,973.70
New Holland T6020 Delta | 90 $15.00 $2,250.00 $49,700.00 $15.00 $562.50 $49,700.00 $15.00 $2,625.00 $49,700.00 $15.00 $437.50 $49,700.00
New Holland T6030 Delta | 95 $15.00 $2,250.00 $52,242.00 $15.00 $562.50 $52,242.00 $15.00 $2,625.00 $52,242.00 $15.00 $437.50 $52,242.00
New Holland T6050 Delta | 105 $15.00 $2,250.00 $51,199.00 $15.00 $562.50 $51,199.00 $15.00 $2,625.00 $51,199.00 $15.00 $437.50 $51,199.00
New Holland T6050 Plus | 115 $15.00 $2,250.00 $57,139.00 $15.00 $562.50 $57,139.00 $15.00 $2,625.00 $57,139.00 $15.00 $437.50 $57,139.00
New Holland T6070 Plus | 95 $15.00 $2,250.00 $61,673.00 $15.00 $562.50 $61,673.00 $15.00 $2,625.00 $61,673.00 $15.00 $437.50 $61,673.00
New Holland T6050 Elite | 105 $15.00 $2,250.00 $66,873.00 $15.00 $562.50 $66,873.00 $15.00 $2,625.00 $66,873.00 $15.00 $437.50 $66,873.00
JD 6330 85 $14.25 $2,137.50 $43,464.61 $14.25 $534.38 $43,464.61 $14.25 $2,493.75 $42,915.11 $14.25 $415.63 $42,9165.11
NO BID
NO BID
Case - MXU110 90 $13.00 $1,950.00 $46,500.00 $13.00 $487.50 $46,500.00 $13.00 $2,275.00 $45,000.00 $13.00 $379.16 $45,000.00
AGCO LT959 95 $10.00 $1,500.00 $52,000.00 $10.00 $375.00 $52,000.00 $12.00 $2,100.00 $52,000.00 $12.00 $350.00 $52,000.00
New Holland T5060 85 $14.25 $2,137.50 $43,100.00 $14.25 $534.38 $43,100.00 $14.25 $2,493.75 $43,100.00 $14.25 $415.63 $43,100.00
New Holland TL100A 85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.00 $1,925.00 $37,000.00 $11.00 $320.83 $37,000.00
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M&EDOT

ltem #4 (LEASE Smaller Frame 85-115 HP Tractors

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Earley Tractor

John Deere Company
S&H Farm Supply Inc.
Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment

Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing

Multiple Award

Two One Two Three Option Pricing
HP Weeks Month Months | Months 4a 4bh 4c(ded: 4d 4e 4f 49 4h 4i 4j 4k 41
New Holland TL100A 85 NA NA NA $66 $267 NA $2,310 NA NA NA NA NA
New Holland T6020 Delta | 90 NA NA NA $100 $1.00/Ib. NA $3,500 NA Per Price List NA NA NA
New Holland T6030 Delta | 95 NA NA NA $100 $1.00/1b. NA $3,500 NA Per Price List NA NA NA
New Holland T6050 Delta | 105 NA NA NA $100 $1.00/1b. NA $3,500 NA Per Price List NA NA NA
New Holland T6050 Plus | 115 NA NA NA $100 $1.00/1b. NA $3,500 NA Per Price List NA NA NA
New Holland T6070 Plus | 95 NA NA NA $100 $1.00/Ib. NA $3,500 NA Per Price List NA NA NA
New Holland T6050 Elite | 105 NA NA NA $100 $1.00/1b. NA $3,500 NA Per Price List NA NA NA
JD 6330 85 Not Offered $0 $0 $0 $0 $0 $6/hour NA $80.00 $275.00 Sourced Sourced
NO BID
NO BID
Case - MXU110 90 NA NA NA $90 $600 NA $7,000 NA $214.75 $195.00 $303.03 $520.46
AGCO LT959 95 -$6,500 NA -$4,200 $60 $1,500 NA $7,000 NA $65.00 $150.00 Sourced Sourced
New Holland T5060 85 NA NA NA $1.00/LB. $1.00/LB. NA $6,800 NA $80.00 $250.00 NA NA
New Holland TL100A 85 NA NA NA No Charge No Charge NA $5.00/hour NA $93.00 $250.00 $536.00 $663.00
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MOD>OT Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing
Multiple Award

ltem #5 (PURCHASE 40-50 HP Tractors)

**Tractors are to have front wheel assist and ROPS with canopies

Base Option Pricing Std Districts
Vendor HP Price 5a 5b 5c 5d 5e 5f 59 5h 5i 5j ARO Provided
St. Joseph Tractor New Holland TN60A 45 $24,059.20 $6,315.10 NA -$3,118.50 $82.50 $381.70 NA $5,691.40 $337.70 NA NA 150 days 124
Earley Tractor NO BID
John Deere Company JD 4320 40 $18,950.71 $4,379.27 NA NA $51.10 $181.04 In Base Price | $3,117.10 $277.40 Sourced Sourced 60-90 days All
JD 4520 45 $20,111.71 $4,379.27 NA NA $51.10 $181.04 In Base Price | $3,117.10 $277.40 Sourced Sourced 60-90 days All
JD 4720 50 $22,334.26 $4,729.67 NA NA $51.10 $181.04 In Base Price | $3,117.10 $277.40 Sourced Sourced 60-90 days All
JD 5203 47 $16,608.87 NA NA -$3,493.05 $55.48 $189.80 $22.81  [$3504.73/2WD)| NA Sourced Sourced 60-90 days All
JD 5225 45 $23,971.32 $6,485.32 NA -$4,047.85 $55.48 $173.74 $30.49 $4,819.46 $424.86 Sourced Sourced 60-90 days All
S&H Farm Supply Inc. NO BID
Davis Farm Supplies NO BID
Vestal Equipment NO BID
Lauf Equipment Massey Ferguson 2615 40 $18,000.00 NA Included -$2,000.00 $60.00 $2.00/1b. Included $6,000.00 NA Sourced Sourced 120 days 5
Crown Power & Equipment NO BID
Golden Valley Tractor NO BID
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M&EDOT

ltem #6 (PURCHASE 55-75 HP Tractors)

**Tractors are to have cabs, air conditioning and front wheel assist

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Early Tractor
John Deere Company

S&H Farm Supply Inc.
Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment
Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Missouri Department of Transportation

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing
Multiple Award

Base Option Pricing | Std Districts
Make/Model HP Price 6a 6b 6c 6d 6e 6f 69 6h 6i 6] ARO Provided
New Holland TN75D 62 $31,845.00 -$5,723.30 NA -$3,311.00 $82.50 $552.20 NA $5,691.40 NA NA NA 150 days 124
NO BID
JD 5303 55 $17,883.45 NA NA -$3,493.05 $55.48 $189.80 $22.81  [$3504.73/2WD NA Sourced Sourced 60-90 days All
JD 5403 64 $19,744.95 NA NA -$3,493.05 $55.48 $189.80 $22.81 1$3504.73/2WD NA Sourced Sourced 60-90 days All
JD 5325 55 $31,683.13 -$5,585.32 NA -$4,124.50 $55.48 $173.74 $30.49 $4,819.46 $424.86 Sourced Sourced 60-90 days All
JD 5425 65 $34,041.03 -$5,585.32 NA -$4,214.29 $55.48 $173.74 $30.49 $4,819.46 $424.86 Sourced Sourced 60-90 days All
JD 5525 75 $36,637.64 -$5,585.32 NA -$4,214.29 $55.48 $173.74 $30.49 $4,819.46 $424.86 Sourced Sourced 60-90 days All
JD 5603 82 $32,905.29 NA NA NA $58.40 $182.50 $22.81 $5,214.39 $424.86 Sourced Sourced 60-90 days All
JD 5625 82 $37,337.31 -$5,585.32 NA NA $58.40 $182.50 $22.81 $5,214.39 $424.86 Sourced Sourced 60-90 days All
JD 6230 75 $45,051.95 [Cab only optiol NA -$5,799.85 $55.48 $181.04 NA $6,213.04 199.29 2WD Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
JD 6230S 75 $39,685.71 -$5,706.50 NA -$5,602.02 $58.40 $189.80 NA $6,110.84 $202.94/2WD Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
NO BID
NO BID
Case - JX1095C 90 $30,750.00 -$5,000.00 NA -$3,200.00 $90.00 $600.00 NA $6,000.00 $360.00 $400.00 $600.00 160 days 8
Massey Ferguson 3625 | 55 $32,000.00 | -$6,500.00 Included -$3,500.00 $60.00 $2.00/1b. Included $6,500.00 $580.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
Massey Ferguson 3635 65 $34,900.00 | -$6,500.00 Included -$3,500.00 $60.00 $150/each Included $6,500.00 $580.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
Massey Ferguson 3645 75 $37,500.00 | -$6,500.00 Included -$3,500.00 $60.00 $150/each Included $6,500.00 $580.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
Massey Ferguson 573 60 $31,900.00 -$6,500.00 NA -$3,500.00 $60.00 $150.00 NA $6,500.00 $400.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
Massey Ferguson 583 70 $33,900.00 -$6,500.00 NA -$3,500.00 $60.00 $150.00 NA $6,500.00 $400.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
Massey Ferguson 70 $45,500.00 -$7,000.00 NA -$4,500.00 $60.00 $150.00 NA $7,000.00 $650.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
NO BID
NO BID
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M&EDOT

ltem #7 (PURCHASE 85-115 HP Tractors)

**Tractors are to have cabs, air conditioning and front wheel assist

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Earley Tractor
John Deere Company

S&H Farm Supply Inc.
Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment
Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Missouri Department of Transportation

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing

Multiple Award

Base Option Pricing Std Districts
Make/Model HP Price 7a 7b 7c 7d 7e 7f 79 7h 7i 7i ARO Provided
New Holland TS110 920 $45,840.30 -$5,512.10 -$5,608.90 $88.00 $518.10 NA $7,872.70 $2,605.90 $503.80 NA NA 150 days 124
New Holland T6020 90 $46,500.00 NA NA $100.00 $600.00 NA $8,900.00 NA $595.00 NA NA 120-150 days 12345
JD 6403 85 $35,723.28 -$4,867.00 -$5,094.67 $55.48 $278.13 NA $5,008.53 NA $434.35 Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
JD 6603 95 $39,131.65 -$4,867.00 -$5,165.48 $55.48 $278.13 NA $5,008.53 NA $434.35 Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
JD 6330 85 $46,761.61 [ab Only Optiof -$5,799.85 $55.48 $181.04 NA $6,881.72 NA 199.29 2WD Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
JD 6330S 85 $42,218.82 -$5,223.97 -$6,048.78 $58.40 $189.80 NA $6,110.84 NA $202.94/2WD Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
JD 6430 95 $49,157.47 [ab Only Optiof -$5,799.85 $55.48 $181.04 NA $6,881.72 NA 199.29 2WD Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
JD 6430S 95 $44,782.58 -$6,085.37 -$6,048.78 $58.40 $189.80 NA $6,881.71 NA $202.94/2WD Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
JD 71308 100 $49,656.06 -$5,394.79 -$6,048.78 $58.40 $189.80 NA $6,881.71 NA $202.94/2WD Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
JD 7230S 110 $52,135.14 -$6,052.52 -$6,048.78 $58.40 $189.80 NA $6,881.71 NA $202.94/2WD Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
JD 73308 125 $60,234.49 | -$10,202.48 | -$4,689.52 $58.40 $189.80 NA $7,719.75 NA Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
JD 7130P 100 $60,861.57 NA -$6,164.12 $58.40 $189.80 NA $7,597.84 $2,987.15 Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
JD 7230P 110 $66,408.84 NA -$6,164.12 $58.40 $189.80 NA $7,597.84 $2,987.15 Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
JD 7330P 125 $74,148.30 NA -$6,164.12 $58.40 $189.80 NA $7,597.84 $2,987.15 Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
JD 7430P 140 $79,088.21 NA NA $58.40 $189.80 NA $7,597.84 $2,987.15 Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
NO BID
New Holland TL100 85 $38,277.00 -$5,900.00 -$6,100.00 $100.00 $366.00 $56.00 $6,048.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 120 days 10
Case - MXU115 95 $48,500.00 NA -$7,000.00 $90.00 $600.00 NA $7,950.00 NA $590.00 $540.00 $800.00 160 days 8
Massey Ferguson 5465 95 $55,000.00 NA -$4,500.00 $60.00 $150.00 NA $8,000.00 NA $650.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
Massey Ferguson 5475 110 $59,000.00 NA -$4,500.00 $60.00 $150.00 NA $8,000.00 NA $650.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
Massey Ferguson 6465 100 $65,000.00 NA -$7,000.00 $60.00 $150.00 NA $8,000.00 NA $950.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
Massey Ferguson 6475 110 $71,000.00 NA -$7,000.00 $60.00 $150.00 NA $8,000.00 $6,000.00 $950.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
NO BID
New Holland T6050 105 $57,820.00 NA NA NA NA NA $7,500.00 NA $600.00 NA NA 155 days 4
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M&EDOT

ltem #8 (PURCHASE Smaller Frame 85-115 HP Tractors)

**Tractors are to have cabs, air conditioning and front wheel assist

Vendor
St. Joseph Tractor
Earley Tractor
John Deere Company
S&H Farm Supply Inc.
Davis Farm Supplies
Vestal Equipment
Lauf Equipment

Crown Power & Equipment
Golden Valley Tractor

Missouri Department of Transportation

Bid Tabulation of Request 3-061003 Lease/Purchase Tractors 2008 Pricing
Multiple Award

Base Option Pricing Std Districts
HP Price 8a 8b 8c 8d 8e 8f 8g 8h 8i 8j ARO Provided
New Holland TL100A 85 $36,890.70 -$4,056.80 -$4,364.80 $2,605.90 $88.00 $377.30 NA $6,497.70 $429.00 NA NA 150 days 124
NO BID
JD 6330 85 $46,761.61 NA -$5,799.85 NA $55.48 $181.04 NA $6,110.84 199.29 2WD Sourced Sourced 90-180 days All
NO BID
NO BID
Case - MXU110 95 $47,500.00 NA -$5,000.00 NA $90.00 $600.00 NA $6,000.00 $360.00 $500.00 $700.00 160 days 8
Massey Ferguson 596 85 $36,900.00 -$6,500.00 NA $3,500.00 $60.00 $150.00 NA $6,500.00 $400.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
Massey Ferguson 5455 85 $50,000.00 -$7,500.00 -$4,500.00 NA $60.00 $150.00 NA $7,000.00 $650.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
Massey Ferguson 5460 95 $53,500.00 -$7,500.00 -$4,500.00 NA $60.00 $150.00 NA $7,000.00 $650.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
Massey Ferguson 5470 105 $59,000.00 NA -$4,500.00 NA $60.00 $150.00 NA $7,500.00 $650.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
Massey Ferguson 5480 115 $63,000.00 NA -$4,500.00 NA $60.00 $150.00 NA $7,500.00 $650.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
AGCO LT85A 85 $50,500.00 -$7,500.00 -$4,500.00 NA $60.00 $150.00 NA $7,500.00 $650.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
AGCO LT959 95 $54,000.00 -$7,500.00 -$4,500.00 NA $60.00 $150.00 NA $7,500.00 $650.00 Sourced Sourced 120 days All
New Holland T5060 85 $43,100.00 NA NA NA $1.00/LB. $1.00/LB. NA $6,800.00 Included NA NA 60-180 days 5
New Holland TL100A 85 $37,000.00 NA NA NA No Charge No Charge NA $6,750.00 NA NA NA 155 days 4
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