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General Services

Thank you for your response to our Request for Quotation D609-026 —RB Road Sand As Needed For your information, the following is a tabulation

of all responses which were received. . If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown above.

Nance, Sr. Procurement Agent.

Buyer: Athena

Description
Central Stone Co Bussen Quarries Fred Weber* LaFarge North
America**
ROAD SAND
Pick Up | Delivered | Pick Up Delivered | Pick Up | Delivered | Pick Up Delivered

St. Louis City & St. Louis County | $3.75/ton | No Bid $4.90/ton | $9.10/ton | $5.40/ton | No Bid $6.00/ton | $11.00

(average) | (FOB/RYS)
St. Charles County $3.75/ton | No Bid $4.90/ton | No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.00/ton | $11.00
Jefferson & $3.75/ton | No Bid $4.90/ton | $9.10/ton | $5.90/ton | No Bid $6.00/ton | No Bid
Franklin Counties (average) | (FOB/CC)

*Fred Weber Plant Sites — (RS) Rutger Street, 1104 S. Wharft, St. Louis, MO (CC) Crystal City, 100 Howard Dohack Drive, Crystal, City, MO

**LaFarge Plant Sites — St. Charles- River Road, St. Charles-Defiance, Warren County-Wright City, Warren County-Warrenton,

Sedalia, Marshall, Pettis County, Independence, Courtney Ridge/Independence
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Description
Washington Sand Co B.Hoelscher
ROAD SAND
Pick Up | Delivered | Pick Up Delivered
St. Louis City & St. Louis County | $6.80/ton | No Bid NoBid | $11.50
St. Charles County $6.80/ton | No Bid NoBid | $11.50
Jefferson & $6.80/ton | No Bid No Bid | $12.00
Franklin Counties




