MSDOT

Missouri Department of Transportation - District 5

Bid Tabulation of Request Q5-07-029 Ligiud Calcium Tank

VENDORS / PRICE PER EACH

ITEM # Description Sun-Day Corporation | Varitech Industries, Inc. Snyder Industries | Corrosion Products Inc.
Brand: PPC Brand: Snyder 6,000 VST Brand: Snyder Brand: Snyder
6,000 Gal. Vertical Color: l\!at/Gree.n/GoId Color: Translucent Color: White/Natural Color: Translucent
Alternative Size: 6,150
1 gallon
Lot Price (Qty 1-5) $6,285.64 $4,601.60 $4,693.50 $4,650.00
Lot Price (Qty 6-10) $6,009.50 $4,192.80 $4,301.81 $4,255.00
Lot Price (Qty 10 or more) $5,731.09 $4,029.00 $4,137.45 $4,085.00
Delivery 3-4 Weeks 45 Days ARO 3-6 Weeks 4-6 Weeks ARO
Brand: PPC Brand: Snyder 6,500 Captor Brand: Snyder Brand: Snyder
6,000 Gal. Vertical Storage Tank, Color: Nat/Green/Gold Color: Translucent Color: White/Natural Color: Translucent Alternative
Double Wall Containment Alternative Size: 6,650 Size: 6,500 gallon
2 gallon
Lot Price (Qty 1-5) $13,114.05 $10,746.90 $11,047.20 $11,000.00
Lot Price (Qty 6-10) $12,567.45 $10,347.90 $10,657.20 $10,600.00
Lot Price (Qty 10 or more) $12,203.82 $9,975.50 $10,272.20 $10,220.00
Delivery 3-4 Weeks 45 Days ARO 3-6 Weeks 4-6 Weeks ARO
Brand: PPC Brand: Snyder 10,500 VST Brand: Snyder Brand: Snyder
. Color: Nat/Green/Gold : Color: White/Natural Color: Translucent Alternative
10,000 Gal. Vertical StorageTank Alternative Size: 10,300 Color: Translucent Size: 10,500 gallon
3 gallon
Lot Price (Qty 1-5) $10,957.55 $8,751.90 $8,964.48 $8,915.00
Lot Price (Qty 6-10) $10,684.82 $8,218.60 $8,440.53 $8,420.00
Lot Price (Qty 10 or more) $10,412.09 $8,058.10 $8,274.56 $8,250.00
Delivery 3-4 Weeks 45 Days ARO 3-6 Weeks 4-6 Weeks ARO
10,000 Vertical Storage Tank, Double
4 Wall Containment No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: PPC

4 (Alternative)

8,700 Gallon SAFE Tank (Double Wall
Containment)

Color: Nat/Green/Gold

Lot Price (Qty 1-5) $16,574.59 - - -
Lot Price (Qty 6-10) $15,872.32 - - -
Lot Price (Qty 10 or more) $15,406.41 - - -
Delivery 3-4 Weeks - - -

Bold Denotes Low Bidder - This is not an order

Prepared by Corey Duemmel
General Services

(573) 526-6956




