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Thank you for your response to our Request for Informal Quotation # “D8X2-8056". For your information, the following is a tabulation of all
responses which were received. This quotation was awarded to;_Multiple vendors highlighted below. If you have any questions, please contact me
at the address/phone number shown below. Buyer; Richard Gardner, Senior G.S. Technician.

VENDOR Item # 1 Item # 2 Item # 3
Little Bluestem Canada Wild Rye | Virginia Wild
(Schizachyrium Scoparium) (Elymus Candensis) Rye
(Elymus Candensis —

Variety — (Cuivre River)
Bamert Seed Co. $8.70 Ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid
GreenSeed No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.90 Ib.
Pure Air Native Seed Company $18.00 Ib. $10.00 Ib. $10.00 Ib. No Bid
Hamilton Native Outpost $10.75 $6.75 Ib. $14.75 1b No Bid
BW!I Companies Inc. $10.34 Ib. $7.83 Ib. 9.00 Ib. $3.24 Ib.
Sharp Bros. Seed Co. of MO, Inc. No Bid $7.00 Ib $7.00 Ib. No Bid
S & S Seeds, LLC. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Branneky True Value Hardware $12.00 Ib. $9.50 Ib. $9.00 Ib. $4.00 Ib.

Evergreen Seed LLC. $11.40 Ib. $12.25 Ib $12.50 $2.981b. |
Pennington Seed No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.00

ADDITIONAL NOTES:

Richard Gardner, CPPB
Senior General Service Technician

Phone: 417-895-7811



