M&DOT  Missouri Department of Transportation - District 5

d Tabulation of Request D5-09-036Q Walk Behind Mowers

Prices good through September 30, 2009

Iltem 1: Region 1 (Sedalia)

VENDORS

Graessle's Sales &

Fluegel Equipment

Farm Power-Lawn & Leisure

Service
17 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $4,879.00 $4,789.00 $4,649.00
Brand/Modell Encore WB48K17H Husqvarna WHF4817 John Deere 7H17
Delivery 2 wks 2 wk 30 days
19 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $5,836.00
Brand/Model NO BID NO BID Exmark THP19KAE483
Delivery| 30 days
19 HP w/ 54" Deck
Unit Price $5,115.00 $5,149.00
Brand/Model NO BID Husqvarna WHF5221 John Deere 7H19
Delivery 2 wks 30 days

* Electric start:
$125.00

Bold Denotes Low Bidder - This is not an order

Prepared by Sheldon Redel

General Services
(573) 751-7708




MoDOT

Missouri Department of Transportation - District 5
3id Tabulation of Request D5-09-036Q Walk Behind Mowers

Prices good through September 30, 2009

Item 2: Region 2 (Boonville, Columbia)

VENDORS
Graessle‘g Sales & Fluegel Equipment |Farm Power-Lawn & Leisure
Service
17 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $4,879.00 $4,789.00 $4,625.00
Brand/Model|] Encore WB48K17H | Husqvarna WHF4817 John Deere 7H17
Delivery| 2 wks 2 wks 30 days
19 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $5,836.00
Brand/Model NO BID NO BID Exmark THP19KAE483
Delivery| 30 days
19 HP w/ 54" Deck
Unit Price $5,115.00 $5,125.00
Brand/Model NO BID Husqvarna WHF5221 John Deere 7H19
Delivery 2 wks 30 days

* Electric start:
$125.00

Bold Denotes Low Bidder - This is not an order

Prepared by Sheldon Redel
General Services
(573) 751-7708



MoDOT

Missouri Department of Transportation - District 5

id Tabulation of Request D5-09-036Q Walk Behind Mowers

Prices good through September 30, 2009

Iltem 3: Region 3 (Jefferson City, Fulton, Meta, Linn)

VENDORS

Graessle's Sales &

Fluegel Equipment

Service
17 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $4,879.00 $4,789.00 $4,649.00
Brand/Model|] Encore WB48K17H | Husqvarna WHF4817 John Deere 7H17
Delivery| 2 wks 2 wks 30 days
19 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $5,836.20
Brand/Model NO BID NO BID Exmark THP19KAE483
Delivery| 30 days
19 HP w/ 54" Deck
Unit Price $5,115.00 $5,149.00
Brand/Model NO BID Husqvarna WHF5221 John Deere 7H19
Delivery| 2 wks 30 days

* Electric start:
$125.00

Bold Denotes Low Bidder - This is not an order

Prepared by Sheldon Redel

General Services
(573) 751-7708

Farm Power-Lawn & Leisure




MoDOT

Missouri Department of Transportation - District 5
yid Tabulation of Request D5-09-036Q Walk Behind Mowers

Prices good through September 30, 2009

Iltem 4: Region 4 (Versailles, Osage Beach, Iberia)

VENDORS

Graessle's Sales &

Fluegel Equipment

Service
17 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $4,879.00 $4,789.00 $4,690.00
Brand/Model|] Encore WB48K17H | Husqvarna WHF4817 John Deere 7H17
Delivery| 2 wks 2 wks 30 days
19 HP w/ 48" Deck
Unit Price $5,836.20
Brand/Model NO BID NO BID Exmark THP19KAE483
Delivery| 30 days
19 HP w/ 54" Deck
Unit Price $5,115.00 $5,190.00
Brand/Model NO BID Husqvarna WHF5221 John Deere 7H19
Delivery| 2 wks 30 days

* Electric start:
$125.00

Bold Denotes Low Bidder - This is not an order

Prepared by Sheldon Redel

General Services
(573) 751-7708

Farm Power-Lawn & Leisure




