M D OT Central District
o David T. Silvester, District Engineer

1511 Missouri Blvd.

P.O. Box 718

Jefferson City, Missouri 65102
573.751.3322

Fax: 573.522.1059

1.888.ASK MODOT (275.6636)

June 23, 2015

Thank you for your response to our Request for Bid # CD-15-075B Front Mount Brooms. Following is a tabulation of all responses which were received. This bid has been awarded to: S&H Farm
Supply.

Buyer: Derek VanLoo, Procurement Agent
CD-15-075B Front Mount Broom

. Cummings,
ITEM | UM | QTY DESCRIPTION S&H Farm Crown POWer |4 oy Tractor Tri-State Old Dominion | 16 van and
Supply and Equipment Brush Co. West
Sweepster Front Mount Broom Model
MCH with Brush Head Number
1 EA 1 QC32P8D18, Swivel Kit 284612, no $5,750.00 $5,800.00 $6,105.00 $6,390.00 $7,950.00 No Bid
mounting brackets required_ 15-20 dayS 15 days 15 days 20-25 days 30 days
Delivered to Boonville, MO
Sweepster Front Mount Broom Model
MCH with Brush Head Number
2 EA 1 QC32P8D18, Swivel Kit 284612, no $5,750.00 $5,800.00 $6,105.00 $6,390.00 $7,950.00 No Bid
mounting brackets required. 15-20 days 15 days 15 days 20-25 days 30 days
Delivered to Versailles, MO
Sweepster Front Mount Broom Model
MCH with Brush Head Number
3 EA 1 QC32P8D18, Swivel Kit 284612, no $5,750.00 $5,800.00 $6,105.00 $6,390.00 $7,950.00 No Bid
mounting brackets required_ 15-20 dayS 15 days 15 days 20-25 days 30 days
Delivered to Columbia, MO
Sweepster Front Mount Broom Model
MCH with Brush Head Number
4 EA 1 QC32P8D18, Swivel Kit 284612, no $5,607.00 $5,800.00 $6,105.00 $6,390.00 $7,950.00 No Bid
mounting brackets required. 15-20 days 15 days 15 days 20-25 days 30 days
Delivered to Lebanon, MO
. : $490.00 $575.00 $540.00 $560.00 $740.00 .
5 EA 1 Optional Drape Kit 28-10312-8 15-20 days 15 days 15 days 20-25 days 30 days No Bid

A total of 76 vendors (7 of which were MBE/WBE/DBE vendors) were sent notification of the online posting of this RFB opportunity. Zero MBE/WBE/DBE vendors replied.

oDOT Our mission is to provide a world-class transportation experience that
delights our customers and promotes a prosperous Missouri.

www.modot.org



VENDORS

S&H Farm Supply Inc.

Attn: Chris LaGrange

5969 E US Hwy 60

Rogersville MO 65742

Phone: 417-865-5252

Cell: 417-350-2350

Fax: 417-865-3864

Email: chris.lagrange@shfarmsupply.com

Crown Power and Equipment

Attn: Joe Helming

3621 Rockport Hills Rd

Jefferson City MO 65101

Phone: 573-636-5281

Cell: 573-680-9302

Fax: 573-636-5680

Email: jhelming@crown-power.com

Murphy Tractor and Equipment Co
Attn: Daniel Dooley

8600 NE Parvin Rd

Kansas City MO 64161

Phone: 816-483-5000

Cell: 816-595-1281

Fax: 816-483-5721

Email: ddooley@murphytractor.com

Tri-State Construction Equipment Company
Attn: Kevin Smyser

6787 County Road 312

Paymyra MO 63461

Phone: 573-769-2274

Cell: 573-248-6455

Fax: 573-769-4880

Email: kevinsmyser@meoi.com

Old Dominion Brush Co.
Attn: Chad Smith

1525 N Commerce Ave.
Kansas City MO 64120
Phone: 800-821-7301
Fax: 816-241-6765

Email: chads@odbkc.com

Cummings, McGowan & West
8668 Olive Blvd

St Louis Mo 63132

Phone: 314-993-1336

Fax: 314-993-1467

Email info@cmw-equip.com
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