
Missouri Department of Transportation – Kansas City District 
Propane Bid Tabulation 

Bid # KC-B13-012 

 

MoDOT Location Amerigas Propane, L.P. MFA Oil Company Nash Gas Co. Mid States Propane Inc. 

Belton 1.284 1.285 1.49 No Bid 

Harrisonville 1.284 1.285 No Bid No Bid 

Stadium Radio Tower 1.284 1.285 1.49 No Bid 

Warrensburg 1.284 1.285 No Bid No Bid 

Warrensburg Striping 1.284 1.285 No Bid No Bid 

Warrensburg Paint Bldg. 1.284 1.285 No Bid No Bid 

Odessa 1.284 1.285 No Bid No Bid 

Platte City 1.284 1.29 1.44 1.34 

Nashua 1.284 1.29 1.48 1.34 

Nashua RE Office 1.284 1.29 1.48 1.34 

Dearborn Rest Area 1.284 1.29 1.44 1.34 

Richmond 1.284 1.285 No Bid No Bid 

Marshall Jct. 1.284 1.285 No Bid No Bid 

 
Low Bid Award 
 
Bid Opened:  May 30, 2013 at 1:00 PM 
Tabulation Posted:  June 6, 2013 at 10:50 AM  


