
 
MoDOT – Kansas City District 
Concrete Ready Mix – TYPE I 

KC-B13-005 – Pricing for 8 ½ Bag Per CUYD 
April 2, 2013 through March 31, 2014 

                                                  

     Note:  Low bid determined by requirements of each project using the base price plus any pricing listed in the additional comments column. 

VENDOR CASS CLAY JACKSON JOHNSON LAFAYETTE PETTIS PLATTE RAY SALINE ADDITIONAL COMMENTS 
 

Fischer Concrete 
Services, LLC 
660-826-3122 (P) 
660-826-3124 (F) 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$118.80 

 
No Bid 

 
$121.18 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$118.90 

1% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $2.50 
2% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $5.00 
Hot Water Charge - $4.00 
Short Load Charge - $50.00 
Night Delivery Charge - $35.00 Per Hour (Per Man) 
*Night time charges apply 1-hour before job starts and 
ends 1-hour after job  is completed (per man includes 
plant manager and drivers). 
*Pettis County is bid out of our West Central Concrete 
plant west of Sedalia. 

 
VENDOR CASS CLAY JACKSON JOHNSON LAFAYETTE PETTIS PLATTE RAY SALINE ADDITIONAL COMMENTS 

 
Geiger Ready Mix 
Company, Inc. 
913-281-0111 (P) 
913-281-1492 (F) 

 
No Bid 

 
$115.90 

 
$115.90 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$115.90 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

1% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $2.25 
2% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $4.50 
Hot Water Charge - $4.50 
Short Load Charge - $90 <5 cy 
Night Delivery:  6:00PM-6:00AM Monday-Friday, 
$180/hour for plant and $55.00/hour for each truck. 
Weekends:  Noon Saturday-6:00AM Monday, 
$220/hour for plant and $65/hour for each truck. 
Fuel Surcharge:  As per load, based on the DOE 
Midwest Energy Chart. (Subject to change.  Please refer 
to www.geigerreadymix.com for up to date surcharge.) 

 
VENDOR CASS CLAY JACKSON JOHNSON LAFAYETTE PETTIS PLATTE RAY SALINE ADDITIONAL COMMENTS 

 
Penny’s 
Concrete, Inc. 
913-667-6552 (P) 

 
$109.00 

 
$109.00 

 
$109.00 

 
$114.50 

 
$123.50 

 
No Bid 

 
$109.00 

 
$118.50 

 
$114.50 

1% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $3.50 
2% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $7.00 
Hot Water Charge - $4.50 
Short Load Charge - $50.00 
Night Delivery Charge - $600/hr-minimum 3 hours 
Deliveries to Cass County are limited to the City of  
Harrisonville and Northwest. 
Deliveries to Johnson County are limited to North of  
Hwy 50 (NW of Warrensburg). 
Deliveries to Platte County are limited to Platte City  
and South. 
Deliveries to Saline County are limited to all of I-70 West 
of Route J; Rt. 65 North of I-70, 5 miles. 
Night deliveries are possible on a case by case basis as 
we are dependent on the availability of driver hours. 

 
VENDOR CASS CLAY JACKSON JOHNSON LAFAYETTE PETTIS PLATTE RAY SALINE ADDITIONAL COMMENTS 

 
Show Me Ready 
Mix, LLC 
816-525-0570 (P) 
816-525-0411 (F) 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$123.00 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

1% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $2.00 
2% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $4.00 
Hot Water Charge - $4.50, Short Load Charge - $70.00 
Night Delivery Charge - $400.00 Opening Fee 
Prior to 5:00AM after 6:00PM night charges applies. 
Fuel surcharge - $15.00 per load. 

 

http://www.geigerreadymix.com/


 
MoDOT – Kansas City District 
Concrete Ready Mix – TYPE Ill 

KC-B13-005 – Pricing for 8 ½ Bag Per CUYD 
April 2, 2013 through March 31, 2014 

 

     Note:  Low bid determined by requirements of each project using the base price plus any pricing listed in the additional comments column. 

VENDOR CASS CLAY JACKSON JOHNSON LAFAYETTE PETTIS PLATTE RAY SALINE ADDITIONAL COMMENTS 
 
Fischer Concrete 
Services, LLC 
660-826-3122 (P) 
660-826-3124 (F) 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

1% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $2.50 
2% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $5.00 
Hot Water Charge - $4.00 
Short Load Charge - $50.00 
Night Delivery Charge - $35.00 Per Hour (Per Man) 
*Night time charges apply 1-hour before job starts and 
ends 1-hour after job  is completed (per man includes 
plant manager and drivers). 
*Pettis County is bid out of our West Central Concrete 
plant west of Sedalia. 

 
VENDOR CASS CLAY JACKSON JOHNSON LAFAYETTE PETTIS PLATTE RAY SALINE ADDITIONAL COMMENTS 

 
Geiger Ready Mix 
Company, Inc. 
913-281-0111 (P) 
913-281-1492 (F) 

 
No Bid 

 

 
$126.25 

 
$126.25 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$126.25 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

1% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $2.25 
2% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $4.50 
Hot Water Charge - $4.50 
Short Load Charge - $90 <5 cy 
Night Delivery:  6:00PM-6:00AM Monday-Friday, 
$180/hour for plant and $55.00/hour for each truck. 
Weekends:  Noon Saturday-6:00AM Monday, 
$220/hour for plant and $65/hour for each truck. 
Fuel Surcharge:  As per load, based on the DOE 
Midwest Energy Chart. (Subject to change.  Please refer 
to www.geigerreadymix.com for up to date surcharge.) 

 
VENDOR CASS CLAY JACKSON JOHNSON LAFAYETTE PETTIS PLATTE RAY SALINE ADDITIONAL COMMENTS 

 
Penny’s 
Concrete, Inc. 
913-667-6552 (P) 

 
$121.00 

 
$121.00 

 
$121.00 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$121.00 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

1% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $3.50 
2% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $7.00 
Hot Water Charge - $4.50 
Short Load Charge - $50.00 
Night Delivery Charge - $600/hr-minimum 3 hours 
Deliveries to Cass County are limited to the City of  
Harrisonville and Northwest. 
Deliveries to Johnson County are limited to North of  
Hwy 50 (NW of Warrensburg). 
Deliveries to Platte County are limited to Platte City  
and South. 
Deliveries to Saline County are limited to all of I-70 West 
of Route J; Rt. 65 North of I-70, 5 miles. 
Night deliveries are possible on a case by case basis as 
we are dependent on the availability of driver hours. 

 
VENDOR CASS CLAY JACKSON JOHNSON LAFAYETTE PETTIS PLATTE RAY SALINE ADDITIONAL COMMENTS 

 
Show Me Ready 
Mix, LLC 
816-525-0570 (P) 
816-525-0411 (F) 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

1% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $2.00 
2% Calcium Charge Per CUYD - $4.00 
Hot Water Charge - $4.50, Short Load Charge - $70.00 
Night Delivery Charge - $400.00 Opening Fee 
Prior to 5:00AM after 6:00PM night charges applies. 
Fuel surcharge - $15.00 per load. 
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http://www.geigerreadymix.com/

