Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation
Commercial Mixes — Bid #KC-B13-004
Price Agreement for Kansas City District
April 1, 2013 through March 31, 2014

Vendor Base Hot Mix BP-1 Hot Mix BP-2 Hot Mix Plant Mix Cold Mix Winter Mix
Apac-Kansas Inc. 49.90 51.00 53.00 53.00 No Bid No Bid
Harrisonville Plant
Apac-Kansas Inc. 46.35 49.00 51.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sugar Creek Plant
C. B. Asphalt, Inc. No Bid 46.75 46.75 46.75 No Bid No Bid
Barber Quarry
Carter-Waters No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 77.00 77.00
Kansas City, MO
Hot Mix Materials, Inc. 46.00 48.75 49.75 49.75 No Bid No Bid
Kansas City, MO
Ideker Inc. 38.00 41.75 42.00 42.00 120.00 120.00
Kansas City, MO
Ideker Inc. 38.00 41.75 42.00 42.00 120.00 120.00
Mosby, MO
Keller Construction 60.00 60.00 No Bid No Bid 85.00 No Bid
St. Joseph, MO
Vance Brothers, Inc. 58.00 54.00 54.00 54.00 79.00 89.00
Kansas City, MO

Specifications
Materials supplied under this price agreement shall comply with the requirements of the 2011 Edition of the Missouri Standard Specifications for Highway

Construction and any revisions thereto. The applicable section number and/or MGS specification is shown below:

*Commercial Base Hot Mix, BP-1 Hot Mix, and BP-2 Hot Mix — Section 401.

*Plant Mix Bituminous Surface Leveling — Section 402.

*Bituminous Stockpile Patching Material (Cold Mix) — MoDOT Specification #MGS-93-07A with Section 1004, Grade 1 modified for the %2" passing 100%
gradation.

*Winter Mix — High Performance cold mix/premium patch material/”all weather” winter patch material (if different material than Cold mix).

Posted on April 6, 2013 at 11:30 AM




