MoDOT Location
Belton

Harrisonville
Pleasant Hill**
Chouteau
Roadsides**
Warrensburg
Warrensburg Striping
Lexington**

Odessa

Platte City

Nashua

Nashua RE Office
Dearborn Rest Area
Richmond
Hughesville**

Low Bid Award

Date and time posted

Nash Gas
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

2.09
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

1.99

1.99

2.05

1.99
No Bid
No Bid

Ferrellgas
1.766
1.766
1.766
1.766
1.766
1.766
1.766
1.766
1.766
1.766
1.766
1.766
1.766
1.766
1.766

: October 11, 2011 at 2:15 PM

Propane Bid Tabulations
RFB KC-B11-006
October 3, 2011 1:00 PM

MFA Oil
1.725
1.725
1.725
1.645
1.725
1.725
1.725
1.645
1.645
1.75
1.75
1.75
1.75
1.645
1.725

Ray-Carroll Fuels
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

1.67
No Bid
1.67
1.67
1.67
1.67
No Bid
1.67
1.67
No Bid
1.67
No Bid

Guier Gas
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1.795
1.795
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
1.795

Amerigas Propane
1.885
1.885
No Bid
1.885
No Bid
1.885
1.885
No Bid
1.885
1.885
1.885
1.885
1.885
1.885
No Bid



