
MISSOURI DEPARTMENT
OF TRANSPORTATION

PLANT MIX OIL MATERIAL
BID TABULATION

RFB B4-09-024
DECEMBER 31, 2009  1:00 PM

GROUP 1 PAY ITEM #1 PAY ITEM #2
CASS - HARRISONVILLE 2500 tons 145 tons Total Amount

HILTY QUARRIES $26.90 $67,250.00 $296.60 $43,007.00 $110,257.00
VANCE BROTHERS $25.85 $64,625.00 $445.00 $64,525.00 $129,150.00

GROUP 2 PAY ITEM #1 PAY ITEM #2
LAFAYETTE - CONCORDIA 2000 tons 116 tons Total Amount

HILTY QUARRIES $30.10 $60,200.00 $302.00 $35,032.00 $95,232.00
VANCE BROTHERS $25.95 $51,900.00 $450.00 $52,200.00 $104,100.00

GROUP 3 PAY ITEM #1 PAY ITEM #2
LAFAYETTE - ODESSA 2000 tons 116 tons Total Amount

HILTY QUARRIES $30.60 $61,200.00 $302.50 $35,090.00 $96,290.00
VANCE BROTHERS $25.80 $51,600.00 $450.00 $52,200.00 $103,800.00

GROUP 4 PAY ITEM #1 PAY ITEM #2
RAY - RICHMOND 2000 tons 116 tons Total Amount

HILTY QUARRIES NO BID NO BID $0.00
VANCE BROTHERS $22.25 $44,500.00 $450.00 $52,200.00 $96,700.00

GROUP 5 PAY ITEM #1 PAY ITEM #2
RAY - MILLVILLE 2000 tons 116 tons Total Amount

HILTY QUARRIES NO BID NO BID $0.00
VANCE BROTHERS $20.95 $41,900.00 $450.00 $52,200.00 $94,100.00

GROUP 6 PAY ITEM #1 PAY ITEM #2
HENRY - CLINTON 2000 tons 116 tons Total Amount

HILTY QUARRIES $27.75 $55,500.00 $299.65 $34,759.40 $90,259.40
VANCE BROTHERS $31.95 $63,900.00 $455.00 $52,780.00 $116,680.00

GROUP 7 PAY ITEM #1 PAY ITEM #2
HENRY - URICH 1500 tons 87 tons Total Amount

HILTY QUARRIES $26.75 $40,125.00 $298.65 $25,982.55 $66,107.55
VANCE BROTHERS $30.60 $45,900.00 $452.00 $39,324.00 $85,224.00

GROUP 8 PAY ITEM #1 PAY ITEM #2
HENRY - WINDSOR 1500 tons 87 tons Total Amount

HILTY QUARRIES $27.90 $41,850.00 $299.80 $26,082.60 $67,932.60
VANCE BROTHERS $32.80 $49,200.00 $452.00 $39,324.00 $88,524.00

GROUP 9 PAY ITEM #1 PAY ITEM #2
JOHNSON - WARRENSBURG 2000 tons 116 tons Total Amount

HILTY QUARRIES $27.55 $55,100.00 $299.45 $34,736.20 $89,836.20
VANCE BROTHERS $31.50 $63,000.00 $452.00 $52,432.00 $115,432.00

LOW BID AWARD
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GROUP 10 PAY ITEM #1 PAY ITEM #2
JOHNSON - HOLDEN 1500 tons 87 tons Total Amount

HILTY QUARRIES $28.70 $43,050.00 $300.60 $26,152.20 $69,202.20
VANCE BROTHERS $33.90 $50,850.00 $452.00 $39,324.00 $90,174.00

GROUP 11 PAY ITEM #1 PAY ITEM #2
JOHNSON - KNOB NOSTER 1500 tons 87 tons Total Amount

HILTY QUARRIES $28.25 $42,375.00 $300.15 $26,113.05 $68,488.05
VANCE BROTHERS $32.80 $49,200.00 $452.00 $39,324.00 $88,524.00

LOW BID AWARD
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