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Thank you for your response to our Request # NE17-14B-R2.  For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses which were received. 

This solicitation was awarded to: McKnight Tire (Group #1) and Froesel Tire (Groups #2, #3, #4, and -#5).  If you have any questions, please contact me. 

Buyer:  William D. “Bill” Noyes, CPPO, CPPB, Senior Procurement Agent                                                     Date/Time of posting:  November 15, 2016 / 8:45 AM 
 

GROUP # 1 GALAXY TIRES 

Qty 
(Each) 

TIRES (tires only – no mounting) Brahlers 
CFI  
Tire 

Cross 
Midwest 

Froesel 
Tire 

Jireh 
McKnight 

Tire 
Miller 
Tire 

Royer 
Tire 

6 

 

17.5 x 25 Galaxy EXR-300 (20-Ply Bias Loader) 650.00 739.05 No Bid 715.50 710.00 654.32 No Bid 696.00 

13 

 

20.5 x 25 Galaxy EXR-300 (24-Ply Bias Loader) 975.00 1064.25 No Bid 1029.95 1007.00 929.22 No Bid 967.00 

 

GROUP #1 – TOTAL ORDER EXTENSION: 16,575.00 18,269.55 No Bid 17,682.35 17,351.00 16,005.78 No Bid 16,747.00 

 

Delivery Time (A.R.O. = After Receipt of Order): 

Not 

Specified 7 Days No Bid 

No 

Specified 1 Week 
2 to 3 

Weeks No Bid 

2 to 3 

Weeks 

GROUP # 2 BRIDGESTONE TRUCK TIRES 

Qty 
(Each) 

TIRES (tires only – no mounting) Brahlers 
CFI  
Tire 

Cross 
Midwest 

Froesel 
Tire 

Jireh 
McKnight 

Tire 

Miller 
Tire 

Royer 
Tire 

38 

 

315/80 R22.5 Bridgestone M860A (Steer 10,000 LBS HT) 580.58 No Bid 600.58 535.50 595.58 581.58 590.50 739.00 

 

GROUP #2 – TOTAL ORDER EXTENSION: 22,062.04 No Bid 22,822.04 20,349.00 22,632.04 22,100.04 22,439.00 28,082.00 

 

Delivery Time (A.R.O. = After Receipt of Order): 

Not 

Specified No Bid 7 Days 
1 to 2 

Weeks 2 Weeks 

2 to 3 

Weeks 

1 to 3 

Weeks 

2 to 3 

Weeks 

GROUP # 3 BRIDGESTONE OTR TIRES 

Qty 
(Each) TIRES (tires only – no mounting) 

Brahlers 
CFI  
Tire 

Cross 
Midwest 

Froesel 
Tire 

Jireh 
McKnight 

Tire 

Miller 
Tire 

Royer 
Tire 

8 

 

14.00 R24 Bridgestone VUT (Radial Grader) 977.50 No Bid 987.50 871.00 982.50 912.50 900.00 1286.00 

4 

 

17.5 R25 Bridgestone VUT (Radial Grader) 1190.99 No Bid 1200.99 1080.75 1195.99 1110.50 1100.00 1412.00 

 

GROUP #3 – TOTAL ORDER EXTENSION: 12,583.96 No Bid 12,703.96 11,291.00 12,643.96 11,742.00 11,600.00 15,936.00 

 

Delivery Time (A.R.O. = After Receipt of Order): 

Not 

Specified No Bid 7 Days 
1 to 2 

Weeks 2 Weeks 

2 to 3 

Weeks 

2 to 3 

Weeks 

2 to 3 

Weeks 

 



 
 

GROUP # 4 FIRESTONE TRUCK TIRES 

Qty 
(Each) 

TIRES (tires only – no mounting) Brahlers 
CFI  
Tire 

Cross 
Midwest 

Froesel 
Tire 

Jireh 
McKnight 

Tire 

Miller 
Tire 

Royer 
Tire 

12 

 

215/75 R17.5 Firestone (Radial Trailer) 212.11 No Bid 266.94 190.50 205.86 199.63 201.00 280.00 

2 

 

225/70 R19.5 Firestone (12-Ply Steer) 208.98 No Bid 218.98 195.50 213.98 209.02 208.98 265.00 

2 

 

245/70 R19.5 Firestone (14-Ply Steer) 226.73 No Bid 236.73 205.50 231.74 226.74 238.00 265.00 

2 

 

425/65 R22.5 Firestone (Steer) 525.51 No Bid 535.51 500.00 530.51 512.76 520.50 600.00 

145 

 

1100 R22.5 Firestone FD663 (14-Ply Drive) 315.36 No Bid 325.36 278.50 320.36 280.00 315.00 388.00 

4 

 

1100 R22.5 Firestone FS561 (14-Ply HT) 295.73 No Bid 305.73 278.00 300.73 293.75 295.00 368.00 

4 

 

1100 R22.5 Firestone FS561 (14-Ply Drive Straight Tread) 295.73 No Bid 351.48 278.00 300.73 293.75 295.00 368.00 

2 

 

1100 R22.5 Firestone FS561 (Steer HT) 295.73 No Bid 305.73 278.00 300.73 293.75 295.00 368.00 

16 

 

225/70 R19.5 Firestone FD690 (12-Ply Drive) 222.99 No Bid 232.99 199.50 227.92 212.00 212.00 260.00 

18 

 

225/70 R19.5 Firestone FS561 (12-Ply Steer) 208.98 No Bid 218.98 195.50 213.98 209.02 208.98 265.00 

 

GROUP #4 – TOTAL ORDER EXTENSION: 60,481.74 No Bid 63,272.70 53,961.50 61,380.64 54,984.46 60,125.60 74,490.00 

 

Delivery Time (A.R.O. = After Receipt of Order): 

Not 

Specified No Bid 10 Days 
1 to 3 

Weeks 2 Weeks 

2 to 3 

Weeks 

2 to 3 

Weeks 

2 to 3 

Weeks 

GROUP # 5 FIRESTONE AG TIRES 

Qty 
(Each) 

TIRES (tires only – no mounting) Brahlers 
CFI  
Tire 

Cross 
Midwest 

Froesel 
Tire 

Jireh 
McKnight 

Tire 

Miller 
Tire 

Royer 
Tire 

3 

 

10.00-16 Firestone (8-Ply 3-Rib Front Tractor) 167.30 228.43 No Bid 151.00 167.30 169.00 159.00 221.00 

2 

 

12.4 x 24 Firestone (8-Ply Bias) 412.76 244.15 No Bid 221.50 412.76 254.22 236.00 631.00 

4 

 

13.6 R28 Firestone (8-Ply Radial Tractor) 795.67 587.30 No Bid 501.50 406.80 602.75 565.00 681.00 

2 

 

18.4 x 34 Firestone (8-Ply Bias) 668.85 659.81 No Bid 491.00 673.85 567.44 528.00 641.00 

2 

 

18.4 x 38 Firestone (8-Ply Bias) 733.57 764.79 No Bid 518.00 738.57 612.93 578.00 660.00 

2 

 

340/85 R28 Firestone (Radial) 795.67 587.30 No Bid 501.50 800.67 602.75 565.00 691.00 

GROUP # 5 FIRESTONE AG TIRES (continued on next page) 



GROUP # 5 FIRESTONE AG TIRES (continued from previous page) 

Qty 
(Each) 

TIRES (tires only – no mounting) Brahlers 
CFI  
Tire 

Cross 
Midwest 

Froesel 
Tire 

Jireh 
McKnight 

Tire 
Miller 
Tire 

Royer 
Tire 

6 

 

380/85 R28 Firestone (Radial Tractor) 1022.57 737.72 No Bid 604.50 953.08 716.77 670.00 800.00 

6 

 

480/80 R38 Firestone All Traction (Radial Tractor) 932.29 977.41 No Bid 863.00 1166.91 994.35 937.00 1071.00 

10 

 

21 L24 Firestone All Traction TL (12-Ply Backhoe) 763.36 773.36 No Bid 679.50 768.36 744.12 757.00 1059.00 

8 

 

12.5/80 x 18 Firestone L3 Super Traction (Bias Backhoe) 249.94 259.94 No Bid 245.00 254.94 250.16 255.00 364.00 

 

GROUP #5 – TOTAL ORDER EXTENSION: 30,268.56 27,650.49 No Bid 23,483.00 29,823.86 26,701.88 25,803.00 33,361.00 

 

Delivery Time (A.R.O. = After Receipt of Order): 

Not 

Specified 7 Days No Bid 
10 Days  

to 2 Weeks 2 Weeks 

2 to 3 

Weeks 

2 to 3 

Weeks 

2 to 3 

Weeks 

 

Notification of the online posting of this solicitation was also sent to MFR Tire, but no response was received from that vendor.  Notification was 

also sent to the State of Missouri Office of Administration’s Office of Equal Opportunity (OA OEO). 
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