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Thank you for your response to our Request # NE17-01B-R2.  For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses received.  This solicitation is a multiple award to the 
low-bidders highlighted below, as compared on an “Item By Item” basis.  If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown above. 

CONTRACT PERIOD JULY 15, 2016 THROUGH MAY 31, 2017        William D. “Bill” Noyes, CPPO, CPPB, Senior Procurement Agent       Posted: July 14, 2016 / 4:00 PM  

 

PROPANE 
All pricing is  
“per gallon” 

Amerigas 
Propane 

Heetco 
MFA Oil 

Phone # and 
Servicing Plant 

Northeast  
MO Coop 

Prairieland FS 
Ray-Carroll 

Fuels 
Service & 

Supply Coop 
Z&Z  

Propane 

 
Edina MT 
 

No Bid 1.09 

0.794 
660-665-3816 

Kirksville 
0.80 0.88 No Bid No Bid 0.89 

 
Lancaster MT 
 

No Bid 1.09 

0.794 
660-457-3781 

Lancaster 
No Bid 0.88 No Bid No Bid 0.89 

 
Macon MT & Complex 
 

1.29 1.09 

0.794 
660-385-3216 

Macon 
0.80 0.88 0.84 No Bid 0.89 

 
Mexico MT 
 

No Bid No Bid 

0.794 
573-581-4444 

Mexico 
No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.10 No Bid 

 
New Cambria MT 
 

No Bid No Bid 

0.794 
660-226-5516 
New Cambria 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 
Palmyra MT 
 

No Bid 1.09 

0.794 
573-769-4225 

Palmyra 
No Bid 0.88 0.84 No Bid No Bid 

 
Queen City Radio Tower 
 

No Bid 1.25 

0.794 
660-457-3781 

Lancaster 
No Bid 0.88 No Bid No Bid 0.89 

 
Troy MT 
 

1.29 No Bid 

0.794 
636-462-2427 

Troy 
No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.10 No Bid 

 
Troy Project Office 
 

1.29 No Bid 

0.794 
636-462-2427 

Troy 
No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.10 No Bid 

 
Hannibal Complex 
 

No Bid 1.25 

0.794 
573-769-4225 

Palmyra 
No Bid 0.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 

No response was received from Ferrellgas or Mansfield Oil.  Notification was also sent to the Missouri Office of Administration’s Office of Equal Opportunity (OA OEO). 


