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Thank you for your response to our Request # NE17-09B-R2.  For your information, the following is a tabulation of all responses received. 

This solicitation was awarded to the four vendors indicated below (a “Line Item By Line Item” award).  If you have any questions, please contact me. 

Buyer: William D. “Bill” Noyes, CPPO, CPPB, Senior Procurement Agent                   Date/Time of posting:  September 29, 2016 / 5:00 PM   

Qty U/M 

Hauling Cinders 

(Eco-Sand)  

from the Labadie 

Power Plant to: 

Beelman 

Logistics 

Bisges 

Trucking 

Bobby 

Hoelscher 

Trucking 

Hall 

Hauling 

Leo 

O’Laughlin 

Lomax 

Trucking 

Service 

LWK 

Trucking 

Tri-County 

Trucking & 

Excavating 

Beelman 

Logistics 
 

*Alternate Bid – 

All or Nothing* 

LWK 

Trucking 
 

*Alternate Bid – 

All or Nothing* 

1500 Tons New Florence 
9.35 

14025.00 
No Bid 

7.75 

11625.00 

13.00 

19500.00 
No Bid No Bid 

17.00 

25500.00 

7.85 

11775.00 

9.35 

14025.00 

11.50 

17250.00 

500 Tons Warrenton 
7.05 

3525.00 
No Bid 

5.45 

2725.00 

11.75 

5875.00 
No Bid No Bid 

14.00 

7000.00 

6.50 

3250.00 

7.05 

3525.00 

10.85 

5425.00 

500 Tons Elsberry 
11.15 

5575.00 
No Bid 

9.90 

4950.00 
9.55 

4775.00 
No Bid No Bid 

18.00 

9000.00 
No Bid 

11.15 

5575.00 

12.45 

6225.00 

1000 Tons Troy 
7.65 

7650.00 
No Bid 

7.75 

7750.00 

8.70 

8700.00 
No Bid No Bid 

18.00 

18000.00 
No Bid 

7.65 

7650.00 

12.45 

12450.00 

2500 Tons Mexico 
13.85 

34625.00 
No Bid 

12.50 

31250.00 

16.80 

42000.00 
No Bid No Bid 

21.00 

52500.00 
No Bid 

13.85 

34625.00 

16.50 

41250.00 

2000 Tons Paris 
16.85 

33700.00 
No Bid 

15.25 

30500.00 

20.00 

40000.00 
No Bid No Bid 

25.00 

50000.00 
No Bid 

16.85 

33700.00 

19.00 

38000.00 

1500 Tons Moberly 
17.85 

26775.00 

18.45 

27675.00 
17.25 

25875.00 

21.92 

32880.00 
No Bid No Bid 

29.00 

43500.00 
No Bid 

17.85 

26775.00 

21.00 

31500.00 

1500 Tons Macon 
20.65 

30975.00 

21.75 

32625.00 

20.40 

30600.00 

27.37 

41055.00 

29.84 

44760.00 
19.41 

29115.00 

31.00 

46500.00 
No Bid 

20.65 

30975.00 

22.50 

33750.00 

1000 Tons New Cambria 
21.95 

21950.00 

23.50 

23500.00 

21.90 

21900.00 

28.16 

28160.00 

32.30 

32300.00 
21.36 

21360.00 

33.00 

33000.00 
No Bid 

21.95 

21950.00 

23.25 

23250.00 

TOTAL COST: $164,875.00    (for the items indicated above) $175,800.00 $209,100.00 
 

Boone Construction Company (MBE vendor) and Richard J. Mertens, Inc. each submitted a “No Bid” response.  Notification of the online posting of this 

solicitation was also sent to AJ’s Trucking (WBE vendor), Bevill Farms Trucking, Cherokee Kid Hauling (MBE vendor), DLH Trucking (DBE/WBE vendor), 

George C. Potterfield Trucking, Harris Hauling & Supply (MBE/DBE vendor), Hinton Hauling, JLAC Construction Services, Joshua L. Potterfield Trucking, 

M&M Trucking, Mutter Farms, Porky Joerling Trucking, Rainbow Connection (MBE/WBE vendor), Ren Potterfield Trucking, Shinn Construction, S-S-S (Wayne 

B. Smith), Wesco Hauling & Contracting (WBE vendor), and Westfall Hauling (MBE vendor), but no responses were received from these vendors.  Notification 

was also sent to the State of Missouri Office of Administration’s Office of Equal Opportunity (OA OEO). 


