TABULATION OF BID
DATE POSTED: June 10, 2014 TIME: 02:00 PM

NW-14-135 Propane

MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
NORTHWEST OFFICE
ST. JOSEPH, MISSOURI

Contract Period June 15, 2014 — May 31, 2015

County Ferrellgas Consumers QOil MFA Oil
Andrew 1.469 1.4289 1.532
Atchison No Bid 1.4389 1.532
Buchanan 1.469 No Bid 1.554
Caldwell 1.469 No Bid 1.89
Clinton 1.469 No Bid 1.559
Daviess 1.469 No Bid 1.544
Dekalb 1.469 No Bid 1.544
Gentry 1.469 1.4389 1.532
Grundy 1.469 No Bid 1.544
Harrison 1.469 No Bid 1.554
Livingston No Bid No Bid 1.89
Mercer 1.469 No Bid 1.554
Nodaway No Bid 1.4289 1.532
Sullivan 1.469 No Bid 1.89

Represents Low Bid

If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown below.

Buyer: Brenda Christie

Address:

Missouri Department of Transportation
3602 N. Belt Highway

St. Joseph, Missouri, 64506-1399
Phone: 816-387-2430



